
Ignorance is Jess remote from
the truth than prejudice.

-Denis Diderot m4~Nnrt4uill~ £~rnr(l
/

The Second Oldest
Newspaper in
Wayne County

Established in
1868

Volume 85, Number 18, 14 Pages 7c Per Copy, $2.50 Per Year In Advance

SEE 83
Northville,. Michigan, Thursday, September 29, 1955

JUMP IN STUDENTS BY 1965

dIstrict is 1307.
The foregomg Hgures were pre-

sented in part to the CItizens'
School Study Group last Wed-
nesday evening by Robert Shafer,
chairman of the group's sub-com-
mittee on, ;populatIOn trends.
Other members of the sub·com-
mittee are Buryl Baskins, Eural
Clark (school board member),
and Ed Angove. Supermtendent
Amerman has met with the sub-
commibte in an ex-offIcio capa-
city. -

Foresee 2400 Students
Shafer presented the sub-com-

mittee's report as a ".prelIminary"
forecast, subject to reVIsion when
necessary. He talked only about
an "estlmated probable increase"
of 83%, to 2400 students in the
present district. He emphasized,
however, that the committee had
probably been ultra-conservative.

The "estimated maximum pos-
sible" increase of approximately More Children On Farms
140% was develo;ped by the Areas 6 and 7, which aTe
Northville Record by applying strictly farming districts, WIll not
the same formula to the sub- build up to any sizable extent
committee's basic forecast of new during t'he coming 10 years, but
dwellings in the area within 10 the committee foresees two child-
years that Sha'fer used in esti- ren per dwelling in these areas.
mating the ",probable'! mcrease Area 2, whIch includes Oak-
of 83%. The 140% increase-,would wood subdivision and other parts
mean 3100 pupils fl'om the pres- of Northville north of Main St.,
en~ district. IS also-seen as a growing area,_____________________________ ., wibh a maximum of 450 new
• Divide DiStrict In Eight Areas clwEnJings an'd a probable 250.

To prepare its school popula- Area 1, which is the southern
tion forecast the committee broke half of the city, is seen as al-
down the present school district ready virtually built up. The com-
into eight separate areas that ap- mittee feels that borh the prob-
pear to be of a homogeneous nat- able and the maximum number-
ure ,and then attempted to fore- of new dwellings in this area will
cast the probable growth in the be only 50 during the coming 10·
number of dwellings in each area years. The reason, Shafer saId, is
over the coming 10 years. In ado' that there are only a few vacant
'dition, the committee attempted bUIlding lots available.
to arrive at an estimate of the Shafer's committee ha~ madE!'
number of children per home in 110 attempt to forecast the in-
each of these areas. crease in population of the vari-

Waterford Area To Grow ous districts compflsing the Novi
Figures in the table below and area.

Northville S~hool District Population Forecast

""-., .-
'9. :r-HLE''Rp~.

"

, By Glenn H. Cummings
Should the North;'ille' and,Novi seha-ol districts unite as aIle

large school distrIct serving the two communities !IDd work out a
common educational program on a long range basIS?

Or would it ,be better for each community to go it alone, .with
Northville ex>panding its school system sufficiently to take N.OVIpu-
pils on a tuition basis until Novi grows enough to support Its own
schOOl system from kindergarten through high school?
. These questions are a matter of grave ~oncern to th?u:ght~l
citizens in each community? ConversatIOns WIth school O£fICI~ls m
both places lead to lihe inescapable conclusion that both Novl an,d
Northville would prefer to operate independen~ly of each other 'If
it IS fin'ancially feasible to do so._ However, rt IS equ~lly true that
neither' community is'as fully informed on the fl~anclal aspects of
operating separately or together a? they should be If. they ~re to vote
of the matter .of NorthVIlle annexmg the three NOVI dIstrIcts, as the
latter-requested last June.

'Dhe Northville district is in the unenv;iable position. of being .al-
most 100% residential, wlth the addItional disadvantage of havl;Ilg
5everal tax free mstitutions owning large areas of land. These.In-
clude the House of Correction, the ,MIchigan State hospItal, ~a~burY
SanatorIum and the Wayne County 'Draming school. ~ust. wlthm ltS
present boundaries it faces a growth in school population m the next
10 years ranging-from a "probable" 83% to a '\possible", 140%.
• (The 83% figure was presented to the Citizens' ~chOoI Study
Group last Wednesday evening by Robert Shafer, ohall'Illan of the
group's sub-commitotee on PO'PulatJon trends .. It would mean 1~82
elementary and 101'2 junior and senior hIgh stude?ts by 1965 hvmg
in the present Northville district alone, S!Jafer sald ..No one knows
how many tuition pupils may be atte~dmg NorthVllle schools- 10
years hence.) See story elsewhere on thIS page.

Shafer's population forecast, which he said is conservative, did
not attempt to cover Novi's pOSSIble growrth. ,

The Novi situation is complicated now by Ford's annoull<;ed i?-
tention of locating its Lmcoln diVIsion ,plant and genera~ offI~es III
Novi township at the corner of WIxom Rd. and Grand. RIver, Just a
few liundrec:lfeet outside the western bound~ry.of N?VI N~. 8 School
District The Walled Lake Consolidate~ DIStnct ~vIll gam a large
addition to its ta~ roll from .the 'Plant, while the.Novl !in<l other school
districts will get a big boost in school populatIOn Without an.y com-
;parable increase in their tax base to help suppol't theIr schools.

Nevertheless, Novi is hoping that lightning may strike twice in
the tOTnshiu witb some oj:her large mdustry or several smallel (me"
f !J Wl &~~ eX!altple.owhiC'h Ford has set. Snoul?- thl.; j,~p...cI.;·No\~

- -~ogld.BJe well able ;to"sUopport a school system-w~thol.lt bem~)tnnex-I ------~-------------------

cd to Northville. !' Z • CrL P d M t ' L
/_ - Northville, on&e other ~and,..has hitle cl~ji~ce of ever 'get.ti?,g onlng '/;langes ropose US angs eague

- any large scale irldustrial development. Whlle/lts school authonhes Opener Is WI-th
are admittedly only luke~warm to joining up with Novi a~ the pr~
ent time, they also are aware that Novi may strIk~ the. Jack-pot It
hopes for Should this prove to be the ease sometime In the neXit M-'f d F -d
few years', and should NorNlNille now turn ~~umbs> d'Own on annex- I or rl ay
ing the Novi dIstricts, the.y know the decISIon mJght be one to be
regretted for many years.

Thus both the Northville and the Novi distncts are at a cross-
road and'must decIde in the not too distant £uture whether to g?
down one road together or to take ~eparate roads.

Northville and Novi SC'hool
Districts' Facing Similar
Population Growth Problems

".. ~\REA <\ • '55/ ':G5 '.

__ • El~m. 60 '97 f}

........ H.S 35 ?Sf
•. "it .-it-•••• -.'

• AREA 3 ·S~ '65

:' El~m. I 45 3411

H.§.~ 20 2:13"iiir~~~· -,.;,••I, ,

'55- '65- ,
101 155

41 /. ~~.•

New City Charter
Drawn; Expect
Early Election

A public hearing on proposed jngs, roaming houses, tourist,
changes to the Northville town- hospltals, rest homes, etc.-WIll
ship zoning ordinance WIll be held 'henceforth be permitted only m
by the zoning board Tuesday, general commerCial districts if
Oct. 11 at 8 p.m. in the NorthvIlle the amendment is adopted by the

Final details of the proposed LIbrary Bldg. townshIp board. Following their second straight
City of Northville charter were One proposed ohange provides A proposal to rezone approxi- loss of the season, the NorthVille
ironed out at a special meeting of that aU lots must be served by a mately 56 acres of land owned Mustangs WIll open Wayne-Oak-
the Oharter Commission Tuesday -municipal sewer system or an ap- by Gerald F. Taft from an R-I-E land county league play with
evening and a special election to proved disposal system accepta- (country estates) classrfJcatlOn to l\hlford at Ford Field tomorrow
ratify it is planned for Novem- ble ot the Wayne County Board R-1 (one-family) reSIdences WIll night. Milford; winner over Ox-
bel' or early December. of Health. This provision, it is also be considered ford in their opemng game, was

DeterminatIon of the exact date believed, will strengthen the defeated last Friday by the pre-
awaIts a ruling by the state at- township'S authOrIty to deal with season league favonte, Clarence- Ij--------------- ---,
torney general's office on wheth- bUllders and subdiVIders working St~ Mary Hospital ville With their entire baclmeld

" er It IS legal to hold a special with small Size lots. It is prlmari- Doctors Meeting ~xperienced veterans of last sea-
election in the city to vote on ly de~igned as an added safe- sc'n MIlford will bring to North-
annexmg the ~roposed Yerkes guard to health. Called for Oct. 6 Ville a fast, aggressive ball club.
~ubdivislOn. City AHorney Philip Another change will limit con- This game is a must for the Mus-
OgIlVIe expects the attorney gen- struction in two-family distrIcts An open meeting for physicians tr..ngs If their season IS to be suc-
eral's ruhng WIthin a few days. to single and two-famIly dwell- interesteU in the S1. Mary hospi- cessfuI. Howe vel', after two

If the attorney general rules in ings. Other structures that have tal will be held at the Fehcian Istraight defeats, Northville must
favor of a special election in the been permItted in two-family dis- Sisters Convent at 7:30 p.m. on be considered the under dcrg in
Yerk.es subdiviSIOn situation, th~t tricts In the past-terrace d\\ ell- Oct. 6. Ithis contest.
electIOn an~ the charter vote WIll Last Fnday evening the Mus-
be held SImultaneously. Other- J L h S . A N I A· C d tangs lost a defensive struggle to
wise, the ch.arter election will be ames ap. am worn In s ava lr a et I Howell high school 7 to O.A first
held alone In a few weeks. qual tel' Northville pass, inter-

The Charter Commi~slOn plans Icepted by R. Smith, a Howell
to release a summary of the pro- linebacker, was returned 42 yards
posed charter for publication in for the only touchdown of the
a few days. This will be followed game. Good punting by McMack-
by advertisement of the entire !en of Howell and Bell of North-
charter and a public meetmg at VIlle kept each team in their own
WhlCh members of the Charter I tern tory throughout the evening
CommIssion will explain the var- Howell's only other touchdown

Jl 10US provisions and answer such dlive came m the second quarter
questions as voters may submit I when they reached the Nol'thvilJe

! III \vriting. I 14..yard line but a 15..yard penalty
The charter election will also I ,et them back for good.

be- the occasion for electmg an
entIre new slate of cIty officials, The fmal period of the game
Including a mayor, fOUL'com mis- I found the Mustangs showing their
slOners and a justlce of the peace. first signs of any offense all year

A good passing attack sparked a
drive that was halted by a pass J'-----------------------------!
Interception on the Howell 20-
yard line. During this drive some
blIl!lant pass receivmg by Dave
BIery and Bill Yahne rolled up
four first downs for the Mustangs.

Howell failed to cross the 50-
until t'he final minute of play.
This is a tribute to the defensive
play of the Northville team who
Made fewer mllltakes than they
dId the preceding week when they
were swamped under by Ply-
mouth. However, a football team
must score to win games and un-
less there is more fh'e and de-
termination in their blocking and
running the opponent's goal line
will remain untouohed by the
Mustangs.

Herbert Harndens Wed Fifty Years

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Harnden,
115 Chllrch St., will celebrate
their 50th wedding anniversary
with a reception at the Veterans'
Memorial hall Friday at 8 p.m.

ThE' Harnclens are well known
residen.ts of Northville, having
owned and managed the Harnden
Paint and Glass Co, on Church
St. for the past nine y~ars.

Mrs. Harnden was born in De-
troit and her husband was born
in Ionia. T,hey were marned in
Detroit in 1905 and have one
daughter, Mrs. M. R. Comer who
resides on Novi Rd. Lou Ann Co-
mer is the Harnden's only grand-
child.

Before settling in Northville,
the Harndens lived in Cincinatti,
Philadelphia, New Orleans, Nash-
ville, Tenn. and Clevelancl.

Northville School District
Growth May Exceed 140%

The Northville Board of Education and the Citizen's
School Study Group are actively considering way§ and
means of coping with an increase in the number of child-
ren of school age in the present Northville School District
that may run between 83% and 140%.

This would mean somewhere between 2400 and 3100

Ipupils from the present Northville District in attendance
at Northville schools. Theil' present enrollment from thjs

Northville Rents
Street Sweeper

'Dhe Northville City Commis-
sion voted at a special meeting
this week to lease a street sweep-
er from vhe Telford Equi.pment
Co., Detroit, for $300 per month,
with the privilege of having the

rental fee apply on the purchase
price of $9,995 if the machine
proves satisfactory. Commission
members anticipate that the ma-
ohine will easily save the amount
of the rental fee each month and
if this proves to be the case the
commission ,probably will vote to
buy the machine next spring. The
present rental agreement is for a
minimum of three and a maxi-
mum of nine months.

\ '

on the map reveal some inter-
esting growth trends forecast by
the committee's report. One is a
lal'ge jump in population m Area
3 (see map), generally known as
the Waterford! area and bounded
by Northville Rd. on the west,
Haggerty on the east, Flve Mile
on the south and Six Mile on the
norrh For this area, which it is
ex;peeted will be subdivided into
small lots, the subcommittee sees
a maXlllmm mcrease of 600 homes
and a probable increase of 350
homes by 1965. Using the ''prob-
able" figure, it comes up with a
forecast of 348 elementary pupils
agamst 45 now and 203 high
school pupils against the present
20. The committe estimated that
there will be two children in this
area per dwelling.

/

,
, J

Children Receive
First Toxoid Shots
On October 5th

Miss Ruth Knapp, RN, announc-
es that dates 'have been set for
the three toxoid shots to be given
school children: Oct. 5, Oct. 26
and Nov. 16. Children who have
already had the three shots may
receive a booster shot at this
time. Booster shots are given
every three years.

Ohildren S'hould appear at the
elementary school at 9 a.m. on
the dates specified and,local doc-
tors, will be there with registered
nurses and mothers assisting.

Notices are being sent out this
week, Miss Knapp said, and par-
ents are urged to sign and return
them before Oct. 5 as no shots
will be given unless eacl1 child
has returned the notice to Miss
Knapp signed by a parent.

-Official United Slates Navy Photograph

A group of young men take the oath of <allegiance :Which starts them
off on caners in Naval Aviation. Lieutenant William H. Mayo
administered the oath Sept. 14. at the U.S. (Naval Air' Station,
Columbus. 0.. to Naval Aviation Cadet James M. Lapham (left).
835 W. Main St.. who offended Tri·Stafe College. Angola. Ind.
Other boy,; are Thomas Koehler and Harry B. Walters. Dayton. O.

Madigan Goes To Taipei
A/3C Michael Madigan, son of

Mr. and Mrs. William Madigan of
E. Eight Mile Rd. was transferred
recently to Taipei, Formosa from
the 8Mtih Hdqt. SquadTon, Hunter
Air Base, Savannah, Ga. -where
he ex,peets to remain for a year.

\ • l~ ,..., '1 I!", I It t ,I ......( : .1 .}. ..l~~ t I. r~ , ...... " ~

FORECAST OF NEW DWELLINGS IN DISTRICT
BY 1965

The following table was presented as a forecast of the
number of new dwe1lings that will be constructed in the pres-
ent N?rthvIlle School ~Istnct during the coming 10 years. The
commIttee has also estImated, based upon its present knowl-
edoge of subdlViding plans III various areas, how many chIldren
there will be ,per dwelling in each of the eight areas into
which the distrIct has been arbitrarily diVIded. By multiplying
the "guessmate" of the number of children per J1amily by the
prospective number of new dwellings, and subtracting the
probable number of children who WIll be under five years of
age, It arri\'ed at the prOJected "probable" increase of 2400 in
t'he number of school pupils. Using the committee's estImate
of the maJo.lmum number of new dwellings and the number of
children per dwelling, the Record arrived at its maximum
fIgure of 3100 pupils.

New Dwellings
Estimated Estimated Estimated Estimafed No.
Minimum Maximum Probable Children Per

Area 1 ....... 25
Dwelling

50 50 1
Area 2 ...... 100 450 250 1
Awa 3 ...... 1-50 600 350 2

.
Area 4 40 100 65 15
Area 5 ...... 100 300 150 1
Area 6 ...... 10 50 25 2
Area 7 ••• 00. 4 20 10 2
Chapman eo •• 50 300 150 1

anniversary convention immedi-
ately following in Chicago. He
outlined the organization's plans
and objectives for the next 50
years.

Food, clothing, bmlding mater-
ials, toys, appliances and tires
are just a few of the items that
will be available at the rummage
oole, Westenfield said.

A piano has been donated by
one of the members, Al Jones,
while another member, piano
technician George Lockhart, has
volunteered his services in tun-
ing and reconditioning the piano
for any prospective buyer. This,
Westerfield said, is just one of
the many bargains available at
the Friday and Saturday sale.

A lunch counter will be set up
on the grounds and there will be
plenty of free parking space. '

Any last minute donations of
saleable items, large or small,
may be made by calling 1405-J2
or 1I23-M Westerfield said.

Friday, Saturday
Set for Rotary's
Rummage Safe

Plans for their annual rummage
sale and a talk by Rotary's new
district governor, Fred Rollins,
Jr., highlighted the Northville
Rotary,club's Tuesday meeting.

The rummage sale, .which is
being held beneath the grand-
stands at Northville Downs, will
last two days, Sept. 30 and Oct. 1.
The sale will continue from 9
a.m. until 9 p.m. each day, ac-
cording to Wally Westerfield,
chairman,

Rollins, the new district gov-
ernor for the 39 Rotary clubs in
this area, spoke of his experiences
at the governors' conference at
Lake Placid N.Y. and the 50th



r '....-- ":...1" - __ .... _J.. ...

The flower garden of the bride-
groom's parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Nohle Dahlager, 839 Grace St.,
formed the settmg for the wed-
ding of Hester Jeannme Tidwell
and Stanley James Dahlager at
two in the afternoon Sept. 3.

Hester, the daughter of Mr. and
IMrs. James David TIdwell of 589
Starkweather Ave., Plymouth,
wore a chapel length gown of il-
lusion tulle over taffeta. The bod-
ice featured a victorian neckline
and was trunmed with chantllly
lace and seed pearls. Her French
imported headpiece secured a
fingertIp veIl. Stephanotis, ivy
and a whIte orohid formed her
bouquet.

The bride was given in mar-
riage by her father. Rev. David
L. Rieder of the First Baptist
-church in Plymouth read the
marnage servIce.

Louvmia Ann Tidwell was the
maid of honor and was gowned
in a maize yellow ballerina-'length
frock of chiffun over taffeta with
picture hat of tulle and ribbon.
She carned Fuji mums o! yellow,
gold and amber with hanging ivy.
Bridesmaids were Jean McAllist-
er, Jane Lane, Norma Burnette
and Shelvie Bizwell, and all wore
identical ballerina-length gowns
of chiffon over taffeta wlth
matching picture hats. Two gowns
were in avocado green and two
in honey beige. All attendants
carried cascade bouquets of FUJi
mums with ivy.

NEW
SHOES

MONDAY NIGHT!

Just fill in the coupon below, clip it, alld bring it to
our store next Monday night, Oct. 3, between 6-9
p.m ..•. and you may be the lucky winner of a pair
of new shoes - men's, women's, or childrens!

REMEMBER-You must bring the coupon to our store
between 6:00·9:00 p.m. ONLY, on MONDAY,

OCTOBER 3
NO PURCHASE NECESSARY

--1
I
I
I

_I

1--------
I Name ..................................•..••

Street , ..

I
I
L

City Phone .........•

Is Monday night sh0l>ping helpful to you?

DYes 0 No

YOU NEED NOT BE PRESENT TO WIN

"YOUR FAMILY SHOE STORE"
290 S. MAIN ST. PLYMOUTH PHONE 456

L •.L

Showers Honor
Bride- To-Be

Brown-Dayton
Wedding Set
for October

Elementary School
Hours Changed To
Lighten 8us load

Woman's Club To
Hold Luncheon
Meeting Oct. 7

The Northville Woman's club
will hold a luncheon at the Oak-
land HIlls Country club Oct. 7
t~ start its fall serIes of meetings.
Guest speaker for the occasion
will be Howard Hallas, director
of Public Relations for American
Motors Corp.

Hallas IS both -an excellent
speaker and- a public relations
man of high stlandmg in Detroit,
Where he served J.ast year as
president of the Detroit chapter,
Public Relations Society of Am-
erica. He was closely associated
with the financing of U. of M.'s
Phoenix project, and especially
WIth the corporate gifts portion
of the fund raising campaign.

The luncheon' meeting of the
Woman's clUb is traditionally the
bIg event of the year and is the
occasion on which many members
bring guests.
,

Morse Champion
At Edgewood Club

Bob Morse of Brader's Deipt.
store, won the dub championship
of Edgewood Country club Thurs-
day, Sept. 22.

It was an exciting maloh all
the way. Bob had his opponent
three down at the end of 18 holes,
but he had putter trouble on the
next nine holes and they were
all even at the end of 27 holes.

But, Bob, grand competitor
that he is, bounced back to take
his apponent on the fma1 nine
holes and won four and three for
the 36 holes.

Now showing through Friday - Jack Hankins - Joan Collins
"LAND OF THE PHARAOHS" (Cinemascope, Color) Shows '1·9

Saturday Only - Dennis Morgan - Virginia Mayo in
"PEARL OF THE SOUTH PACIFIC" (Superscope .and Color)
Shows 3·5·'1·9

Sun.. Mon.. Tues. - Marilyn Monroe - Tom Ewell in
"SEVEN YEAR ITCH" (Cinemascope and Color)

Shows Sun. 3·5·7·9 Mon" Tues. '1-9

Starts Wednesday, Oct. 5-"WE'RE NO ANGELS"

r--------I "

DON'T MISS
George Clark Hardware Co.

FALL SALE
STARTS FRIDAY ENDS WEEK FROM SAT. NilE

WATCH FOR OUR FALL CIRCULAR IN THEMAIL

News AlfJund NfJlthvlYle
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Collins and

three children will move to 370
Park View Dr., Plymouth, on
Thursday. They formerly resided
at 776 N. Center in Northville.• • •

Mrs. Mark Gardner and Mrs.
J'Ohn Burkman attended the Piety
Hill antique show in Birmingham
Wednesday. -• • •

SHORTS

2-Thursday, September 29,. 1955-THE NORTHVILLE RECORD
f'#o,.,.. ...... ,.,..,.,......,..,.,......,..,.,....,...,r-H..,..,.,.. ......,.,....".,.,....".....,..,.,......,..,.,......,..r-H_NH1 Salem corresp 0ndent, Mrs. Carle-

<ton Hardesty, reports.
On Sunday, Sept. 18 there were

160 in attendance, or seven more
than the previous record of 153
established approximately a year
ago. Last Sunday, Sept. 25, which
was Parents Day and Rally Day,
Sunday School attendance mount-
to 202 and there were 163 ~resent
at the morning worship service. Mr. and Mrs. Richard Earehart

The ohurch has established a spent last week end at Rifle lake
building fund for the purpose of with Mrs. Earehart's parents, Mr.
installing bathrooms, improving and Mrs. Elmer DeKay.
Sunday School facilities, and any • • •
other future improvements found Russell Amerman, Eural Clark
to be necessary. A goal of $1000 and Mrs. Harry F. Wagenschutz
has been set, to be reached' by attended the dinner meeting of
Dec. 1. Funds will be raised for the Wayne County Board of Ed-
this project only through the of- . ucation in Wayne Monday night.
feriogs of those who see the need • • •
and have a desire to have a paJ.'lt Cliff Hill is a patient in Mt.
in it. Sinai hospital in Detroit suffer-

The last Sunday of every iJl'g from an infected arm.month has been declared Build-I ~ -.;; iiiiiiiiiiii_iiiiiiiiiiii_iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii~
ing Fund Sunday, at which ser-
vice a special oLfering will be
taken for this PUl'IPOSe.On Sun-
day, Sept. 25, the first Building
Fund Sunday, this special offer-
ing totaled $216. The church ex-
tends a cordial invitation to all
in our area who would lIke to
,worship at its services.

The art study grOUl' of the
American Assn. of University
Women, Plymouth branch, met at
the home of Mrs. William Bock
Thursday to discuss plans for the
Christmas program which will be
presented at tlhe general Decem-
ber meeting. Refreshments were
served by the h~ess after the
diSCUSSion.

Don't forget ~he free chest x-
ray will be Oct. 31' at the Salem
Fire hall from 2 to 8 p.m.

Salem Federated
Church Sets New
Sunday School Mark,

New Sunday School attendan-ce
records have been set at V"IeSal-
em Federated church on each 0.E
the past two Sundays and inter-
est continues to run high, our

Mr. and Mrs. George McCollum, 45700 Eleven Mile Rd" spent part
of their vacation at Sun Valley while on a 'western trip this month.
They returned home Sept. 19 and George is now back at his job
behind the prescription counler at GunseU's d1:ug store.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Wagen-
schutz and Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Bloom are leaving this week for
their annual hunting trip. They
will S'Pend one week at the Wag-
enschutz cottage at Rifle lake and
the second week at the Bloom
-cottage on St. Joseph's island,
Ontario.

I'

i

I.,
,

I,

"Ii

'.

I,,
I..

I
I
I
i
I
1
I

\
I

I

Sometimes the fellow who says
~e's' satisfied with married life
really means that he's had all he
wants of it.

-PLYMOUTH-PENN THEATRE
-AIR CONDITIONED-

Wednesday, Thursday, September 28 and 29
CinemaScope - with Stereophonic Sound

WALT DISNEY'S

"LADY AND THE TRAMP"
(Technicolor)

The Disney touch was never' happier than this full-length
cartoon masterpiece.

Plus - Disney's "SWITZERLAND"

Friday, Saturday, September 3D, October 1
CinemaScope with Stereophonic Sound
ANN BLYTH - EDMUND PURDOM

DAVID NIVEN - GEORGE SANDERS

"THE KING'S THIEF"
NEWS

(Eastman Color)
Swashbuckling adventure.

Saturday Matinee - Octdher 1

"THE WAR OF THE WORLDS"
(Technicolor)

The Martians are here with thrill a minute action.
PLUS 5 CARTOONS

Showings at 3:00-5:00

Sunday, Monday, Tuesday, October 2-3-4
CinemaS cope with Stereophonic Sound
BETTE DAVIS - RICHARD TODD

HERBERT MARSHALL .:-. JOAN COLLINS
-in-

"THE VIRGIN QUEEN"
. (Deluxe Color)

Bette Davis in a magnificent performance as Queen Elizabeth 1.
News and Shorts Sunday Showings 3-5-7-9

Wednesday, Thursday, Friday, SaturdlaY, October 5-6-7-8
'~" .' ",I' ,. _ CINEMAS,COPti: __ ,•. ),1,

JACK WEBB - JANET LEIGH
-in-

"PETE KELLY'S BLUES"

A FEW OF J'HE SPECIALS
Extra Special REVERE WARE 20~F

-BROOM RAKE NIGHT LATCH CAULKING TUBE
Regular $1.09 Regular $2.25 Regular 46c

79c 1.69 35c
RUBBISH BURNER

Regular $2.09

1.69
FOOTBALL

Special

2.88
PAINT ROLLER & PAN

Regular $1.79 Value,

98c
SAVINGS IN •.• PLUMBING SUPPLIES -TOOLS· HOUSEWARES· GARDEN
SUPPLIES - ELECTRICAL. SPORTING EQUIP •• BUILDERS' HARDWARE.
CLEANING SUPPLIES

( L A R K' 5 BEAUTIFUL WALLPAPER
QUALITY PAINTS
SERV-SELF HARDWARE

WHERE YOUR DOLLAR BUYS QUALITY. MERCHANDISE
107·109 N. Center St. Phone 370 Northville, Mich.

. ' . '



- , .

Gail Matzen to Wed in Novemberl~l Delores ,Teshka
Elected Rainbow
Worthy Advisor

I Mrs. H. Handor! was hostess
for a hilarious "Come-as-you-
are" tea Saturday afternoon at
her home on Wing Ct.

Her guests arrived in all sorts
of attire. Several were barefoot-
ed or in stocking feet, others were
dressed in shorts, slacks, pajamas
and slips. Pin curls were in evi-

K· 'D' h dence as well as heads wrappedlng s aug ters in towels and scarves. A few of
Plan Two Events the guests maintained their atti-

The King's Daughters will open tude of respect for a tea by wear-
their fall season with a "Fall ing hats and white gloves with
Spread" meeting Oct. 18 at the ~heir shorts or slacks.

home of Mrs. Oharles Conklin, 1;===:;;;==;:=================:..321 N. Center.
Luncheon will be served at

1,2:30 and. members are requested
to bring a passing dish and table
service.

On Oct. 27, Mrs. Williwn B.
Walker, Jr. of Happy Acres Farm
on E. Eight· Mile Rd., will open
her home to the King's Daughter's
benefit card party. Dessert will
be served at 12:30 with card games
and table prizes following.

Tickets for the aHair are $1.50
and reservations may be made by
calling Mrs. Paul Beard, 2874.

Mrs. Hugh S. Godfrey will pre-
side at the Oct. 4 meeting of the
Mothers' clUb of Our Lady of Vic-
tory school.

The meeting beginning at 8
p.m. will be held at the home of
Mrs. Joseoph J. Gill, 18855 Hag-
gerty Rd. Arrangements will be
handled by Mrs. Robert T. Flat-
tery, Jr., Mrs. Roy Flavin, Mrs. r
Herman Hartner, Jr., Mrs. RObert,

Shop Here & Save Money
Watch & Jewelry

Repair
• Engraving
• Diamonds Remounted
• Electric Shavers Repaired

• Ring Sizing • Ronson LigMen Repaired
• Zenith HelU'ing Aids and BaUeries for all makes

Mr. and Mrs. Facknitz and two
older children, Ann and Mark,
flew to Philadelphia Wednesday
for a few days visit thl:!re and in
New York City.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. Andy 011phan reo

turned tills week from a trip
Ithrough the Upper Peninsula
where they visited the Porcupine
mountains. They reported the fall
colorin'gs in the forests were at
their best around Marquette and
Negaunee and are hoping theIr
colored movies will be successful.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. WJlliam B. Petz

of 40125 Stoneleigh, announce the
arrival of Jennifer, born Sept. 21
at Beyer Memorial hospital in
Ypsilanti. The baby weighed' five
pounds, eight ounces and she has
two sisters and two brothers.

>10 '" •

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Kirkey
and son, Jimmy, visited the Em-
erson Ruttans Sunday. The Kir-
keys, who resided at 872 Car-
penter, moved to Lansmg last
July.

Gail Matzen

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Matzen of
21937 Novi Rd. announce the en-
gagement of their daughter Gail,
to Dean Nledernhofer, son of Mr.
and Mrs. NiedernhQfer" of Alton,
nI.

Gail was graduated from North-
ville HIgh school in 1952 and at-
tended M{mticello college in nIi:.
nOls and Northwestern university
School of Medical Technology at

Wesley Memorial hospital in Chi-
cago. She is employed at North-
ville State h09pital at thp. present
ttIne as a ~{1ical technologist.

Dean is a graduate of Washing-
ton university in St. Louis and at
present is a graduate student in
Chrysler Institute of Engineering.

The young couple will be wed
Nov. 26 at the First Presbyterian
church in Northville.

Mrs. Drews formerly lived in
Northville. Her daughter and
hUSband, Mr. and Mrs. Morris
Pearl of EI Cajon, Calif. expect
to arrive in Northville a week
from Sunday to visit in North-
ville.

'I1heNorthville Rainbow Assem-
bly No. 29 installed Delores Tesh-
ka as Worthy Advisor for theV·~.M --'-lcoming term at

~

'i "", ,..r;;:-itheir meeting on
\ Sept. 27 at the

." Masonic Temple.
( Other officers
IJ installed we r e
j;;' Pen n y Niece,
j>;~ Genevieve Mc-
, Gee, Corrin DiG-

kerson, Roberta
Schroeder, Jan-
ice Dixon, Bar-

bara WIlliams, Patty Willing,
Beverly Stone, Lois Leavenworth,
Judy Boyd, Nancy Fvankland,
Elsie Sedan, Barbara Mapes, Car-
ole Lemmon, Janice Morgan and
ArdIth Robertson.

- Phone 200 To Place A Classified Ad -

3 WAYS TO,GET
THE EXTRA ROOM
YOUR FAMILY NEEDS

'" . '"
Mr. and Mrs. Parker Holden re-

turned last week from a three
weeks vacation in Kingsville, Ont.
Their son-in-law, daughter and
grandson, Mr. and Mrs. Richard
Hackett an& Richard Holden of
Jackson spent a week with them
at Kingsville.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. J. F. Green of

Cady St. attended the opening of
Lebanon Raceway in Ohio last
week end.

'" '" '"Mr. and Mrs. William Bailey of
Oady St. were co-hosts with Mr.
and Mrs. Harter of Livonia for a
baroecue at their home Saturday
night. Thirty-five meh and boys
from the Church of God in Li-
vonia attended the aMair.

'" '" '"

Formality Faded
At Saturday Tea

• • •

&&::&

LUCIUS BLAKE
12« N. CENTER (Opposite Post Office) NORTHVILLE

SevertO members of lohe Michi-
gan branch of the National Farm
and Garden Assn. attended a
council meeting at the Union
building in East Lansing Thurs-
day.

,Mrs. Jean McQueen and son,
Russell, Mrs. Othal Baggett, Ron-
nie and Darlene, and Miss Vera
Lute visited the zoo in Tol~o
Saturday. / .

'" '" '"Mrs. W. S. Dunn, formerly of
Northville, notified the Record
that she is spending several
weeks with her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. C. Chauncey of Soddy, Tenn.
The Chaunceys recently celebrat-
ed their 70th wedding anniver-
sary.

Mr. and Mrs. Oharles Lapham
of E. Main St. are the proud par-
parents of a daughter named Ter-
ry Lynn. The baby weighed' seven
pounds, seven ounces and was
horn in William Beawnont hos-

iiiiiiiiiiiiiiliiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiidvital, Royal Oak~ Mrs. Laphamwas formerly Maxine Clark.· -. .
Mr. and Mrs. R. G. Nelson of

Napier-Rd. are spending the week
at Winnepeg. Linda Nelson is a
guest of the Howard Meyer fam-
ily during her parents absence.· . '"

,Mrs. Edna Drews of San 'Diego,
Calif. returns Thursday to Cali-
fornia after a three weeks visit
with her brother, Ralph Foreman.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Bergman

of E. Cady Sf. (Lucille Morse),
announce the birth of Pamela J 0,
born Sept. 1,7 in Mt. Carmel hos-
pital. The ,bruby weighed five
'Pounds, 15 ounces. \

'" '" '"Mrs. William Horsfall of Hor-
ton St. just returned from a two
weeks visit with friends and rela-
tives in Bay City and Saginaw.'" . .

.",~....

Barbara Bayless
Troth Announced

Miss Harriet Angel, daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. Earl Angel of
Beck Rd., Nov} township, and
Vernon Howard "'Tartin, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Lonnie AUdry Mar-
tin of Walled Lake, were quietly
married Friday evening in the
Methodist parsonage at Brighton
with the Rev. J. M. McLucas of
the Novi Methodist church read-
ing the single ring ceremony

The young couple were attend-
ed by the bridegroom's brother
and sister-in-law, Mr. and Mrs.

Lyndle Martin of Walled Lake. rr=7=::==:~~:::=:;~~~~~§~~~~~~~~After a short honeymoon the
couple will reside at 1432 Oak-
shade Rd., Commerce, in their
new horne. Mr. Martin IS employ-
ed by Russell Button, excavating
contractor, of Novi.

Harriet Angel .
Vernon Martin
Wed September 23

THE NORTHVILLE RECORD-ThUl'sday, September 29, 1955-3

CONVERT WASTED ATTIC SPACE INTO A BEAUTIFUL ROOM
At sUl1prisingly low cost you can h'ave a new bedroom; or ma)'lbe two
-plus extra built-in storage space-by finishing your attic. We'll
give you step-by-step instructions Jf you're doing the job yourself.

MATERIAL FOR A 12xl6 ROOM,AS LITTLE AS
$6.39 Per Month

NO DOWN PAYMENT .(16 MONTHS TO PAY

TRANSFORM YOUR
BASEMENT INTO A GAYI
RECREATIO,N ROOM
Give the youngsters a place to
entertain theIr friends - a hand-
some "fun room" in the basement,
where it's cool in summer, warm
in winter.
MATERIAL FOR A 23x16 ROOM
AS LITTLE IAS

$9.50 Per Month
NO DOWN PAYMENT
36 MONTHS' TO PAY

ADD A ROOM TO YOUR
PRESENT HOME
A permanent. well-built addition
like this gives you all the advan-
tages of a large eXJl)€nsive new
house.
MATERIAL FOR A 12x16 ROOM
AS LOW AS

$26.36 Per J\'1onth
NO D~WN PAYMENT
36 MONTHS TO PAY

NOWELS'
LUMBER & COAL CO.

BUILDERS' SUPPLIES • HARDWARE
PHONE 30 OR 1100

630 Baaeline Road . Northviile, Mich.

A:"': .' 1" ..,~....,
. ',

OL V Mothers' Club
To Meet October 4

Hester and Mrs. Dwight H. Gray-
son.

Mrs. Godfrey, as first viee~pres-
ident, takes over the duties of
Mrs. Robert G. Wettevstroem who
will be vacationing with Dr. Wet- 1-------------
terstroem in New York.

Long hair makes a man look
either dignified or ridiculous.
Which, depends on whether the
hair is on hJS head or on his coat.

I
I DR. L. E. REHNER

OPTOMETRIST
Phone Plymouth 433

FEDERAL BUILDING
843 Penniman - Plymouth

-HOURS-
Monday. Tuesday. Thunda.,.

1 P.M. to 9 P.M.
Wednesday. Friday. Saturday.

10 A.M. to S P.M.

Success is just a good idea cou-
pled with hard work.

New Office Hours I
Northville Record
Mon. - Thurs. 8 to 5

Friday. 8 to 7
Closed Saturdays

SPECIALS
Week ending oct. 8

Sport Shiri:s
49c

Orchard Lake Rd .• comer Grand River Farmington
774 Penniman Avenue Plymouth
135 North Center Slreefl •.••••••..• , Northville

If

An important point about stock car racing that may not have occurred to you:.

The safer •car WIns • • •

and Chevrolet

~

10TORS,

~

DELCO

Auto races aren't won by brute
horsepower. Roadability, accelera-
tion, precision s~ering and stamina
-the very qualities that make a car
safer for you-are the keys to vic-
tory on the track! And that's why
Chevrolet is top car, by far, on the
NASCAR (National As~ociation for
Stock Car Auto Racing) SI'Oll r r~ck
circuit.

Barbara Bayless
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Bayless of W.

Eight Mile Rd., announce the en-
gagement of thel!' daughter, Bar-
bara, to Bruce Wagenschutz, son
of Mr. and Mrs. Harry Wagen-
sohutz of 341 Beal St.

No date has been set for the
wedding.

iT............................ ...,.. ......... Faster accelel'ation
means safer passing

Chevrolet's cannonball ac-
celeration has punchcd
past many a bigger car to
victory. But the same
blazing surge is a vital
safety factor on the high- "" __ "
way-one that can whisk you more
safely around other cars and out
of critical situations.

PASS
WITH
CARE,

Easier. super accu:ri:l~e
steering

Nimble is the word for Chcvrol~t.
But you don't have to ,see them in
action on a t;ght quarter-mile track

When your refrigerator motor
needs replacing, why not have
us install a Delco, the choice
of leading manufacturers be-
cause of their quiet operation.
long life. peak and perform.
ance and dependability. Delao

j builds a size and type for aU
makes. RathburnDeKA Y ELECTRIC

431 YERKES STREET
NORTHVILLE PHON~ 262 560 PLYMOUTH AVE.

1 ~ , ... t
Ii

~~'-~I~'"

.................. " rl' J\

•
IS the big WInner

to judge how they make other cars
secm clumsy. You can feel that your-
self in the press of traffic, and sense
the feather-light precision of BaU-
Race steering in every curve. There's
extra safety, too, in Glide-Ride front
suspension that sops up
the harshcst bumps-that
lets your car "keep its
feet under it" for maxi-
mum traction on the
rou;;hcst roads .

More stabilUy on curves

Chevrolet's famous stability means
money in the bank to the race driver
-it lets him broadside through turns
faster and smoother. But it means
peace of mind to you on the road
-more comfort in cvery curve and

~

bs body-roll with
broad-based Out rig-

<:.... ' l' . ger r~ar .springs, extra.~r ~# :>ecunty tf you have to
""'" swerve sharply to

meet an emergency, a
solid "onc-picce" kcl that is a delight
to Olnydriver.

•

. The ability to slo"" down
and stop quickly
and smoothly

Those big II-inch brakes have averted
many a disaster in the close-packed
battle of racing. But they weren't de-
~igned for thOlt; they were made to
give you "heads-up" stops and extra_
stopping power in traffic, on moun-
tain grades, on high-speed express-
ways. Competition has merely proved
their margin of superiority!

Com, m ond try ,,' •
this new winner your- ~ ....."",,
self •.• and see how easy STO P
we're making it to buy , _ ~
a Chevrolet right now! ~~-

A grOWing IIsl 01Chevrolet
victories In slock car competition
FAYUTEVILLE, t-I. C. BElMA~, N. J.
COLUM8IA, S. C. Cl'.)AR RAPIDS, IOWA
YOLmGSTOWN, O. BALTIMORE, MD.
ATlANTA, GA. flOYD, VA.
JERSEY CITY, N. J. WINSTON·SALEM, N. C.
CHICAGO. Ill. MINOT, N. D.
PITTSBURGH.PA. GRMlO FORKS, N. O.
To~oNro,ONT•• CAN. lYNCHBUPG.VA.

MILWAUKEE, WIS.

Chevrolet Sales
PHONE 290

, '

NORTHVILLE



4-Thursday, September 29, 1955-THE NORTHVILLE RECORD

* ** *
"The Meanest Racket"

Almost every week the Northville Record receives
-classified advertisements from firms promising remunera-
tive self-employment to anyone who will send $1 or $2 to
the advertiser for "full information". Without exception
we throw them in the waste basket because 99% of them
are just a racket which might victimize some of our re'ad-
ers if we were to run them.

Assistant Postmaster D. J. Stark mailed us the fol-
lowing article last week. We reprint it because it express-
es our sentiments exactly.

"One of the meanest con~idence games in existence
today is that which filches money from th.e aged man or
woman living on a small fixed income.

"And yet, notes Chief Postal Inspector David H. Ste-
phens, this is a racket that has been increasing by leaps
and bounds as our national population grows older, and
more and more citizens live o~annuities or investmel}t re-
turns.

"One racket that has particularly alarmed postal in-
spectors is that which offers 'profitable work' to the pen-
sioner, but which proves in the final analysis to be nothing
but a scheme to defraud, Mr. Stephens noted.

"It seems logical to a pensioner, for example-par-
ticularly if he is laid up at home with a disability-that
addressing advertising post cards would be a profitable
'at home' business.

"In some instances, though, where post card address-
ing at home 'for profit, etc.' ·is offered, it sends dollars into
the hands of confidence men, not the pensioners.

"The system is simple. The confJdence man inserts
classified advertisements in newspapers and magazines
throughout the country. The ad appears in the 'help want-
ed' columns, which would give the impression that the
'advertiser is in need of employees.

"The ad might read:
" 'Earn extra cash addressing post cards at home.'

"This ad may go on to say that a $1 fee is charged
, \fOr 'instructions.' Unfortunates are taken in by the thous-

ands. •
I "What they receive in the mail is nota job offer. It
is a booklet listing the names of several well-known firms
that do advertise though post card circulars.

"Then, the uni:ortunates check with the firms listed
and find they already have an olfice staff employed to
send out the cards.

"The person who sends in $1 for such worthless tripe
feels foolish and $1 seems hardly enough to warrant a
fOl'mal complaint, so the swindler goes his merry way."

\
I,'g Old Sfove

~~und./JP Time

•
VALUABLE MIRRO •••. ....: ...
with every GAS
Ran8~-pu-r.6~.ed,. '::-. .' "du,'ng" this' sed.

.I~.al forSteak., .Ch0p'/ Hamburgers,GrJddte Cake,

Baltuck said, but were tQld that
t~ey could not receive payments
,oecause under the law, at that Ir:=======================::::=:..time, the worker had not earned II
enough social security credit to
provide survivors benefits for his
family.

Where a claim for social se-
curity benefits is filed within 12
months of the time a b'enefidary
is first eligible, his payments can
be made to 'him retroactively for
the whole period, Mr. Baltuck
,pointed out. But if a claim is de-
layed for more than 12 months
Ibenefits for some months will b~
lost. He therefore urged the sur-
vivors of workers Who died be- I'::========================~tween June 1940 and September ,.
1950 to get in touch with their
nearest social security offices be-
fore Oct. 1, 1955.Qualified claim-
ants who apply before that date
can be paid benefits back to
September 1954.

Monthly rbenefits under this
provision may be paid to the aged
widows of suoh workers who at
the time of deatH had worked on
jobs under social security 'for at
least a year and a half-to sur-
viving children under 18 years
of age, and to their mothers.
Where no widow or children sur-
vived the worker, payments can
be made to his aged parents if he
was providing their support.

The Detroit-Northwest social
security office is located at 14600
Grand River, Detroit 27.

relatively low wages in Michigan
schools and poorer districts are
hiring uncertified teachers regu-
larly.What happens when a hundred

new families arrive in a medium-
sized city?

To begin with, it means about
450 new people, including 100
children, 67 in grammar school,
33 in high school. This calls for
2.2 new rooms in grade school and
1.65 new rooms in high school,
which will cost about $120,000.
Four new teachers will have to
be hired. The 100 families will
add about $30,000a year to the
school operating budget.

Besides teachers, the city will
need four-fifths of a new employe
in the'police department and two-

thirds of a new fireman, up'ping
the police budget by $4,lHOand
the fire department budget by
$2,820.All sorts of extra jobs will
have to be done from collecting
,taxes to collecting garbage. -Add
four new city employes at a total
price of $12,000to $15,000.

The water department must
pump 10,OOOfgallons more each
day. Traffic will be increased by
140cars and trucks. And the city
may have to add 500new volumes
to the city library, part of a visit-
ing nurse, yes-a fraction of a
cell in the town jail!-CHANG-
ING TIMES.

POLITICIANS ARE SWAP-
PING soapboxes in Michigan as
both parties stack their ammuni-
tion for 1956campaigns.

Republicans, with a story for
the working man, are going after
the labor vote.

Democrats, prosperous with a
full slate of incumbents in the
capltol, are wooing the farmer.

The switch in emphasis will
nave an effect on the 1956 elec-
tion, both sides claim. The new
areas of campaigning are expect-
ed to make Mlchlgan one of the
hottest states in the drive for
votes.

''We are going to show the lab-
oring man that he has benefited
from a Republican legislature,"
said Republican State Chairman
John Feikens.

DemocI'aticState Chairman Ne-
il Staebler said the party is whip-
ping together a "state fann pro-
gram" to show normally Repub-
llcan farmers that they would do
well to vote the other way.

"The Republicans are 'driving
the family off the faI'm with their
-agricultural policies," he said.
"Corporations are buying the land
as business enterprises."

Both parties conducted spirited
voter registration campaigns m
September.

Democrats aimed a major cam-
paign gun at tl{e 80 percent farm
'Parity, claiming President Eisen-
hower promised 100percent.

Laboring folk in Detroit will be
rbombarded with the idea that
Repu'blicans in the legislature
have increased workmen's and
unemployment compensation ben':
efits.

All this, while the guessing
game reaches new peaks over
who will be the candidates.

Feikens insists that Gov. Wil-
liams will go for a fifth consecu-
tive term and P.resident Eisen-
hower will try for his second
four-year stay in the White
House.

The governor, who has been
mentioned as a Democratic pres-
idential candidate, is silent on the
thought but has done little to
indicate which way he might go.

Democrats are Ipatipnt, but
some top party leaders figure it
will be for a filih term in Lan-
smg.

Here~ how they analyze it:
Potential candidates at Chicago

next Aug. 13-except Gov. Wil-
hams-will be able to go into the
convention, campaign for the
nommation, and still hold a spot
open back home.

Williams will have to make his
decision before going to Chicago
and it will have to be public, be-
cause the deadline with with-
drawmg from the gubernatorial
race expires before Aug. 13.

Conceivably, Gov. Williams
could be nominated for the presi-
dency by Democrats and still be
the candidate for governor in
Michigan.

W.hat would happen in that
ease is an interesting project for
any attorney that happens to be
in the mood for a night of con-
templation.

,Whatever is accomplished in
the special session of the legis-
lature in October will also have
an influence on 1956.

The governor has called the
legislature into special session to
consider highway safety, care for
mentally retarded children and a
$200a year pay increase for 50,-
000 school teachers.

Parts for all Cars -
EXCHANGE •••• ENGINES,

FUEL PUMPS, GENERAT.
ORS,STARTERS,CLUTCH·
ES.

Complete Machine Shop
Service •••• Engine

Rebuilding

'Novi Auto Parts
NOVI. MICHIGAN

PhoDe Northville 55

Party sUl>portfor the tieup of
the two issues died in a State
Central Committee meeting.

Rep. John Penczak (D-Detroit)
said he and others plumped for
the $4,000annual wage flQor in
the last session of the legislature.
He said:

"We took an awful beating. If
you want the $4,000a year guar-
antee, you're going to have to
send us more Democrats.

"We're going to be criticised
whatever happens," said one Re-
publican lawmaker.

He &aid!Gov. Williams can
claim the credit for recognizing
the "emergencies" and calling the
session. The governor can also
attack Republicans for not solv-
ing problems of the past 20 years
in four days of the session.

THERE'S ,.,.~ _~.
NOTHING :u/U

LIKE .

FOR COOkiNG-HEATING
AND CLOTHES 'ORYING

OTWELL
HEATING & SUPPLY
PHONE PLY. 1701·J

882 N. Holbrook
_ -PLYMOUTH

1. We would like to show you some of the
things that make the new 1956 Ford
one of America's finest -cars-despite
the fact it is one of America's lowest-
priced cars. Let's start with these long,~
low lines. Looks like it hates to stand
still, doesn't it?

Let's take
a walk around

- Record Want Ads Bring Results -
........

NEW OFFICE HOURS ...
The NORTHVILLE RECORD

Mon.-Thurs. 8 to 5 Friday 8 to 7
Closed Saturdays

Storm Sash and Doors, New Sid~g, Insulation or a
new roof to prepare your home for rougher and cold.
er weather. We have a :variety of types to suit most
any condition or taste. Supply is ample so good ~er·
vice is assured; Just stop in or phone.

the NEW'56 FORD !
2. Here, on your left, is the inspirationfor the

styling of the '56 Ford-the famous Ford
Thunderbird. You can see the similarity
from any angle. Look at those broad, flat
hoods, thosevisoredheadlights,forexampla.
Here is styling that willlllay in style.

It's the :fine!Jar at half the fine car price!

\

4. Here's the new 202·h.p.Thunderbird y.g
and we assure you, it will give you new
driving enjoyment. It'~ available in
FordomaticFairlane and Station Wagon
models ••• the 176-h.p. Y-8 in Fordo-
matic Mainline and Customline models
••• the 137-h.p.Six in all models.

ad tA;JiiZ1£:

3. Here's what yOil ride on, This
frame has five cross-members
including a K-bar member up
front. Itcan take it! And Ford's
Ball-Joint Front Suspension
really blots out bumps.

.6 'l'his Lifeguard cushioning for in-
• strument panel and sun visors is

optional. It gives you extra pro-
tectionagainstseriousinjurieswhen
thrown forward in an accident.
You may also have optional seat-
belts to help keep occupants
securelyin their seats.

5. Note the deep·center design of this
new Lifeguard steering wheel. The
wheelrim is over three inches above
the post to help cushion the driver
in case of an accident. ,

Marr
117 W. MAIN'ST.

Taylor Fore;!
NORTHVILLE

J,.
I
I
I

1;
1:
{;
~
I

"I~l
.'~,

~,
11
':

~
i!
1
I

P

Social SecurityIr.------------------~IWarning IssuedMICHIGAN MIRROR A considerable number of wid-
ows, young children, and aged

A REPORT FROM :I.:HECAPITOL parents of w'brking people who
By Elmer White died between June 1940and Sep-

, "tember 1950have failed' to claim
Re1>ublicansare wary because 1 the monthly benefits paya~le to

the problems have been with leg- the:n under ~ 1954change m the
• J SOCialsecurIty law, announced
Islators for years. Harry Baltuck manager f the

Juvenile Judge Nathan Kauf- Detroit-Northw~st social s~curity
ffiiln, of Detroit, said children office. Those who do not apply
h2\1ebeen waiting 25 years for a for theIr benefits before Oct. _1,
space in mental hospitals. People he pointed out, will not be able
have died on the highways _ever to receive benefits lor all the 11-------------
since cars were invented. months black to September 1954,

the effective date of the new pro-
vision in the law.

Under this provision, it is nQW
possible to pay monthly wcial
security benefits to the qualified
survivors of _workers who died
betwee.n June 1940 and Septem-
'ber 10950if the deceased wage
earner had credit for as little as
a year and a hall work under
social security. The families of
many of these workers applied

Democrats SQught to tie the for benefits at the tithe of the
proposed $200 a year salary in- family breadwinner's death, Mr.

·7. Here's Ford's new Lifeguarddoor llltch.
A double-grip locking engagement re-
duces the chance of doorsspringingopen
under impact. Chances of seriousinjury
in accidents are less when passengers
remain in the car.

'Veil, that covers the important points.
But there's a lot more. So we'd like to
invite you to come in and see the new
'56 Ford foryourself.Then you'll see the
colorful new exteriors and interiors, the
quality workmanship that is evident
everywhere. Then you'll learn the full
story. You'll know that Ford is the fine
car at half the fine car price.

Sales
PHONE 1320

.. - \



Eleanor Petterson from Tree Ineral home Wednesaay. Rev.
Haven won fourth, third and sec-I Richard Burgess of· the Salem
and in the five gaited classes on Congregational church officiated.

By Jane Hoyt "Gray Sensation". Zisha Hein- Mr. Clemens died Saturday in
GArfield 1-7625 rIch on "Our Prediction" won -------------: 'Alpena General hospil'al of in-

third in the ladies five gaited. juries sustained in an automobile
The Mt. Clemens show was one In the fine harness stake class, accident. He was 71 years of age

of the best organized shows in· Dr. Elrod's "Sara Beaverkettle" and w.as bQrn m Clarksville, Mich.
the whole circuit. It was pre- won first, and "Power Glide" HIS parents wele Samuel and Nel-
sented by the American Legion from the don San stable won lw.
Post NQ. 4 at the old polo grounds. second. Surviving are a son, Elmo, of
The women's auxiliary staffed Thc Tennessee Walking horse Northville, and Samuel of Mason;
the refreshment booth, and fed stake was won by "Daughter of three daughters, Mrs. Betty Baar-
the multitude not only with ham- Champion" owned by the Benj. laer of Alpena, Mrs. Nellie 0'-
burgers and hot dogs, but with Westtlall farms, and was ridden Loane of Howell and Mrs. Lu-
home-made cooking. by Jimmy Casson cena Reid of Seattle, Wash, and

The children were entertained The Morgan horse halter class a brother, Geopge, of Flmt. There
with a merry-go-round, and other stallIon stake was won by "Star are 12 grandchIldren.
rides, and to top off the event Hawk" and received the Walter BUrial WIll be in ClarkSVIlle
the officials raffled a color TV. Rheda Kane Grand Champion cemetery Thursday at 1;30:'
Carl Romig, a member of an old trophy.
Clrcus family, fIlled the inter- "King's Captain Dare" owned
missions with laughter and glee by Claude LaVasseur was retired
with hh dog, donkey and pony from the show ring As Mr. La-
act. Vasseur rode the horse Mr. Cas-

The officials of the show were son told of its long show record,
given a great hand, not only for and, what a wonderful heart and
their splendid wO[lk, but for their wllllngness the horse possessed.
time and effort, and were escort- It was a part of a shOW that is
ed into the rmg in a fme two- seld-om viewed'-.
seated surrey with the top down. _
It is extremely hard to find such
a buggy m such good condition
today.

Sandy- Bortz won three firsts
with her horse, Sweetheart, and
fourth with "Lois Beaverkettle"
in the Three gaited stake. "Noble
Cinnamon Sue" of the Don San
stable won second and third in
the three gaited staKe. Sharon
smIth won sixth m 1.be stake class
and third in the ladies' three gait-
ed.

Sharen Horn on "Dr. Jubilee"
won the western parade class.
This is a black gelding, and the
rider was dressed in black velvet.
The only color was a red plume
on the pole of the horse.

Mr. Wallace showed "Mountain
Breeze" and "Invitation',', a'1d
).Von second and. third with his
new gelding This is remarkable
as this horse has only been in
training three weeks.

Saddle News Northville Baseball Team Wins
I t C t L Ch· h· right field and Bob Durue, John I alcade Bar, Pure Oil, Paul's Sweetn er.. oun y eague amplons Ip Trujillo, Walter Shy, Lee Van- ISh;~e a~ampFa:~~~ips\%ep'hY will

detti, pitchers. Folmo worked as
The NorbhlVilIe basebal.l team INew York Yan~ees and Johnny utility outfielder as well as man- be inscribed and then dIsplayed

In Brader's window.beat Plrmouth 6 to 1 thiS week \ Matsook, former Michigan State Iagel'.
m the fmal match of ~ five game. ball player, went to the Cleve- Heiniger formerly played in the CARD OF THANKSplay-off and by so domg became I. .
1955 cha'mpions of the Inter-' land Browns profeSSIOnal football minors for the Chicago White Sox r wish to thank my neighbors
County League. team. and Mergelskki was with the and friends for thell' kindness

'llhe team had been runner-up The NorLhvl1l~ club roster in- Brooklyn Dodgers.. durmg my recent stay at Univer-
for the lea"ue champIOnshIp m cluded Ben AqUlsto, catcher; Ray SponlOors of the NorthVIlle team slty Hosp1tal.
1953 and 1954. Hemiger, fast base; Bob Turey- this year were Bradee's Depaz:t- Fern Peck

Otlt t . h 1 zn, second base; Frank Maria, ment Store, Turnbull Electl'1c,
G· 'de~ ~ms 'elm tt ~ eagueMare third base; D. Mana, short slop; John Poulos, Nor~hvi!Ie Bar, j A mortgage may be necessary
;ant a e 1er<:;n s, ayne er- T. VendittI, left field; Norm N. Ramsey Bar, Schrader's Furni- at times, but one's conscience

Cc'tan SA'lIRa Pph kllMsworhthtGarLd.en Mel'gelswkl, center fIeld; Ted N1x, ture, Ely Coal and Fuel 011, Cav- should be kept unencumbered.I y, en a1' erc.r.an s, m-
coin Park Merchants, Wallace-
VIlle Merchants, Wayne Dietrich
Buick and Y'Psilantl.

Northville went into the play-
off with a record of mne wins and
nme losses, but in a sharp re-
versal of form won four out of
fIve games in the final series.
There were five teams m the
play-off series.

Manager Steve FoIin'o pointed
out that the local team lost two

pa~:fts were Andrew and Mar- valua:ble playels just prior to the
ga.. , play-off series. Seventen-year-old

He lS survIved by one son, Alex Walter Messina was signed by the
Prayer service was held Sun- F.,of 36 Wllshire Dr., Avondale 1---------- _

day at the Casterlme Funeral Esbtes, Ga.
honle for Sanluel B n'a 1811 Wednesday at the Casterline Fu-e J rom, The Rev. John 0. Taxis offi-
E W~lled Lake pr., Walled Lake. clated and burial was in Rural neral home wibh the Rev. J. P.
He dIed Sept.. 2:>at. the age of 73. HIlI cemetery. Lodge -No. 182, Coulton of Christ Elpiscopal
He was boron m ChlCago, III. F.&A.M. held graveslde services. church, Livoma, officiating. Bur-

A daughtee, Mrs Emma GOld-I Milne was a member of the rial was in Riverside cemetery
berg of Elk City, Mo. survives. INorthVIlle chapter of the Masomc m Plymouth.

SurViving are her husband,Mr. Benjamm, who was em- lodge and of the Presbyterian Earl, 46480 W. Five MIle Rd.,
ployed for 37 'years by Fred W. ahurch and had lived in North- Plymouth; a son, Dewey Mack, of
Pearce who owns and manages ville since 1917. He was a retired Redford; three daug;hters: Mrs.Library Hours amusement parks, managed the Ford Motor Co. employee. Leonard Jones, Plymouth; Mrs.
park at Walled Lake. DeWItt Elsworth, Plymouth, andChanged for Fall The body was shipped to Kan-I MRS. VELMA MACK Mrs. Daniel Bratby, Wayne.

A change in hours of the North- sas Clty, Mo. for burial. There are 11 grandchildren.
ville L1brary was announced thiS .) Mrs. Velma Mack died in Uni- Also supvivmg are four broth-
week by Librarian MTs. H. Wilcox H~RRY CLEMENS I versity of Michrgan hOS'Pital Mon- ers: Irwin of Livonia, Olyde of

]3eginning ,Oct. '(. the library day, Sept 26 at the age of 53. Her Farmmgton, Elmer of Lapeer and
wil} be closed on, Fridays unhl Services for Harry Clemens, parents were William and Agnes Tom of Walled Lake, and two
further notice Hours will be 11;30 i Who lived on 8810 Six Milc Rd., Hotbms and she was born in Red- ~lsters, Mrs. AHa Kel1y, Red
to 8 Monday through Thursday Salem, for the pa~t ten years, ford June 16, 19G2. Lodge, Mont. and Mrs. Cora j
and Saturday, 9 to 6 were held at the Casterline Fu- Funeral services were held last IShackleton, Garden City.

~ EXTRA 'fENDER, EXTRA LEAN, FRESH KROGER-CUT

tAl ct

, Ins

GEORGE MILNE

WILLI~M REYNOLDS

WIlham Reynolds, a resident of
Northville for 47 years, died in
Sessions hospital Sept 25 at the
age of 88. His parents were John
and Mary and he was born in
Inkster Aug. 30, 1867.

Funeral services were held last
Tuesday at the Casterline Fu-
near! home wIuh the Rev. Ivan E.
Hodgson offIciating. BurIal was
m Rural HIlI cemetery.

Mr. Reynolds is survived by a
nephew, Harold Menthew of
NorthVIlle, and two sisters, Mrs.
Mal'garet Smith of Dearborn and
Mrs. ElJza'beth Bell of Long
Beach, Calif. He lived in his
home on 512 Baseline Rd. He re-
tired from the Ford flactory about
14 years ago and had been em-
ployed by the VIllage of North-
ville from then untIl the time of
his death.

Services were held Saturday at
the Casterline Funeral home for
George Milne who died at Glen-
brook Convalescent home in Li-
vonia Sept. 22. He was 81 years of
age and was born in Abderdeen-
shire, Scotland Aug. 5, 1874. HIS

Masons To Confer
F. C. Degree Oct. 3

The Past Masters of Northville
Masonic Lodge No. 186 will con-
fer an F.e. degree Monday, Oct. 3
at 7:30 p.m.

Reservations for the dinner,
which will be served at 6:45, must
ibe in by Sept. 29, and may be
made by calling the secretary,
Robert Coolman, or William Mon-
roe.

-'--
SAMUEL BENJ~MIN

Black Pepper
Kroger brand. New economy

Hygrade's Honey Brand Cry-O-Vac wrapped. No Waste'.Lb.
Can

size 2 Lbs, 97c

Lb, '49C
Shank helf. Hock portIOn removed! .

SLICED
LB. 4geCheese SPREAD

Lawndalz Pasteurized Process
Stmnybrook brand

Fresh HamsFig Bars
Top Flavor ZIOn brand .

Kroger Kraut
Everyday low price . .Green Beans
B~::,l·man. Everyday low price

No. 303
Can

No. 303
Can

Kidney Beans NCo3n03
Avondale brand. Everyday low price .

Butter Beans NCa3n03
Joan of Aec brand. Everyday low price

Star-Kist brand . . . • • . • 3
Freestone Peaches
Meddo-Land brand. Halves in syrup .

!~~a~~!~I~~.f I I • 3
Mazola Oil

6Vz-01:.
Cans 8ge

2ge

6ge

S1Ji

49°

Tomato Paste
Cont'Io1ina. Everyday low price

6-01:.
Call

2Vz
Can

Cut Beets Nea3n03
Avo'ldale Brand. Everyday low price •

Spaghetti 4t~z.
Chef Boy-Ar-Dee. Big new family size .

~tnB!~~P!r~da~~ie~e ~C~l~ 10 e

E~~~~~p~at~~I~. 4 J:~~47e

pric~t .. 39C

V;" 9ge

9ge

Lb.
Con

Gol.
Can

For salads and cooking. Priced low

Cake Mix DROMEDARY 2 Pkgs.

Salad Dressing
Embassy, brand. Everyday low

Encyclopedia
Do-it-yourself. Popular Mechanics Mcintosh Apples

Best of the crop! H! bu. $1.99

Prune Plums
6 Lb.

BogDishes PINI('N'CHARCOAL ~~~
5 piece place setting. Reg. $2.50 value Va Bu.

" '. ,',
J

THE NORTHVILLE RECORD-Thursday, September 29, 1955-5

y ,

,{, ,

You'll marvel at the ease and simplicity of
PLYMOUTH'S PUSH-BUTTON DRIVING. Coming to the

lowest-price field for the first time OCTOBER 21.

7 Rib
Cut

Lb.

• f 59c

Fresh,I"n ",d fI,.odnl Lotsof l"n ~:t 4 7 C

Qt. 25C
Fresh Pak. Priced extra low this week . .

. . . . . . . . . . . . Lb.

Spare Ribs
Vlasic Kraut

Rolls $122

17c

29c

35e

$2!~ Salsbury Steak
Krey brand De!lclOll~, To:) flavor meat

Salada Tea Bags
16-ct. pkg. With purchase of 4B-ct. pkg.

Wax Beans
Buy 'em at Kroger and Save

All
For

White Bread
Kroger sliced. Still the same low price .. 420·0z.

Loaf No. 303
ConsKroger brand cut. .

Fiesta Bar Cake
Fresh Kroger baked. R;g. price 39c

Peanut Butter
Velvet Brand. New low, low price

18·0z.
Jar

Margarine EATMORE
.Everyday low, low price . •

Frozen Shrimp
Fresh. Medium size. Lb. 49c .

2
.5

Prune Juice
Bennetts brand Everyday low price •

'-Lb.
Pkgr.

Qt.
811.

Lb.
Box

Radishes
Large Red Bunch. Priced low

Yams PUERTO RICAfl
smooth

.. 2 Bth,.
,Head

bel ve WIth Cheez Whiz .lIlIl.:h.grown.

Walnuts CELLO WRAPPEDLb. I-Lb.
Pkg.

-r .. ~ l I... •

, :f: l ~

.. I .... ~lr ~L~..~J: ~a~~~~in~;~lj~~~~



-• __ ~ ..............r-. ....r .. __ .. ~~

6-Thursday, September 29, 1955-THE NORTlWILLE RECORD

State Farmers Can
Get Free Trees

under the program, but state
workers help with <plans and
planting advice wherever de-
sired.

The program is limited to farms
in general below the Ba~TCity-
Muskegon line.Lansing, Sept. 21 - Southern

Michigan farm operators desiring
free trees and sluubs under the
state's farm game habitat pro-
gram i:an a.pply now by dropping
a card to the Consen'atlOn De-
partment's game diVision at Lan-
sing 26.
About 1,333,000 trees and shrubs

will be shipped in late October
to farmers who asked for the
plantmgs earlier this year.

Hunters pay for the stock to
provide more food and cover for
small game in southern Michigan.
The money comes from taxes on
hunting equipment, distributed
under the Pittman - Robertson
program.

Farmers gain by getting trees
for field windbreaks, multiflora
rose for "living fences", and other
erosion-stopping plantings. After
planting, farmers are not obligat-
ed to let hunters use their lands.

To date, more than 4500 south-
ern Michigan farms have made
use of the programs.

Farmers do their own plainting

NROTC Examination
Is Set for Dec . .}0

The tenth annual competitive
examination for high school sen-
Iors who desire to attend college
and train for careers as Naval
officers will be held throughout
,he nation Dec. 10, the Navy an-
nounced today. Applications for
t'he NROTC are now available
at all high schools, colleges and
U.S. Navy recruiting stations.
They must be submitted by Nov.
19.

Successful candidates will start
their Naval careers in colleges
and universibes across the coun-
try in 1956, with substantial fi-
nancial assistance from the gov-
ernment. After a normal college
education, graduates will be com-
missioned 111 the Regular Navy or
Marine Corps, for active duty
With the Fleet throughout the
world.

UifiS .,ELi
I
I
j

lrlore Students
Off To College

Added to the list 01 Northville
'Young people attending college________________________________________ Iprinted in the Record last week
are CaTol Ann Sparling, Mt. Plea-
sant; Nancy Littell, Carleton col-
lege, Minn.; Dick Gray and Arl-
ene Nelson, Mioh. State NOI1111al,
Ypsilanti; Bob HesUp, st. Bene-
did's college in Atcltison, Kans.;
Bob Freydl, Mr, and Mrs. John
Poulos, Nancy Dewsbury, Tom One Year .. "",."." ••• $3.00 Two years , $5.00
Heslip, David Lee, Bob Pullen, • , l
Michigan State university; Con- Glenn H. Cwmmngs •••••••••••••••••••••• Publisher and EcWo.r
rad Burkrpan, Cleary college, yp-l Tom Cummings •••••• ~•••••••••••••••••• , •••• Business Manager
silanti; Ruth Pullen, Detroit Bus- •mess school. Wm. yockey Plant Superintendent

This old-time picture of downtown Northville
was faken about 1910, according to ~rs. George
Dixon, 401 Yerkes Ave .. who loaned it to the
Record for publication. If shows the stores on
the wesi side of N. Center ,St. The .building al
!:he corner, where the Record office is now
located, was occupied by !:he Wm. Gorton men's
clothing store. Next is John McCullough's
cobbling shop and above Allen's tailor shop,

which was operafed by Curley Allen's father.
The fhird building is fhe old DUR waiting room
and a confectionery slore; .above, Lyman Ball's
photography studio. The fourth building was the
home of Schrader Bros. furniture and Parson's
grocery. The last building in the row 'WasMiss
Bovee's ladies store. The Record will be glad to
publish any pictures of old Northville and will
appreciate having them sent in.

'==============="Imagine Beavers Big as Bears '! !!

New! IIMatchless" Heating f1)Uo1HERM
OIL HOME HEAlERS

NEW

1)U01HERM
HEATERS

EASY TERMS

Most beautiful oil home heater in Amerim'
• More heat, cleaner heat, from every drop of oil-

with Duo-Therm's exclusive Dual Chamber Burner.
• Fine furniture styling, beautiful mahogany finisb.
• Forced-beat circulation and fuel savings up to 25%

with Duo-Therm's exdusive Automatic POWER.AIR
Blower,

• 4 wide-opening doors for radiant heat. Healthful
humidifier. Special Waste Stopper. Handy waist-high
control.

Have matchless comfort this winter and years to come.
See this new Duo-Therm Windsor now.

Northville Electric Shop
153 EAST MAIN PHONE 184 NORTHVILLE, MICH.

~~.
l~
~
~ Brand ...new, factory ID iresh, 195.5
r : .. - STUDEBAKERSI Save hundreds of dollars'

'1 ~ We dare you to beat our FIRED SALE DI:ALSI Come in and compare ourI
~ price fags - then pick out your new Sludebaker, the style-setting economy
\. ............ car of the yearl Buy now on your own terms-choose from B big selection

~~~~~;=;;;i~I!~!-;.I ,r.. ~ of body styles and color combinations IWe will not turn down any reason-" 1 t~ able offerl

·:.rZ::~~:a~;;;;'~4.'. -'".~.. ~« '1 ~ NO-TR-IP-S---NO-FU-R-C-O-A-TS---JU-S-T -H-UG-E-S-A-YI-N-GS!
~~;''''~~;;:~~=;j '-.1 &.:

'For Plenty of Hot'Water ~$ ~.L ~Be Smart! Buy now SALE:.,~;~~I r~ and avoid price in- ENDS
I ~ SAT.,

~~:.:. I\~ creases later! Save $$ OCT. 1
I~-=::::
• ~I!.1El~~jateDelivery Your OIaCar Down

Paralyzed Wayne
Graduate Enters
Medical Schoolnow vanished from the scene,

Professor Hussey remarks that the
Musk Ox lives today in Green-
land and the noI1thernmost parts
of Canada. ,''When the great glac-
ier occl1pied most of the Canadian
region these animals were forced
to retreat southward before the
slowly advancLTlg ice front and
then when the climate grew
warmer, they migrated north-
ward, since their na.tural habitat
was in the colder parts of the
continent. Skulls of the musk ox
have been found in Michigan and
there is a well preserved skull of
one of these animals in the Uni-
versity Museum."

"Some of these long-vanished
animals may have been seen by
the aqvance guard of-Indians who
onc~ lived in this region. But they
are all gone today and the cause
of their disappearance is a pro-
found mystery," Professor Hussey
concludes.

IThe Giant Beaver, who liyed
in Michigan ten thousand years
ago at the end of the Ice Age,
was as large as the modern black
bear, according to University of
Michigan geologist Russell C.
Hussey.

How the prehistoric forest must
have reverberated when he slap-
ped his tail! Plainly the beaver
that toils in Michigan today would
have been no match for that giant
creature.

The house of one of these over-
sized beavers measured nine feet
across.

"The Giant Beaver was just one
- of an amazing assemblage of ani-

mals, completely unknown to ,our
state today, which came to live
here with the return of the forests
and grass lands after the ice re-
treated," he states.

"Skeletons of the Woolly Mam-
moth have been found in Michi-
gan and the condition of the bones

, indicates that they are only a fewIthousand years old. This elephant
came to North America by way of
a land bndge that connected Si-
beria and Alaska. He was well
equipped to withstand low temp-
eratures since he was protected
by a heavy growth of woolly hair
next to the skin and several inch-
es of fat just beneath his shaggy
hIde," Professor Hussey says.

"Skeletons of the American
,Mastodon are more common here
than are those' of the Mammoth.
They have been found in a num-
ber of places throughout the state
commonly in swamps, and buried
to depths of only a few feet," ·he
states.

An unusually well preserved
skeleton, found near the tow!l of
Owosso, has been mounted 111 a
standmg position in the U-M
Museum and is one of the Univer-
sity's finest and most spectacular
exhibits.

The professors calls attention
to the fact that many of the Mas-
todon bones from the swamps of
Michigan are so recent and fresh
that they will contain some of the
original organic material, and
even piecf's of cartilage are found
famened to certain parts of the
skeleton.

"Such discoveries mean that
Mastodons survived in our state
until comparatively recent times,
and they must have been common
all through the forests of Mtchi-
gan. But nobody has been able
to explain why the elephants and
mastodons survived the worst
conditions of the Ice Age and
then, when living conditions were
apparently getting better, disap-
peared completely from North
America."

Describing still another animal,

Nick Kahane, 37, parapelegic
February graduate of Wayne'uni-
versity, began a new phase of his
educatIOnal career recently by
enrollmg in the university's col:
lege of medicine and attending
classes in his wheel chair.

Nick, a patient at Detroit's Re-
ceiving hospital for 17 years, was
mistaken ior a thief and acci-
dentally shot down by a police-
man. He IS paralyzed from the
chest down.

Nick graduated earlier this
year witlh a bachelor of arts de- I
gree from Wayne. He was an I
honor student in chemistry.

Ten Detroit businessmen took
an interest in Kobane aner form-
ed the Nick Kabane club. They
have S"pent $21,000 financing his
undergraduate education, which
took him seven years to complete.

Admittance to Wayne's medi-
cal school IS the next step toward
fulfilling Kabane's dream of be-
coming a doctor. Im.plration, ac-
cording to Nick, came from his
friends on the staff of Receiving
hospital.

"If determination will do it,"
Nick said, "I will wm myself a
degree in medicine. I don't know
how long it will take, but I'm
going to try."

--"-----

u.s. Eating Habits
Show Big Change

Today's average American eats
about the same amount of food,
measured in pounds, as an aver-
age American ate 50 years ago.
But the kmd of [ood he eats is
the big change.

According to research done by St.-John's Names
the U.S. Department of Agricul-
ture, there were increases in Advisory Committee
dairy products (except butter),
eggs, meats, fish, poultry, citrus The Rev. pavid T. Davies, rect-
frUits, tomatoes, vegetable (leafy, or of Saint John's Episcopal
green and yellow) and sugars church in Plymouth, announced
and sirups. In contrast only half this week the selection of an ad-
as many potatoes and sweet po- vlsory comriritte which is to serve
tatoes and half as much flour and on the Building Fund campaign
corn meal are eaten now as com- in October. I

pared to 1909. 'Frank Henderson, senior war-
Increases m the eating of fresh den, is chairman of this commit-

fruits and vegetables is probably tee. The other members are J. W.
due to the advances in transpor- Cheetham of Northville, Henry J.
tation, refrigeration, merchandls- Christensen, Lewis H. Goddard,
ing and geography of production. Dr. John F. Vas and Robert D.
Fifty years ago available food Willoughby. Mr. Davies is an ex-
changed with the seasons because offlcio member of th~ committee.
penshables had to come from It is intended that the canvass-
nearby due to slow transportation. ing of mem'bers of the parish will

It seems today's average Ameri- take place on Sunday afternoon
can has replaced the high calorie and ev~ning Oct. 23. All services
counts of potatoes with those of on th'at Sunday will be devoted
fats. Although the food supply to developing spiritual values of
today is eight per cent lower in the building fund drive.
calories, a large portion of the.

1
_

calories comes from the use of
fats and OIls in salads and cooking
and from the so-called mvislble
fats m whole-milk dairy prod-
ucts, meat, 'Poultrv and fish.

MOl() of the carbohydrate sup-
ply comes from sugars and less
from potatoes and grain foods

And, the report continue~, many

of the diet changes are shifts
from the lower priced to the
higher priced foods. Some of these
higher pnces result from increas-
ed processmg of many foods. Even
though they are more costly, they
save the homemaker many long
hours m the kitchen.

Women's Dorm. 730,000 Hunters
Seen This Yearfor Alma' College . Ilansing, Sept. 28 - An esti-
mated 730,000 hunters will go to

Dr. John Stanley Harker, pres.i- Michigan's fields and forests this
d~nt of Alma college, announced
today that a contract for the con- year for the annual small game
struction of a new women's resi. seasons, some of which open on,

Idence hall costing aopproxim'ately Oct. 1.
$800,000 has been awarded to the Conservation DC'pt. leaders ex-

IMiller-Davis Co. of Kalamazoo. pect most hunting on the Satur-
The new residence naIl will house day opening will be for water-
207 women students. The build- fowl, ruffed grouse and deer by
ing includ~s also four meeting archery. A number of lesser sea-
rooms for sororities,. a large sons gets under way that day, but
lounge, small lormges on each most· generally draw only inci·
floor, a recreation room, a small dental hUl).ting. _
infirmary, and guest rooms. The The important southern Michi-
building is scheduled to be com- gan pheasant, squirrel and rab-
ipleted by Sept. 1, 1956. hit seasons don't start until Oct.

The fund for the new women's 20, but all three species may be
residence hall was initiated by hunted in limited northern areas
the college board of trustees. The starting Oct. 1.
gifts of trustees, individuals and Raccoon hunting also starts in'
foundations totals $500,000 to date. ---r-------------------------
The college will continue iw cam-
paign with the expectafion that EatabU.hed 1Ise. ID'he Nnrt'"'utll.e :mttnr~
it will be possible to open the ~p
new building d~bt free next Sep-
tember.

~ 4~'-- ~ 7.~~.=-~-:.-r tA~jf-m~ ~~~ rn-"
~

... A. l' '1 a •• _. .4 _

~ Get the best deal of your life on
~ a brand new Studebaker during the
~ 2nd big w~ek of our
'<(2-
~I·"-L

~

~.~
~

~

.
II. ~
I •

•

I
3
iii::cr.n
Zo

~
tI.l

I

~::cr.n
Zo
t&:I

~
Ia Slone's Gamble Store

~ Your HARDWARE 0:

~ "The Friendly Store, Where You~Buythe Same for Less" ~
~ 117 EAST MAIN I NORTHVILLE . PHONE 1127 tJl
U':l

f SAVEONSHELLS-SAVEONSHELLS-SAVEONSHELLS I

SAVE ON SHELLS -SAVE ON SHELLS -SAVE ON SHELLS

~&'~
flUNTERS 8, 'fifADQUARl

THIS WEEK'S SPECIALS
SHOTGUN SHELLS GUN CASES
12 Ga .• 16 Ga. - 20 Ga •• 410 Ga.

While They
Last

Priced al
ONLY ONLY

Suede Finish

98c Fi:l Most '
C:"llS

We Also Have Northville's Most Complete Selection of
RIFLES and HUNTING EQUIPMENT •
- Hunting Licenses Available Here -'

, "

. ,

. <
~ 1 , ~~~..,.:.t''''II;;\··YI~r'''!~I~~, ...

the north country Oct. 1, but in
the south, baying hounds and
midnight hunts. under harvest
moons won't get under way until
Oct. 20.

Wa1Jerfowling will depend pret-
ty much on the weather-as
usual-and duck hunting devot- -
ees prefer cold, blustery, gusty
days for their sport.; ;

All the state's 4000 license deal-
ers-hardware stores, Sporting
goods shops and farm stores-
have',been supplied with licenses,
duck stamps, Game Law Digests
and other information on hunters.
The Digest gives details of all
season regulations.

\0,

Usu-ally the man whO inherits
a barrel of money start-s right
out to whoop it up.

TO RENT-BUY-SELL
l'HONE 20D

$1.75
.07

Publhhed every Thursday morning £1d entered at the Northville. M1chlpn
POlt Office ao IOcolld cla .. matter,

THE NORTIiVILLE RECORD IS A MEMBER OF,
NATIONAL EDITORIAL ASSOCIATION AND MICHIGAN PRESS ASSOCIATION !.,

INATIONAL EDITORIAL~ IA sso cfi:A T II0.N
~~ ~J ....)

Subscription Rales In Michigan
One year ••••••••.•••.••• $2.50 Six Months ••••••••••••••
Two Years $4.50 Single Copy .

Outside Of Michigan:

WE HAD MANY SATISFIED CUSTOMERS LAST WEEK WHO
SAVED TREMENDOUSLY AT THESE BARGAIN PRICES! WE
KNOW YOU'LL BE SATISFIED, TOO!

t
,j

'I..

.,~
I,
r,~

Only

.<,,

Hottest Deal in Town!
New 19556·passenger
Studebaker sedan!

$149500

PETZ BROS.
OPEN EVERY NIGHT UNTIL 9

200 PLYMOUTH AVE. NORTHVILLE
PHONE NORTHVILLE 666 C!rPLYMOUTH 1480

,
~ {I ~ ~ , :r' ~1:I '. ~t lj t ~l l.

I •,.:~~~~r:t,...(,~~~~,:,J.r~Y.."h~ ~.&o;'t!.,,;1'~~~:M~~g.~~lN~?.£lial~~'.
,

f- r"'::.,.::I'1 ~ '4~~



- ,-

THE NOR'I1HVILLE RECORD-Thursday, September 29, 1955-7

PROPOSE FIRE AND POLICE MERGER
Calendar of Events More Homes

Schedule~ for
Willowbrook Area

NOVI
September 29-
AMVET Aux. banquet. Mayflow~

er hotel. Plymouth.
September 3D-
Square Dance, Novi Community

Bldg. Bubhc invited.
October 2-
BYF meeting at Novi Baptist

church, 6 p.m.
October .4-
Willowbrook Civic Assn. meeting,

8 pm., Novi Comm. Bldg.
Novi De<mocrats meet at Novi

Union Hall, 8 p.m.
October 5-
Board of Education monthly

meeting, 8 p.m., Newi school.
October 8-
Blue Star Mothers' Daisy Day.
October 10-
Blue Star Mothers' 13th Anniv.

dinner, Rotunda Inn, 7 p.m.
October 3D-
Bird trip to Canada, sponsored by

Novi Odillellows.

NORTHVILLE
September 29-
Physicians meet at St. Mary hos-

pital. ,
Lutheran lJadles annual bazaar-

luncheon, Parish Hall, 10 to 2.
MSU pot-luck, Farmington high

school cafeteria, 6:30 p.m.
Camera Club meeting, North. high

'School, Rm. 9, 7:30 p.m.
September 3D- (
Am. Legion Aux. bake sale, Mer-

ritt Ins., 125 E. Main, 10 a.m.
Rotary rummage sale, Nortlhville

Downs, 9 a:m.
October 3-
Past,Mamers night, Masonic Tem-

ple, 7:30; dinner, 6:45.
City Corrmussion meeting, City

Hall, 8 [pim.
October 4-
Methodist We s ley a n Service

GUlld, 8 p.m., with Jennie York,
628 Fairbrook.

OLV Mothers' club, 8 p.m. at J. J.
Gill residence, 18855 Haggerty.

Township Board meeting, Library
Bldg., 8 p.m.

October S- ,
Coordinating Council, 8 p.m. at

City Hall.
October 7- The A & A Asphalt Co. v:a~
OES 64th birthday party. Dinner j awa~ded the contr.act for pavmg

6'30 . ,10 clty: mreets thIS fall by the
Wo~a'n's club luncheon. Oakland City. Commission at ~ spedal

Hills Country club, 12:30. Im:etmg Monday ~venmg. The
Oclober 8- prlce quoted was $20,790.'
WixOm PTA dinner at Wixom r,l'he streets to be pavedi are

s.chool, 5~30 to B. [Oakland, Rouge, Novi, Carpenter,
Northville Zoning Bd. hearing, Grace, Lake, Rayson, N. Rogers,

Library, 8 p.m. Dubuar and Linden.
October 10-11-12-
DAR' antique show, 1426 Lilley

Rd., Plymouth.
October 11-
Am. Legion Aux. pot-luck, 6:30,

I follmved by business meeting.
October 18-
King's Daughters Fall Spread,

Mrs. Chas. Conklin, 321 W. Cen-
ter St., 12:30. Bring passmg
dish and table service.

October 19-
Citizenship dinner, ·LuH~eran

church.
Ociober 21-22-
Rummage sale, Methodist church.
October 27-
King's Daughters benefit card

party, Happy Acres, E. 8 Mlle.
November 1-
MethodiSt bazaar and'chicken pie

dinner.

SIxty-five new building permits
were recently issued for construc-
tion of residential homes in Wil-
lowbrook VIllage, according to
townsh~p officials.

The home~, which will be lo-
cated on hoth sides of Ten Mile
Rd., will be of contemporary de-
Sign similar to the houses>which
were recently huilt.

B. L. SmokIer of Detroit is the
builder and Paul LeBost will con-
tinue to hand,le sales and property
development il1Jthe area, it was
announced.

The majority of the new homes
will be built immediately south
of the present Willowbrook Es-
tates Subdivision No.2. A!pproxi-
mately 48 permits have been is-
sued for this area and several
houses were already well under
construction early this week. Vet-
erans Administration financing
will be available for these homes,
according to Carson Hollings-
worth, vice-president of the Le-
Bast ConstructIOn Co.

Seventeen permits have been
granted on the north side 'of Ten
Mile Rd., the houses to he built
on remaining vacant land in the
area. They" win l;OI!forml in size ....h G
and style, to the existing homes I I eater roup
in that area. ~rior to the ~ssuance Organizing At
of these permitS', 111dwellmgs had W·II b k
,been built. I OW roo

Upon completion of this latest The WilloWbrook Theater group
group of ho~es,. the total nu~- ,held its first meeting Monday
ber of dwellings I~ .the area. WIll evening and are planning a sec-
reach 15~. In add:tlOn, Hollm?,s- ond meeting Oct. 10 at 8 p.m. at
wort!I sal~ that hIS f~rm applIed the Weisberger home.
for fmancmg 95 addItIOnal homes Present at the meeting this
Monday. week were the Disnern, Nelsons,

.Eventual plans can, for betwe~n Cranes, 1Mrs. Sodel'berg, Mrs.
eIght and mne hundred homes m Brondstedter June Weis-berger
the Willowbrook area, Hol!ings- and Mary ~raigh.
worth a~ded, and th~ budders Everyone interested in amateur
a.re lookmg forw!1rd, to the erec- theater is urged to attend the
ilO~ of a shoppmg center next coming meeting, when it is plan-
sprmg. ned to elect officers and select

plays. Especially pointed out is
Pre-Nuptial Shower that those who come must not

necessarily have talent as actors
and actresses as well as many
other skills are needed. to stage a
play. Teenagers are also invited
to attend.

AMVET Auxiliary
Holds Anniversary
Dinner In Plymouth

Contract To Pave
10 Streets Let

FA"BRICATING AND ASSEMBLING ROOF
TRUSSES for new homes in Willowbrook was
well under way this week willi announcement
that approximalely 65 new building permits had

.,.
I-.:J . ,

Seek Answers To Rapid Growth
Problems Within Township

~h.e formation ~f a Novi departmen~ of public .safety,
combmmg the functIons of the present fIre and police de-

, partments, was proposed Monday night at a meeting be-
''L-~klll'!llli tween fire department officers and the township board.

In an effort to seek answers to present and fmure
growth problems in the area, the group agreed to seriously
study. the proposed merger of the departments. They also
unammously agreed to launch a more thorough training

I course m fire fightmg techniques.
Township and fire department

offlclals plan to visit the city of
Oak Park Thursday night to study
the "department of safety" plan
fJrst.Jhand. Oak Park is one of
several metropolitan Detroit com-
munities WhICh have had the
plan in operation during the past
few yearn.

"Through such a merger," said
Supervlsor Frazer Staman. "we
feel we might offer residents of
the area more dficient fire and
police protection for less money."
"All police officers," 'he added,
"would be known as safety offic-
ers and would be fully trained in
fire fighting as well as police
work."

Representing the firemen at the
meetins were acting fire chief
Fred Loynes, Homer Kent, Bill
McDermaid, Mike Smith and Don
Walters.
Keeping pace with the growth of

the are'll th~ tQwns4ip has r~5nt-
ly purchased an American La:
France fire engine at a cost of
awroximately $20,000. Dehvery
is eJ.."Pected early bhis fall, ac-
cording to Staman.

Fire engines, as well as police
~atrol cars, are now equipped
With two-way radios for instant
intercommunication.

been granted to B. L. SmokIer & Co~ Delroit
builders. The houses. similar in design to
existing homes in the area. are being rushed
lor late fall complelioll.

I

NoviMethodist r r--·_·o--.-~-:-tI
Ladies Will Go To 1 JI Nov.-, fBrighton Church

Ladies of the Novi Methodist f H- h,- hJ. The Novi DemocraJic ciub will
church are planning a trip to I 19 19 ~S hold their meeling at lhe Novi
Brighton Oct. 10 to attend a meet- , Union Hall on Novi Rd .. Oct. 4 a1
ing at which the Otto sisters from by Mrs. Luther Rix r 8 o·clock. Carlos Ricbardson.
Sagmaw will relate their experi- , chairman of the Oakland County
ences as missionaries in Africa. Phone Norlhville 245-J Democratic committee and Mrs.
The meeting is to be held at the r Bessie Weatherson, a delegate,
Brighton Me1hodist church. It Mrs. John Gow of'Ten MIle Rd .. will .be present 10 draw up the
will be preceded by a pot-luck undervvent a major operation at charter and by-laws for the club.
dinner at 1 o'clock. University hospital, Ann Al'bor,

The Women's Society for Chris- Wednesday.
tian Service of the Newi churah Jack Harnden is in Sessions
WIll serve dinner for the Novi hospital WIth a slIght heart attack.
Board of Commerce next Thurs- Last Thursday, Mrs. Floyd The Novi Square Dance club
day evenmg, Oct. 6. Mrs. Pitch- Darling accompanied her daugh- Wlll resume act1vities Sept. 30
ford and Mrs. Watza are in charge ter, Loraine, and Marilyn Sharpe with Floyd Snyder furmshing the Novi neighborhood girl scouts

ro East Lansmg w:here the gIrls music. met at the home of Mrs. Vincent
made arrangements to enter The dances, which are open to Haye.'>on 12 Mile Rd. Plans for
MIChigan State unversity. Mari- the publIc, Will be held m the the fall include some changes in
lyn WIll major in home economics Novi Community Bldg. There will leadership in the troops. Leaders
and Lorame In business admlDls- be modern, square and, round in charge are as follows: semors,
tralion. dances. Refreshments _ will be Mrs. Vi, Bellmzer; Intermediate

Mrs. Dal1ling gave a dinner par- availaole in the building. Troop No: 456 aJid No. 460 will
ty for 10 guests Sunday evening Additional square dance dates be combined and present leaders,
honoring her daughter, Loraine, for the coming year will be Oct. :Mrs. Dora Eby and Mrs. Oda
before she left for college. 28, Nov. 25. DeC.9, Jan. 7, Feb. 11, Bruns will be assisted by Mrs.

Mrs. W. C. Shambaugh of Car- Y.ar. 10, Apr. 7, May 5 and June 2 Marge F'Geppert. Intermediate
lyle, Pa. came back recently to Troop No .491 will be led by Mrs.
Novi with her daughter, Mrs Oddfellows Plan ViVIan Coleman assisted by Mrs.
Marie Travis, with whom she is Billie Hunt. The newest Inter-
now making her home. Bird Trip Oct. 17 l}1edlate Troop No. 492 will be

led by Mrs Ruth LaPlante and
'J1he Sunshine club met at the Novi Oddfellow Lodge No. 487 Mrs. Alice Ritter BI'ownie Troop

horne of Mrs. Andrew McCollum is sponsermg a trip by Greyhound No. 493 will be led by Mrs. Bon~
on Eleven Mile Rd. Wednesday. bus to Jack Mmers Bird sanctu- nie Dye assisted by Mrs. Gatrell .

Mrs. Wimfred McConnell is now ary at KmgsvIlle, Ontario Sunday, Brownie Troop No. 492 will be
a patient at the WhIte Hall Con- Oct 30. 1\lembers may make res- led by Mrs. Lulu Whittington as-
valescent home on E. Grand Rlv- I ervations by contactIng eIther I slsted by Mm. Marge MacGilli-
er. . IHadley Bachert or George Atkin-/ vary. A new brownie troon-,will

Mr. and. Mrs. KeIth Branch son Reservations must be m by be formed if there is a need. If
(Contmued on Page 10) Oct 1'7. (Continued on Page 10)

TO SELL · •. TO RENT • · ..TO BIRE •
________ USI CLASSIFIED ADS _

lPBONE NORTHVILLE ZOO

Amerman Retires As
Crippled Children
Society Director

School Superintendent Russell
H. Amerman this week attended.
his last meeting as director of the
Wayne Out..oconnty chapter, Mich-
igan Society for Crippled Child-
ren and Adults. He has been act-
ive in the Society's affairs and a
director for 16 years, during eight
of which he also served as trea-
surer. He has b~n vic€-lPresident
during the past year. Bet!ause of
,previous long service and pres-'
sure of businses, he tendered his
resIgnatIon as a direCtor some
time ago.

Miss Kathy Leavenworth was
ihonored at a miscellaneous pre-
nuptial bridal shower at the Navi
Baptist church Tuesday evening.

, ,
r~h~ilowbro~k .i
! by MRS. THOMAS MORRISON C
1 PHONE GReenleaf 4-2S2~ orner ii'

I J
The next Willowbrook Civic 23893 LeBost, were married only

Assn. meeting will be held al the four months ago and came to Wll-
Community Bldg. Tuesday. Oct. lowbrook from Detroit, where Mr.
4 at B p.m. Promo works for United Auto

Electric Parts Co. Mrs. Promo is
bookkeeper-secretary at Wyo-
ming Plumbing and Heating. Mr.
Prom~'s hobby is collecting coins,
of whIch he has about 150 books.
He attended Holy Redeemer
sC'hool m Detroit. Mrs. Promo is
from Pennsylvania.

Mr. and Mrs. Roman Wojcie-
kowski, 23971 LeBost, carne here
from Livonia. They have two
boys, Jack, 9, and Gary, 3. Jack
attends the new Amerman school
In Northville. Mr. Wo)ciekowski
is advertising manager for Vcr-
nors Ginger Ale. Just after mov-
,ng to Willowbrook he was trans-
i0r! ed to Gleveland so they WIll
be leaving shortly.

:\Ir. and Mrs. Wesley Alcorn,
23970 W. LeBost, moved .here
-rom DetrOIt where he is employ-
ed at Burroughs. They have one
son, Teny, who was four in June.
He takes dancing lessons In De-

Itroit. Mr. Alcorn's hobby is tele-
VIsion; his wife's are skating and
bowling. Th~y have recently en-
closed their carport as a garage.

:'vfr. and Mrs. George Ames,
41008 i\looring Side Dr., moved
h('le from Deltoit, where he

(Continued on Page 10)

The Novi Mothers' club gave
$50 to the teachers to use m their
rooms.

Roger Cheeseman and Bonnie
Bellinger are captains of the two
teams in the magazme sales con-
test. Grades SIX,seven, eight and I
nine make up the teams.

Lou Ann Casteel from North-
ville is the new pupil m the
fourth grade.

The newly elected officers for
t'he fourth grade room club ale
Holly Fox, president; Kathleen
Probst, vice-president; D:l\vn Mc-
Collum, secretary, and Diane
Eby, treasurer.

Roger Casteel has joined the
mornmg kmdergarten. Kinder-
gal tners are making paper mache
frUIt this week.

The thiJd graders are study-
mg trees, theIr kinds and uses.
They have on display a fine col-
lection of leaves taken from ['heIr
own home trees .

The fourth and fifth grade
elected the following officers for
their club: president, Pamela
Harnden; vicc"'President, Dennis
Paquette; treasurer, Frank Stein-
berger, and secretary, Virginia
Early.

The fourth grade pIrPils made
candles this week in science class.

Fifth grade news: The pupils
are studying chemicals in scien'Ce.

(Continued on Page 10)

,The Novi AMVoET Auxiliary
celebrated their anniversary at a
oharter banquet at the Mayf;lower
hotel in Plymouth Thursday eve-
ning. State President Mrs. Gladys
Seek of Detroit was the speaker.
The State P.R O. Historian Mrs.
Lucille Povlitz was also present.

" ~~--:"
• "'-..."," ~"'1'"

:~ :<.~~~
"- .."">-l"\

- ,,?
.. -4 ? ~;;

NoviBd. of Ed.
To Meet October 5

The regular meeting of the
Board of Education of Novi school
District No. 8 will be held in the
school office Wednesday, Oct. 5
at 8 p.m. This meetmg 1.9 being
held one week earlier than usual
in order that all board members
may be present.

Introducing this week:
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Parent, 23821

W. LeBom Dr., formerly of De-
troit. They have been married
four years. He is,a graduate of the
University of Detroit Law school
and works for ,Fidelity Casualty
Co:- in Detroit. Mrs. P.arent is a
graduate of Marygrove college.
Prior to moving to Willowbrook
she worked in the Oakman branch
of l\1whigan Bell Telephone Co.
Bridge is a favorite pastime of
both.

).olr. and Mrs.

~""''''''''''''''''''''lNovi School Notes I
.##,#########,###,#~###"#,,#,,.

~ester and Doyse Ward
A second generation business, Ward's Super Service Rebekah Lodge News

at Grand River and Beck Rd. has grown £l'om two small At the regular meeting Thurs-
. f t f t t:--':, d 1 t 1 day night, Noble Grand Grace

Pumps m ron 0 a grocery sore 0 a mo ern, comp e e y FISHING WAS GOOD J'n WI·I. F' b· h d h bl•rlS Ie onore t e past no e
equipped, automotiv~ sborVlR'cebcenter'd l\r W d th lowbrook Pond. according to grands. A very impressive tab-

Founded in 192iJ y eu en an yrza ar, e David. 14-year.old son of Mr. and Ieau expressing friendship, love
station and grocery store were originally located at Grand Mrs. Philip Barnes of Willow- and faith, the motto of Oddfel-
River near 12 Mile Rd. The Wards had moved to Novi from brook. The pond, while not ex. iowship, was put on by several
Detroit with their two sops, "f.,ester and Doyse. acHy impressive in size or ap· sisters.

In 1939 the Wards purchased 10 acres of land on the pearance. often yielded some ~ood Lunch was served afterwards.
southeast cornel' of Grand River and Beck Rd. and built sized fish such as the bass David The noble grand presented each
their present grocery store, installing several gas pumps is shown holding in the picture. ,past hoble ,grand with a lovely

near
' .one corner of the store. Slocked with fish by the former plant. Independent club will be

. owners, the pond was :recently held Wednesday, Oct. 5 at the
Ten yeal'S later. Lester and Doyse took over the fil1~ filled in to make room for addi. home of Mrs. Anna Ortwine,

(Continued on Page 10) tional houses. I 36910 Nine Mile Rd., Farmington.

THE QUICK, EASY WAY .
TO BUY· · ·

,\
:"4' I • ~,,"I)

"
, > \, ,

NoviGirl Scouts
Meet At Home of
Mrs. Vincent Hayes

Plan Square Dance
for Tomorrow Night

Patrol Boys Make Novi Roads Safe
-c "~l.1J

I;~","..
~
~
,'j

I,
'.

'1
1

+- .>

\...
MAKING SCHOOL DAYS SAFETY DAYS is
the job of these safety paixol boys at the Novi
Public school. Eighth graders Iwho volunteer to
serve for a year. these boys help make Grand
River and Novi Rd. safe for youngsters .on lheir
way to and Irom schools. In ,the fronl row, left
to right. are Patrol Captain Jerry Coleman and

his lieutenants. Orin Slader, Bob LillIe and
Bairon Slader. In the second row are Jack
Faulkner. Paul White and Carl Watson. In the
the third row are David LaFond. Steve Spisak.
Ronnie White, Johnnie Ledford and Willard
Sprenger. Teacher Richard Griffith is the
group's sponsor.

• • •
,,

,',



8-Thursday, S~ptember 29, 1955-THE NORTHVILLE RECORD -'0,

\

;,
1"I,

,. t
I'

!

miscellaneous For Sale Business Services
- -

miscellaneous For Sale (illi.sceUaneous FOI:Sale
.~'" ':~ .f-." ~. .mjscellaneous for-Sale

\ , . Business Se'rv;ces
%" to 2" PIPE, cut and threaded. ROOFIN?, siding a n ~ eav:s-/ IRISH setter puppi.es, 5 months LOST - Brmdle boxer, female. 1--------------ISCHNUTE'S Music Studio. PhoJle

Also over 500 pipe fittings and troughing. Also alwnmum sld- old. 51305 W. 7 Mlle. 17-18 If fWhereoahauts are known TRENCHING, septic tank lines, 21. 505 North Center street. 22tf
plumbing items. Clark's Hard- Ing. Aluminum combination doors .'. please call 654-J. 18x pipe and tile lines, footings;
ware. 107.109 N. Center. Phone and windows. Free estimate. FHA USED Spmets. Bargam~. Cl.ear- complete installation of septic PAINTING WANTED-Exterior
N . terms Baggett Roofing & S'di ance sale at Callahan s Plano LOST - Irish setter, female~ 501-' tanks and field beds. Foster Ash- and interior. Free estimates.

orthvllle 370. , 4St! North~ille 861-W. I l~tMart, just a few miles from high. !d red, 4 years old and female by, 19476 Maxwell ReI. Phone Phone CLue Carpenter, Com-
CASH waiting for your Rambler I 'Pl'l~es. 159204 Grand River, De- Insh setter puppy, 5, months old. 1157.,1 S8U fierce, E}l1pire 3·3435. tf

or top trade-in on a new 1955 ALWAYS the best in pure old trOIt. Open 10 to 9 dally, Sunday Last seen las~ Thursday.P.M. to-
Nash. West Brothers Nash, Inc., fashlOned cider since 1873. 1 to 6. _ 1,7-18 gebher at 7 MIle and Na'Pler. Dogs NEW and used sump pumps. We
534 Forrest ~ Ave., Plymouth. Fresh cider and hot doughnuts may have become f:eparatea. Both specialize in repairing all makes
Phone Plymouth 888. 47tf daily. Parmenter's Cider Mill, 708 DAMPING trailer, perfect for pets. Rewar~ for mforma~lOn or of sump pumps. George Loeffler

Baseline Rd., Northville. Come hunter, sleeps'2, 1100 Ibs. Only return, 61'30:>W. Seven MIle Rd. Hardware, 29215 West Five Mile
USED refrigerator, $49.00 up. Wide in and see our new store. 14ti $150 for quick sale. Can be seen ~hone NorthvIlle 1U9. 18 at Middlebelt> Phone Garfield

selection to choose from. North-' at 46132 Norton Rd. 18 '---------------12-2210. 34tf
ville Electric Shop, 153 E. Main. YOUR Northville Beauty Coun- GffiL'S size 14 winter coat, brown
Phone 184. 42tf selar representative is now and white check, brown velvet

Natalie A. Hilts. Please call 671-W collar and cuffs. Navy winter
for your cosmetic needs. 16tf jacket, mouton fur collar. Very

reason'a!ble. Phone 9. 18

TREE PRESERVATION
• REMOVAL
• FEEDING \
• CABLING
• BRACING
• TRIMMING
• SPRAYING

GREEN RIDGE
NURSERY

INSURED - RELIABLE
PHONE nSS·M

-- -- -------
HUNTING clothes. 1 pair trous-

ers, size 36; suspenders, cap,
socks, ThulIDla Pack boots, size
9. Used one season. 46090 Neeson
St. Phone 615-R. 18
1955 CROWN VIctoria, Fordo-

matic, many extras, low mile-
age, priced to sell by owner.
Phone 744-J. 18

miscellaneous Wanted -Authorized
TV SERVICE

We service all makes of
TV Sets and Radios
• Prompt Service
• Reasonable Rates

NORTHVILLE ELECTRIC
SHOP

153 E. Main Phone} 84

GATE BELTS, complete line, all
sizes and lengths for motors,

pumps, etc. Northville Electric
Shop, 153 E Main. Phone 184.

~

TO RENT: 2-bedroom house or
lower apartment, unfurnish-

ed. Must be in Northville. Mso
would consider buying house. No
children. Write Box 26, % North-
ville Record. 13tf

TWO 2 H.P. 3-phase electric mot-
ors. 35 ton hydraulic press. RUG and pad, 12x13lh; also 9x14

Novi Auto Parts, Novi. Phone rug, both in excellent condi-
-------------1 Northville 55. 16-17-18 Hon. New 670-15 tire. Can be

2 STA!ND--AR,-,-D-s-iz-e-sl-o-r-m-c-o-m-_'IBOATtrailer with winch. 45640r' seen at 18893 Valencia or call
bination doors and 8 storm 12 Mile Rd. Phone Northville 2 COIL springs for double bed. 939-J. 18x

2839-J. 43tf 216 N. Center. Phone 135.windows, seven screens. 601 01'- I I 18-19x COOLERATOR family size freez-
chard Dr. Phone 10168-J. 18x 4 GRAVE cemetery lot in Oak-I-------------I er, $125. Gibson elec'tric range,
SOFTEN1!}RSALT, nugget or fine. land Hills Memonal Cemetery. 2 COLEMAN floor furnaces, $45 $50. Stewart Warner refrigerator,

Clark's Hardware. 107 N. Cen- Phone 753-J. 17tf for one or $75 for two. GReen- $25. Complete unit controls for
tel' St. \ 18-21 leaf 4,0868, Livonia. 18)} oil burner, $75. SelhlT's porcelain

top kitchen table, $5. All in A-I
FIREPLACE wood, 39040 9 Mile condition. Plymouth 2756-J. 18x

Rd. Phone 940-Rll. 18H SBRINGER Spaniel puppies, 505
FURa~ACE and stove pipe and Grace St. Phone 694-J. 18

sUJPphes. Also furnace fiItters.
Clark's Hardware, 107 N. Center
St . 18-21

3·BEDROOM home on good resi-
dential street and close to both
public and parochial schools.
New heating plant. garage. Cy-
clone fenced yard. $14,000.

3·BEDROOM ranch home with
nearly an acre on semi·private
drive. Oil heat. fireplace. 2·car
garage. Lots of fruit and shade
:!rees. Near schools. $IS.750.

VERY NICE 2·bedroom ranch
home on 4 wooded and land·
scaped lots. This house in per·
feet condition.

LARGE 2-s:!oryho~e. 4 bedrooms,
1Y2 baihs. garage. Can be made
into fwo family income. Near
stores and schools. Needs reo
decorating and some repair.l.=============.
$10.000. reasonable down pay-
men:!.

2 1/3 ACRE. W. Seven Mile. $2750

5 ACRES. W. Seven Mile, $4000

85x85 LOT $IOOa

LARGE building site in Westview
Estates.

WE HAVE OTHER HOMES,
FARMS 81; BUILDING SITES

YARD leveling, dirt moving and
grading. Also tractor work of

all kinds. Plowing, discing,-har- INSURANCE JmtE Theft Lia-
rowing. Equipped with front load· bility, autoinobile: Mrs. 'F. R.
er. Call Northville 1174-W1. 3ti Lanning, 2J4 N. Wing. Phone

209. , 20tf
DEAD STOCK: Fo!' free pick-up

prompt removal of dead FURNACES cleaned, $7. Phone
stock, call DarlIng & Company, Northville 1231. Ben Nottingham.
collect. Detroit, Warwick 8-7400. 18

48tf ICANDID . WEDDINGS. Profes-
WINE devenport and chair, good -==------------ sional· cameraman for the dig.

condition, $25. A bargain, 19733 IN'IERIOR' and exterior painting criminating brid" and groom.
Maryland Rd. or call 2827. 18 and repairs. Window and wall GaffieId Studio - Commercia!,

washing, wallpaper hanging. Call Industrial. Pol'truturP. Phone
1951 CON'11JNENTAoLHo~setrail- Northville 906-W. 39tf Plymouth 72. 2t11 :~~;;~;;;;;;;;;;~~;;~~~~~er, 27 ft. Stove, refrJgerator,
toilet, shower, electric brakes. In lLAND contracts. Large or small. PAINTING, papeI'lng. Da:o, Mer-
excellent condition, $1600 cash. - Call Garfield 1.0550. Utf l'ltt. Phone Plvroouth 774-R.
Phone 1220-W3. 18x . 24t1
FORD V-8 motor and chaSSIS, 4 FENCE Building, any kind. All

good tires, $45. Ford 6-tube .work g u a l' ant e e d. Claude
radio and speaker, $35. 18~05 Hinchman. Phone 833-M. 47tf
Ridge Rd. Northville 918.J1. 18 CHILDREN to care for by the
HARDY MUMS _ 50 varieties, hour, day or week. Children's

25c and up. Will pot fDr gifts. Playhous.e, Eleanor ~ethloff, li-
Rainbow Gardens, Plymouth, censed director, 212 High St. Call
15594 Bradner Rd., near Five 1431. 43ti

------------- 1MIle and Phoenix Park. 14-20

AUTOMATIC
WASHER SERVICE_

WRINGERS· ROLLS. PARTS
Also Used Washers

Lawn Mower &
Garden Tractor Repair

PICK·UP &; DELIVERY

PHONE 883

GRISSOM
HOME APPLIANCE

Randolph - Northville
II

BOTI'tE gas. 20 and 25 pound
bottles. Your bottle exchanged.

First trailer back of depot. Sam
Dickey. 38tf

AUCTION SALE
of Household Goods

SAT., OCT. 1st
at 1 O'clock

at 137 Reese Ave.
South Lyon, Mich.

Joe Buscaino

EAVE!:;TROUGH and fittings.
Clark's Hardware. Northville,

Phone 370. 42tf

TOP soil, black peat humus. L
Russell Dirt farm, 42201 Twelve

Mile Rd. Call Northville 1281.
50tf

318
WA!LNUT dining room suite, ()b-

long table, SIX chairs and buf-
fet, $25. Call Plymouth 1433~W.

18 -BUILDING-
NEW HOMES

-REMODELING-
CUPBOARDS

,Licensed 81; Insured

RUG, 9x12, two glass st9rm win-
dows and screens, 22x16 and

24x20. Electric blanket, new. Call 1'================'
Plynnoubh 143-J or 199 Hamilton
St, Plymouth. 18

AWNINGS. Fine selection of Can-
vas, Aluminum and Fiber glass.

Porch railings. Fox Tent & Awn-
ing Co. Phone Normandy 2-4407,
Ann Arbor, or Plymouth 1672-J.

40tf

SELLING OUT!
All Nur~ery Stock
BELOW WHOLESALE
Evergreens - Shrubs

Pfitzers
Yew Spreaders

~ .$1.00 to $2.50
Shrubs - 75c Each

Grass Seed - Wholesale
Saturday and Sunday
42410 Grand River

East of Novi
Call Northville 596·M

ALUMINUM
Combination doors and
windows. Free elltimate-

, FHA te.:Ins ,
Baggett Roofing & Siding

46120 Frederick
Northville 861-W

STRAUS
Modernizing- Co~/

Phon~ Norlh.ville 982·Jl

BATHROOM fixtures-tub, bowl
and wash stand. Idea1 for cot-

tage. Used shoDt wave Hollicraft-
er radio, Series K29, AC or DC.
Call 341-R. 17-18 I

'\AUTHORIZED Moto Mower Sales
/ and service. Now is the time to ~
have your lawn mowers repaired
and sharpened. All material and
labor guaranteed. Universal Lawn
Mower Service, William Mairs,
Prop., Novi. Mich. Phone North-
ville 968-W2. 40tf

MATTRESS~S and BOX
SPRINGS of best grade mater-

ial We also make odd sizes and
do remake work. see our shnw
room at any time. Adam Hock
Bedding Co. Six Mile at Earhart
roads, 2 miles west of Pontiac
Trail. Phone Geneva 8-3855 Soutb
Lyon. 43tf

HAY, oats, wheat and oat
straw, 39040 Nme Mile Rd Call-

940-Rl1. 14tf------------1
HOOVER sweepers, new and re-

built. Also repair and service
r=======================i I all makes. Howard Moyer, Hoov-

er Sales and Service, % Schrad-
ers. Phone 623. 16tf

G. T. BARRY
BROKER

II6 Eas:! Main Slree:!
Office Phone 353

Home Phone 521 or 7
NorThville. Michigan

HAY. -First quality timothy and
clover, large or small quantity.

Also 2nd cutting alfalfa. OATS
and STRAW. Northville 475. 12tf

FOR SALE-
REPOSSESSED

Admiral Apt. Size
Electric Range

NEW
Contract Balance $13~.OO

J

Small monthly payments
Depositors State Bank

Northville, Mich.

- FOR SALE
FURNITURE

MOVll\G FURNITURE - Pianos
and electrical appliances. Mon·

day hrough Friday Call 565-J
·til 5 p.m .• after 5 p.m.. Saturdays
and Sundays included, call 692.

15U

NOVI CAB CO.
24·HOUR SERVICE

NORTHVILLE 2839-J

DYE model makers, overtime, top
rate, fringe benefits. Redford

Twp. KEnwood 5-0181. 18

EXPERIENCED grinders. Bene-
fits paid by company. Hospital-

ization, Sick and Accident, and
Life Insurance. Fullerton Manu-
fa'Cturing Co, 201 Mill Avenue,
South Lyon, Michigan. 18

2 FAMILY dwelling, $9,000. $2,500
down. 510 Randolph. 17-18

1956FORDS. I wish to serve you.
Why not deal with a former

resident of Northville? See or
call Tom Houghton at Ralph Ells-
worbh\ Inc., 30000 Ford Rd., Gar-
den City. Phone Garfield 1-1300.

18x

Listings Wanted
List your lake or suburban

properly with us
OTTO BAUER

2615 Union Lake ReL
EMpire 3·3017

Sales Representative:
Jane Marinoff
Farmington 1310·Jl tf

A-I PAlI\ITING and aecoratmg'I'============:::::::::==:=::::!
interior and exterior. Also wall

washing. Roy Hollis. Phone 286-R
26t1

CLYDE'S Painting and Papering.
My service;-your home beauti-

ful, 304 Plymouth Ave. Phone 306
Northville, Michigan. . 19tfNOTICE

I will not be responsible for
any debts contracted from any
one o~her than myself after Sept.
22.

WANTED
Automobile
Salesman

To Sell Chevrolets·Oldsmobiles
Salary plus Commission,
Demonstrator Furnished.

RATHBURN
Chevrolet Sales

R. ,BINGHAM
FLOOR SANDING
AND FINISHING

- Free Estimates -
Phone Collect • • •

Conimerce
Empire 3·8532

FO-R RENT
THREE

FINE LOTS
• 4 Room'S, llh baths, screen-
ed porch, small basement, oil
heat, nice lot, good location,
1 car garage. $9,000.00 WIth
$3,000.00 do~n.

• 2 Good building lots in Oak-
wood, 8Ox132.

• 1 Acre parcel on W. Seven
Mile Rd., on bus line.

• 2 Acre parcels. close in

• 2lh Acre wooded parcel on
Tower Rd.
LISTINGS WANTED AS I AM

ABOUT SOLD OUT

tf .,

I
t

New, Quiet,
Linden Court

89x139Y2 ..._-$2200
89x139Y2 --' .$1800

100xla9~' --$2200
avg.

46tfRESPONSIBLE student wishes to
do baby sitting. Phone 2926. 11ii----------- ..118

2 or 3 BEDROOM house in or
near Northville by responsible

~ly. Will furnish references.
Phone 499.J. 18x

WOMAN for gel1€ral housework.
Some ironing, two days per

week. References necessary, fur-
nish own transportation. Phone
Northville 846. 18

SOMEONE to stay with elderly
lady. Good home. Call 443-W.

18

Watch Repairing
IS OUR SPECIALTY
Swiss or American

BUILDING
MAINTAINANCE

Residential CommerciaI

Window Washing

WaDs Washed

Floors Washed and Waxed

Several 1954 Floor Models at
VERY LIBERAL DISCOUNTS

•
FRISBIE

Refrigeration 81; Appliances
43039 Gr/:lJ1d River

Phone Nor:!hville II8S
(I block east of Novi Rd.)

S·HIPLEY'STerms;
Reasonable

Down Payment
DON MERRITT

-Realtor-
125 E. Main Northville

Phone 966

WATCH REPAIR SHOP
Opposite A & P Store

2~BEDROOM house, unfurnished.
References. Phone 2854-J. 18x

2 NEW modern apartments. Call
Walter Wetzel, Northville 1439-J

18

FURNISHED and heated apart-
ment. Private entrance and

bath. Convenient for employed
couple. 642 N. Center St. Aipply
after 8 p.m. Thursday. 18

UPPER 2"bedroom furnished ap-
artment, hot water and he-at

furnished. Call 239-R Thursday
after 5 p.m. and Friday and Sat-
urday during the day. 18

MODERN apartment. Available
middle of Ootober. Phone 987-

W2. 18

BUILDING SERVICE CO.
Soulh LyonGEneva 8·2419E. M. BOGART

REALTOR •
MILTON KAATZ

Reasonable Ratei
CUSTOM corn picking. 39040 9

Mile Rd. Phone 940~Rll. 18tf
W·YEAR old Elan u ~a c t u ri n g

opening bran'C'h in this area
needs help, age no handicap. Call
GReenleaf 4-4091. Oall Saturday
between 9 and 1,1 a.m. 18x
3 or 4·ROOM furnished apart·
ment for young couple. Dec. 1st.
Call John Procter, GEneva 7·9145
after 6:30. HI-20x
COOK, woman. Experienced or

will train. No Sundays or holi-
days. Marquis Toll House, 335 N.
Main, Plymouth. 13t!

UPHOLSTERING and furniture
repair. Hutton's, 4270 Haggerty

Hwy. EMpire 3-4122. 51tf
IfMember of Western Wayne

County MuUiple Listing
Service

335 N. Center St.
PHONE 216 HERALD CLEANERS

QVALITY - ODORLESS - SERVICE
Dow Clean Method

l17E ALSO OFFER A COMPLETE LAUNDRY SERVICE
628 S. MAIN PLYMOUTH, MICH.

For free pick-up and delivery call Plymouth 110
Phil Hazlett, Driver

16.19

;--.....,.WHYNOT
-,:. SHOP

;;..
AT HOME
FOR YOUR
COSMETIC

NEEDS?

SOLD BY NORTHVILLE REALTY

~<

l'

ROOM for ~ntleman. 218 S. Cen-
ter. Phone 471. 18

SLEEPING room. 330 Eaton lk
Phone 711-J. 18·19

3-ROOM unfurnished apartment
with car port. Refrigerator and

stove furnished. Call 3015 after
3 p.m. 18x

MODERN 2-bedroom unfurnished
house, in town, to couple with

references. $85 per mont-h. Phone

IW8~M. ' 181'-......~~~~~5"""";~'=""'=1
ROOM for gentleman, 122 S. Rog-

1:... 1 ers. Phone 733-J. 18

HELP WANTED
• CHEFS
• SHORT ORDER

COOKS I

• WAITRESSES

ROSEBUD DRIVE-IN
40120 Grand River

between Haggerty anCJ
Seeley Road tf

TO BUY-RENT-8ELI.
PHONE liDO

COMPLETE LINE OF
DAGGETT Be RAMSDELL

COSMETICS NOW
AVAILABLE THRU YOUR

FULLER BRUS~
DEALER

H. CAMPBELL

ROADS - SEWERS
BASEMENTS - HEAVY GRADING
SURVEYS for Grade and Drainage

NOVI BUILDING SERVICE
44109 GRAND RIVER

NORTHVILLE. 783-J FARMINGTON 0502-J2
49tf

L
I
;
1

"~

221 North Wing St.
To Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Hannabargar who have moved here from
Inkster. Mich. The former owners, Mr. and Mrs. H. Adrian
Willis now occupy the new home they built on Sheldon Court
property purchased through us.

L. M. EATON C. H. BRYAN
139 E. Main St. Phone-129

Member Multiple Listing Service of Western Wayne County
Board of Realtors

>' •

'f

PHONE
NORTHVILLE 987.M12

• ','.. c. ',' /
q ((I"' ....... A ...... tt "'....:.... \ lJ 10\"

.$.')) •

'to.."J r~ .. hr -! ~....~'!~
... Ir~I·:I • ....:~.....t '''' ~ ... '" •

i- ~ ~ ~~,

s ~t.'ld' ..:!' ~ ,W~ll.. .. " ~ ..'Ii



- Bowling Scores -
ROYAL RECREATION

Thursday Night
Ladies House League

Team W L
Royal Recreation 9 3
Mich. Barn Dance 7 5
No. Four 6 6
Villa Dress Shoppe 6 6
Freydl's Women's Store 6 6
Brader's Dept. Store 5 7
Tewksbury.'s GeIn§.. 5 7
Depositors State Bank 4 8

Team high three games: Mich.
Barn Dance 2023, No. Four 2017,
Freydl's 2006.

Team high single game: No.
Four 738, Freydl's 733, Royal 699.

Ind. high three games: M. Kar-
natz 503, A. Merritt 446, R. Com-
er 436.

Ind. high three games: M. Kar-
natz 195, A. Merritt 181, A. Gray
169..

Holloway Canst. 5 7
Zayti 'ITuclcing 4 8
Eagles Areie 2540 0 12

Ind, high single game: Kimball
209.

Team high single game: Bailey's
933.

Ind. high series: Politz 562.
Team high series: Bailey's 2538.
200 Bowlers: Spaulding 201,

Kimball 209, J. Murray 221.

Camera Club Opens
Fall Meetings

;'

The Northville 35mm' Camera
club will resume its meetings
Se;pt. 29, with a business meeting
at the high school in Room 9 at
7:30. All merribers are urged to
attend. Club president Mm. Rob-
ert Dearing announced that from
tonight up to January, all meet-
ings will be the first and third
Thursday and will be held at the

Wednesday Night House League high school.
Old Mill Rest.' 11 1 The following week, Oct. 6, Dr.
Wolverine Pot.' 8lk 3lk W. J. Steininger from the May-
Stone's Hardware 7 I} bury San. will narrate for the
Thomas', Five 6lk 5% Eastman Kodak slide showing,
Sohrader's 6 6 Thursday evening at 7:30 at the
Famous Stores 4 8 high school, Room 9.
M'llrr Taylor 4 8 The illustrations throughout are
Gearn's Five 0 12 examples of interesting and ef-

High team series: Old Mill rfective pictures made outdoors at
Rest. 2606. night. The specific situations in-

High indo series: Bob Calkins clude how to photogr~ph scenes
600. with street lights, wet pavements,

High team game: Old Mill 875. 'burning ,buildings" floodlighted
High indo game: Bob Calkins 'building-s, fireworks, 1i g h tin g,

223. snow, and with pedestrians or
200 Scores: Bob Calkins 223, lighted vehicles moving through

201-600, Bob Stover 212, Harold the picture area. An illustrated
Thorne 210, Phil Brewer 209, Irv leaflet to be-given away at the

- Hansen 202. close of the lecture contains 27
examples of sulbject matter types
suitable for night photography.

As an added feature of interest
Dr. Steininger will show slides
on his trip through the Rocky
Mountain National park, north-
west of Denver.

Monday Night House League
Bailey's Dance Studio 10 2
Don's Jr. F.ive~ 8 4
Alessi Gen. Ins. 8 4
Freydl Cleaners 8 4
Northville Lab. 5 7

NORTHVILLE PUBLIC SCHOOLS
, Board of Education Minutes

. September 13, 1955
The meetmg was called to order at 7:30 'P.m. by President Robert

F. Coolman. ,
Present: R. F. Coolman. D. B. Severance, Mrs. H. F. Wagen-

schutz, N. C. Schrader, R H. Amerman.
AJbsent: E F. Clark.
Others ,present: James Littell, E. V. Ellison, Glenn Cummings

Alvin Skow, Allan Buckley, Robert Merriam and RJa1phHay of th~
Northville :rownship Board, Harry B. Smith, Richard W. Kay.

The mmutes of the last regular meeting and -a special meeting
were reviewed and approved as written.

Communications:
II. E. V. Ellison, expressing appreciation to the Board for the

re-modeling of his oFfices and inviting the Board to inSpect the of-
fice at their convenience.

2. Teen-Tours, InC., eXipressing the appreciation of that company
for the eX'Cellent ·behavior of Northvine High School Senior Class
on their trip to Washington in May.

3. Raynoor Roofing, advising that the cost of repairing the roof
of the new school will be $120.00.

. 4. State of'Michigan, a check for $721.77, representing vocational
ald. , "

. 5. Bids on folding chairs:' Standard School Service-$3.85 to .
$4.60 Marshall GOm'pany-$5.60 and $4.65.

6. Notice of~tate School Board Conferem:e oCt. 4-5 at Lansing.
7. U. of M., re transcripts of graduates, complimenting this school

on the scholastic background of Northville High School students
attending the University. . ,

8. Mrs. Davidson, requesting rental of Waterford School build-
ing for religious srevices for one week.

Mr. Amerman, Mr. Ellison, Mr. Smith and Mr. Kay then gave
the board a comprehensive report on the 'beginnin~ school situation
including the following enrollment figures; High School 648' Grad~
School (both buildings), 865. Mr. Ellison reported tha't th~ book-
keeping, home economics and art departments are especially over-
crowded. He requested the purchase of ten additional bookkeeping
itables, which he has room for, to enable him to take care of that
many more ,bookJkeeping students. Mr. Smith has an immediate need
for another 6th grade room and Mr. Kay needs six more chairs and
three 1st grade tables.

The Board authorized the employtJIlent of another teacher for
-11 additional 6th grade room and instructed the Superintendent to
\ rder the Ibookkeeping tables and the furnnure needed at the Am-
I tman School. •
• Mr. Smith requested permission to restrict use of the school

lunchroom to children who ride the buses or live out of town. Boarer
granted this ,permission on a trial basis. '

Board authorized the pUl'<'hase of a new Standard duplicating
machine for the two offices requesting them, the high school and
Amerman School.

The Superintendent placed the tax resolution before the Board,
with two suggestions as to possilble millage to be levied for 1955.
After some discussion Mr. Sevemnce moved that the 1955 tax rate
be set at a total of 1945 mills, consisting of 2 mills for 1949 Debt
Retirement, 3.5 mills for 1e54 Debt Retirement, and 13.95 mills for
General Operating Fund. The motion was supported by Mr. Schrader
and was carried.

Mr. Schrader moved and Mr. Severance supported the motion,
that the maximum rate of tUItion be charged to students from other
districts. This sets the tuition ch'aJ1gefor 1955-.56at $334.67 for ele-
mentary students, Of which the State will ,pay $157.00, and for high
school students at $376.50, of which the State will pay $177.00. The
motion was -carried.

Mr. Am~rman had requested permission to attend the M.A.S.A.
conference at Traverse City on September 19 and 20, and Mr. Sev-
erance made a motiQn that the superintendent be authorized to at-
tend this conference, accompanied by his wife, all exJj)enses to be
paid by the Board. The motion was supported by Mr. Schrader and
was carried.

Mr. Amerman acquainted the Board with the installation of
the Type "C" pwgpam of special education and asked the Board. to
authorize the employment of a teacher to take Mrs. Waterman's
place on the days when she will be working on this program. This
permission was granted. _

Mr. Merriam and Mr. Hay, of Northville Township, approached
the Board with a request that the Township be allowed to lease the
Waterford School building for use as a voting ;precinct and as a
township affice. President Coohnan appointed Mr. Schrader and Mr.
Severance to meet with the Townsh]p Board to discuss the prQposi-
tion and to reach some agreement with the Board as to rental fee,
etc. They are to report back to the next school board meeting.

Treas~rer's Report: the Treasurer reported the following re-
ceipts and bGlances:

Cash Received during August, 1955 ......•........... $44,687.95
Balance in Building and Sibe Fund, 8-31-55 ......•... 15,255.40
Balance in General Fund, 8-31-'55 ....•..............•. 69,804.93
Balance in 1936 Bond and Coupon Aecount, 8-31-55 250.00
Balance in 1949 Debt Retirement Fund, 8-31-55 12,170.73
Balance in 1954 Debt Retirement Fund, 8~31-55 26,741.63

Mr. Severance moved that the TrE"asurer's report be accepted
and Mrs. Wagenschutz seconded the motion, which passed,

The Auditing Committee approved Ibills and payrolls as follows:
Payrollst $18,926.27; Bills, $12,341.67. Mr. Severance moved that the
bills ana payrolls be paid, Mrs. Wa,genschutz seconded the motion,
Which was C'\Irried,

Mr. Allen Buckley discussed with the Board his views regard-
ing the condition of the football field and possible ways of improve-
ment. The Board explained the doivficulties and expenses entailed
in kee;ping up this playing field, but felt that present circumstances
do not justify additional eXlPenditures of any large amount at this
time. The problem was discussed at some leng'th and the Board ex-
pressed its appreciation to Mr. Buckley for the interest he has shown
in coming to talk with them about it.

Mr. Severance moved that the meeting adjourn at 1:30 a.m. and
the motion was seconded by Mrs. Wagenschut:.: and passed.

E. Jane Wagenschutz,
Secretary

.. pO ; ~

To you who've never
•

r
I

d •

IIlf

Frying Chickens
Beef Chuck Roasts

SHANK
PORTION

LB.
cA&P-oUR FINEST QUALITY

Pineapple Juic,
4 46-0Z. 99c

CANS .
AGAR'S SPICED, QUICK-FIX

Luncheon Meat
l~AOJ' 29c

Salad Dressing SULTANA. • • 2lR 39c
Bread & Butter Pickles 2 ljA~~' 45c
Dry Milk Solids w~~:r:~~SE 9t;.'?l- 23c
lona Tomatoes FLAVOR·FRESH 41m:t?l'47e
French Dressing ANN PAGI 1:o~~·2ge
Sauerkraut ~&P FANCY • • • • T~AOJ' 10c
LimaBeans ~tr~~r:. . 2 ~6;.~~.39,;
RED, SOUR PITTED

Cherries 2 16-0Z.
CANS

"SUPER-RIGHT" QUALITY

SMOKED
When you !:iuy liSuper-Right" smoked ham at A&P
you're sure of getting ham selected for fine quality
and processed to perfE'ction. And at this low price
you not_ only get high quality but top value, tool

10 TO 14 LB. AVG.

WHOLE HAMS or 49
BUTT PORTION Lb. (

COMPLETELY CLEANED
WHOLE OR CUT-UP lB

"SUPER-RIGHT"
BLADE CUT LB.

"~.~

B
r~jSUREGOOD-THRIFTY-PRICED 1

:>.~~'j
+" ~

~:~!Margarine 2 JT~S.35ci&.R4'*'-,",1\
~'"~;/ .
~~'>;I Pancake MIX SUNNYFIE'LD. •

Sultana Cocoa
Betty Crocker Bisquick
Corn Muftin Mix JIFFY • • • 8~Kg~·10c
Pork 'n' Beans SULTANA BRAND SifJ' 29c

I Comed Beef Hash ARMOUR'. '~fJ' 31c
Pie Crust Mix *PJi~~U~~'IiR 2 B:~S~D 25c
Corned Beef BOVRIL BRAND • • '~fJ' 45c
Chopped Beef ARMOUR'S 3 ~~~~.1.00
Green Giant Mexicorn 3 ~~~. 49c

fJ<~' 'Waxed PC!per CUT-RITE •••• ,~~-{[. 2Scr.; Hydrox Cookies SUNSHINE •• '~ifI'35c
i~·r~;Ritz Crackers NATIONAL BISCUIT 16-0Z. 33c
l '"I BOX

;~~:!DailY'DogFood •••• 10 J;.L~S 79c
;·~t: Daily Dog Biscuits •••• 2:K~~'31c
~ ~H ~

f ANN PAGE(; :
l;~~Grape Jelly . ~ ~~:.
[::" Turkey Pies BRA~AD~~~~ZEN 4 FOR 79c
r"' ~ O-Cel-O Sponges ~i~.. EA. 29c
1 Dog Goodies c~'i"RE~E...' ~'~J:'19c! ' Sunnyfield Oats QUICK COOKING 'l~K~7'17c

Post leasties •••••• '~K~~'29c ~
,. Cut Green Beans IONA • • 15JiW' iOc

40.0Z·25c• PKG.
16·0Z. 59c•• CAN
40-0Z. 43

• • PKG. C

Pork Lobi Roasts "SUPER-RIGHT" LB. 3ge Standing Rib Roast "SUPER·RIGHT" LB. 69c7-RIB PORTION , FIRST 5 RIBS

Pork Loin Roasts "SUPER-RIGHI" ;"';4 LB. 49c Boneless Beef Stew "SUPER-RIGHT" LB. 69cLOIN END ' __/:,

Spare Ribs "SUPER. RIGHT" " LB. 4ge Patti-Pak-Steaks FROZEN. • • 2 LB. 99c2 TO 3 POUND RIBS. • • • • • PKG.-
Skinless Frankfurters "S~r~R,fJ~~T" LB. 3ge Sliced Beef Liver TENDER LB. 45cNUTRITIOUS • • •
Pork Sausage "SUPER-RIGHT" " l-lB. 35c leg .0' Lamb "SUPER-RIGHT" LB. 69c• • • • ROLL GENUINE SPRING •• •
Thick-Sliced Bacon "SUPER·RIGHT" 2-LB. 1.09 Lamb Shoulder "SUPER-RIGHT" LB. 49cPKG. DELICIOUS • • •
Beef Roas's "SUPER·RIGHI" QijALITY LB. 4ge o R d T k YOUNG MEATY LB. 49cARM OR ENGLISH CUTS ven ea y ur eys 17 TO 22 LBS. AVG.

DELICIOUS FOR FRYING

Jumbo Shrimp S-LB. BOX
LB. 79c3.89

Fresh Whitefish COMPLETELY LB. 59cDRESSED • • • • • • •
Fish Fillets fRESH BLUE PIKE LB. 59cOR FRESH PERCH • • • • • • • •
Fresh Perch OR BLUE PIKE LB. 43cCOMPLETELY DRESSED • • • • • ••

Flame Tokay Grapes
Head Lettuce 2

*Because meat represents about 25% of
your food budget, ii's important to know
• • • A&P's "Super-Right" Quafity is a reliable
standard of top meat value.

"Super-Right" assures you that whatever
you choose at A&P is Quality.Right • • •
ControlJed-Ri~ht ••• Prepared-Ri~ht ••• SoId-
Right and Priced-Right.

LB. 10e
24-SIZE 29cHEADS

• • • 48 LB.
BAG 9ge

• • • •

"

-Mich. Potatoes
Ripe Bananas • • 2 LBS. 2ge• •

All Detergent. • • • 10-LB. 1 99PKG. •

• •
WORK FREE, EASY·FIX FROZEN FOODS

YOUR CHOICE LIBBY'S CHICKEN, BEEF, APPLE OR CHERRY

5•• 4 79c

• • •
........ ~"...,

Cleanser - ~'LD DUTCH • • • •

Frozen Pies
Orange Juice
Cauliflower
Garden Peas

liBBY'S
FROZEN

LIBBY'S
FROZEN •

LIBBY'S
FROZEN

5 gfJs 83e
2 IO-OZ. 49"PKGS. '-'

2 10·0Z. 39cPKGS.

FOR
• • •

~~,rF......;..v- ......~ ,.

Chili Sauce HEINZ

Vegetable Soup HEINZ •• 2 ~~~~.
Tomato Soup HEINZ... 3 l~~~Z. 35c
(

White Vinegar HEINZ. • • • B~~.
J ~-:~"":---t~ .i\' r-

,Ci~er.Vin,g~r_~~~~~.._.~

• • • l'l·OZ.
BOT. 39c

27c

••••
• • • • •
•••••

JANE PARKER BAKERY TREATS
JANE PARKER-DELICIOUS, 8·INCH SIZE

Blackberry Pie 490~NUE 39c
REGULAR 39c VALUE

Spanish Bar . . ONLY 29( I

White Bread GU~~~~T~~~K~\SH m1~'17e
C• B d JANE 16·0Z. 23cInnamon rea PARKER..... LOAF

P k• p. JANE PARKER S·INCH 4geump In Ie SEASONAL FAVORITE SIZE

Sandwich Cookies ~t,r~:~::li~.. ci:~223c
Dinner Rolls JANE PARKER ••••• J:~217e
Twin Rolls BR~:~ f:'R~i:VI ••• cfFK~2 1ge
Cinnamon Breakfast RoUs ••• b~G9 29c
P Ch• JANE PARKER 12·0Z. 59olato IpS FRESH, CRISP • • • • • PKG. e
Jane Parker Pies cHOrgi ~~p~rERRY S~~iH 4ge
Glazed Dlnu's JANI PARKER • • • • J:~23ge

Heinz 157 Sauce • • a·oz. 31c• BOT.

LIBBY'S .." ""FROZEN •••••
LIBBY'S
FROZEN •••

LIBBY'S
FROZEN ••

4 ~~~~.9ge
3 ~~~.79c
2 ~~:.. 39c

• •

." I ,
~ 1_ / J

QT.
• .• • BOT..,..' .

~ ~~iiJ

23c
33c

• •
Spry • I-LB •

• •••• CAN

Strawberries
Red Raspberries
Mixed Vegetables

DELIGHTFUL DAIRY PRODUCTS
AMERICAN PROCESSED CHEESE FOOD

Ched-O-Bit
2 P~G. 69t:

SUNNYBROOK-GRADE A MEDIUM

Fresh Eggs . . . DOZ. 59c
Cream Cheese PHILADELPHIA 0 • • 2 :K~~:29c
Silverbrook Butter QJ~~~TY.... plR~~T63c
Sliced Swiss Cheese WISCONSIN I •• LB.- 5ge
New York Cheese SHARP CHEDDAR.. lB. 6ge
Mild Cheddar Cheese WISCONSIN LB. 4ge
Risdon's Cottage Cheese ••• 2 C~N. 43c
Ice Cream C~~T~~::o"~T~~A SLl~E~:kcK 85e

All prices in this ad effective thru Sat., Oct. 1
~-..... AMERICAtS FOlfMOST fOOD RETAIL!••• I SINCe 1159



...-........ ... ..,.~ ..--'.

lQ-Thursday, September 29, 1955-THE NORTHVILLE RECORD

Willowbrook _ I
versity of Iowa, Mrs. Soderberg
had one year at the University
of Colorado and one year at the
University of Iowa where she
met her husband. Mr. Soderberg
is a Sigma Chi and she is a Kap-
pa Delta.

Mr. and Mrs, Angus Ferguson
of 24401 LeBost Dr, are former
residents of Detroit. Mr. Fergu-
son works for Sealtest Creamery
and has been a mIlkman for 30
years. Mrs. Ferguson worked for
Awrey bakeries as a store man-
ager until she recently gave up
her job to live in Willowbrook.
They have three married child-
ren and seven grandchIldren. Mrs
Ferguson has a collection of Royal
Doulton figurines as a hobby. The
Fergusons went to Scotland for
three months last year to visIt
relatives and friends. It was their
first tnp each, since they came tD
Arner1ca. They flew both ways.

Mr. and Mrs. Chismark of Le-
Bost Dr. are entertaining a ftiend
this week end from Australia.
He is John Cwnmings who works
for the dIplomatic service in
Washington, D.C.

Mr. and Mrs. Weiss of Mooring
SIde wele to entertain a few
friends Saturday, Sept. 24 at a
dinner party, which turned out
to be a surprise party. Theu'
guests were Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Heuman of St. Clair Shores, Mr.
and Mrs. Arthur Bogue of De-
troIt and Mr. and 'Vlrs. John Dor-
m of DetrOIt. l1helr guests sur-
prised them WIth a beautiful
floor plant and wrought iron
brass holder. They played pino-
chle after dmner.

Mr. and Mrs Dick IVlJller of
LeBost attended the Notre Dame
football game last SatUlday at
South Bend, Ind.

The Weiss entertained friends

(Continued)

works in the Ford Building as a
barber. They have four children,
David 7, RDlf 6, George 2 and
Marilyn 1. Mr. Ames' hobbies are
golf and bowling; his WIfe's are
carpentry and woodworking. She
has made several articles for their
home, including a cDcktail table,
what-not, a rocking horse and
sand box for the children. She
admits havmg designs for remod-
eling the cupboards and closets
in the house. Her training In

woodworking came from a shop
course taken at HIghland Park
high sehool. She also enjoys knit-
mg and se""ing. In addItion to
being a practical nurse who train-
ed at St. Luke's hospItal m Mar-
quette and worked at Herman
Keifer hospital, she IS intere~ted
in PTA actIvities here.

l\Ir. and >'.Irs.Charles Soderberg
of 23898 W. LeBost Dr, are for-
merlv of ;\1inneapo lis. l\Ir. Soder-
berg' worked for the St. Paul In-
surance Co. In DetrOIt. They have
been marned three years and
have one daugh,ter, C) nthia, who
will be one year old in October.
Ml' Soderberg's home is In SlOUX
City, Iowa and MIS. Soderberg is
a ChIcagoan. HIS hobbles are
building, refmishing furniture
and radio work, whlle :1I1rs.Sod-
erberg likes to sew and also re-
fimsh furmture. TheIr three pets
mclude a col11enamed "Connie",
a Persian cat, "Smoky", and a
parakeet named "Lou". They are
staming and refll1lshmg all theIr
own furnitUle for theIr new home
?vIr Soderberg does engllleermg
audltlllg for hIS company in St.
Paul. He is a graduate of the Uni-

CARLOAD
PURCHASE

EXCITING NEW

..
f

~ .. .I'

)

..... t'l:-" .. r::.........,,"'.. AA.J'}NJI. ~.".~) ~ .. ~

",$ ~ , ............ ~ ...

< •

2 SPEAKERS! 23 TUBES!
Aluminized Picture Tube - 273 sq. in.

CHECK THIS! $100
FOR YOUR OLD SET

regardless of size or condition

PLUS
2,295

OPEN MON., THURS., FRI. 'TIL 9

o
S9S FOREST COR. WING

Plymouth, Mich. Phone Ply. 811

(Continued)

spent the week end at the form-
ers' parent's cottage, Mr. and Mrs.
Ed Branch, at Crysbal lake.

Last week end Mr. and Mrs.
George Kahrl were the guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Branch at
their cottage at Crystal lake near
Stanton.

Mrs. Hadley Bachert, Mrs. Roy
Marshall and Mrs. Gale Enders
entertained at the Bachert ~ome
hnnorlllg Mrs. James; Frisbie on
Wednesday evening.

Mrs. Hevbert Tucker is in the
Detroit Osteopathic h 0 s pit a I

~~I~~~~n~heunderwent a maJor op- Novi Girl Scouts _. _ Novi School _
Mr. and Mrs. Trickey enter-

tained a group of 32 guests at (Continued)
a picnic supper on their terrace )'our girl is seven years old or
last Sunday. They were Mr. and will be seven this year, please
Mls Carroll Kay and children of call Mrs. Hayes SDher name can
Grosse Pointe, Mr: and Mrs. May be placed on the waiting list.
and children of HIghland Park, Used uniforms were discussed
~1:r. and Mrs. Robert Johnston and all uniforms are to be turned
and chIldren of'Detroit, Mr. and in to the leaders with the price
Mrs. Chester Benton and chIldren listed for sale. Training will start
or Allen Park, Mr. and Mrs. next week for both brownie and
Charles Ward and children of De- intermediate leaders. A special
trOlt and IIII'. and Mrs. John Da- craft session is available Sept. 27
genai of Livoma. at the home of Mrs. Watson in

This week Sunday, Mr. and Royal Oak at 2 p.m. The first
Mrs. Oharles Trickey had a fam- brow me and scout n1eetings wi'll
lly gathering at their home on be held Sept. 28 after school from
Fonda St. The guests were Mr. 3:30 to 4:45. The next neighbor-
and Mrs. Duane Bell and their hood meeting IS scheduled for
thlee chIldren, Dr. and Mrs. Mar- Oct. 12 at the school prior to the
vin Blaers and two daughters of scout meeting.
Grosse Pointe and Mrs. Blaess' An outdoor institute for all girl
mGother,P~r:' Conka, also of scout leaders will take place at

losse om e. \ Ind18n Wood Day Camp Oct. 11
~r~. Edna Hill of Novi.an.d Mr.s Ifrom 9;30 a m to 2:30 p.m. Regls~

Mattie McLaren of CalJforma tratlon 1Sno later than Oct. 3 to
were luncheon guests of their GIrl Scout Headquarters at Royal
SIster-in-law, Mrs. ~ames Erwin, Oak.
at Rotunda Inn, Pme lake, last I
Sunday.

Mrs Ina Bailey is"' the' new Prosper-Ity Peace
manager of the Novi Repair shop ,
which opened for bu&iness Sept. P -bl - W Id
20 from 9 to 6 daily exec.ept Sun- OSSI e In or
day .Mr. and Mrs. BaIley and ,
theIr four children have lived at SUM W -t
26285 Nnvi Rd. for ~he past eight ays· n er
years.

Mrs. Luther Rix will be stay-
mg at the David O'Leary home
in Kew Hudson while her daugh-
ter, 1\Irs. Betty O'Leary, is a pat-
Ient m New Grace hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles S. Craw-
ford of Soutrh Lake Dr. took a
color tour throughout northern
MIchigan and the Upper Penin-
sula for a few days last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Oharles Crawfol'~
were Sunday dinner guests of
Mr. and Mrs Ernest Edge at their
Lakeland Ave. home.

Novi Highlights. - •

(Continued)
In connection with this study
they made a cake which Mrs.
Darling, cafeteria manager, bak-
ed in oller oven. The following
brought materials for the cake:
Ginger Cheeseman, Carol New-
,begin, Brenda Cobnun, Lois Bar-
ton, Rita Crawford, Lana Whis-
tle, Carolynn Maiers and Sharon
White.

Correction from last week: Jeff
Crawford is toilepresident of the
fifth grade.

The sixth grade decided to
name_ the club the "4 Plus 2"
club. The new officers are presi-
dent, Frieda Angel; vice-presi- 11:===================================================dent, Michael Ross; secletary, I'
Donna Lien, and treasurer, Greg
Larson.

The sixth grade project this
week is making science note
book covers. They are the hing-
ed ty.pe note books and are ['ov-
ered with oil cloth, shelf paper
or hand made art paper.

Donna Lien and Michael Ross
are 8!bsent from the sixth grade
because of illness.

The seventh grade class elected
the following oJlficers: president,
Bill TrDtter; vice-president, Dan
Triplett; secretary, Mike O'Nlel,
and treasurer, Mike Eby.

Meet Your Merch~~t~u·e~; I
'ing station business and moved' it to a new building just
east of the grocery store.

Lester, 26, married the former Diana Brunner of Ply-
mouth. They live at 25275 Novi Rd. with their three child-
ren, David, 6 months j Debbie, 3, and Ronald, 8.

After attending New Hudson and Northville high
schools, Lester served in the army for several years. An
ardent golfer if and when he has time, he is also a member
of the Presbyterian church. '

Doyse, 28, married a Detroit girl, Jo Ann Huntley.
They have one daughter, Denise, 4, and live at 27053 Wix-
om Rd. A graduate of New Hudson high school, Doyse was
in the navy during the ·war. A licensed pilot, Doyse pilots
his own plane during spare hours.

pL ..,J ~s

reseeded their lawn. They are
also enclosing and making theIr
carport and storage space larger
and are ,planning to paint and
remodel their patio.

Pastor J. A. O'Neill of the Novi
Baptist church has given a spe-
cial invitation to the people of
Willowbl'Ook to come and visit
their church in Novi.

Ann Al,bor - .A world of peace
and prospenty is possible, pro- DEER TAKE WINTER GARB
vidcd "men turn their minds and Lansing - Fawns will have
hearts to the soluhon" of the lost their spots and velvet will be
problems of war and depressions. gone from the antlers of bucks

ThiS is the conclusion reached by the time archers take the field
by J. Philip Wernette, professor Oct. 1. . .
of business admimstration at the Recent Conservation Dept. fIeld
Ulllversity of Michigan in a reports indicate the herd is tak-
book, "The Future of A~encan I in? .on winter gal'b with bu:ks
Prosperity" published by the shmmg antlers and pawmg
Macmillan Co. ground while waiting for fall mat-

Professor Wernette says "major ing .battles.
. . FIeld workers count deer at

depresslOns can be prevented 111 • ht b "sb··" 'th spot
the future by the combined ac- mg y mmg WI .-
tions of private enterprises and ~Ights and .have chance to exam-
government." For the government me the al1lmals.
he recommends the establishment -------
and operation Df a "functional
fiscal monetary system" w h i c h
would supply an appropriate mon-
ey supply, properly timed, to pro-
vide an adequate market for "the
huge and growing stream of goods
which an elCpandmg economy can
produce."

On the subject of war and may disappear from the face of
peace, he said a world race is the earth in a fmal holocaust."
going on-a race, between coop- In the 262-page book, which is
eration and catastraphe. "Men of well supplied with charts and
good will have only one CDurse- ta'bles, PrDfessor Wernette re-
that of supporting world coop- views the economic history of the
eration. Without that, the fragile] past and present and takes a look
thing w.hich we call civilization into the future. •

Ever wonder why after dinner
s;:Jeakers are usually men? Wo-
men can't wait that long.

A woman has reached middle
age when her shoes pinch her
more than men dD.

S. L_ 8 R A 0 E R 'S Dept. Store
FEATURES EARLY FALL ITEMS

MEN'S
MEDIUM WEIGHT

Union Suits

MEN'S

Sweat Shirts
Navy. Red, Grey, White.

A real value at Short or long sleeves .

The well known Hanes
Brand at

Baptist Church News
Next Sunday, Oct. 2 the Lord's

Supper will be observed at ,.Novi
Baptist church.

Sunday evening at 6 the B.Y.F.
will meet at the church for their
first fall meeting.

Most talked about woman is she
who leaves the meeting first.

It won't strain your eyes to
look on the bright side of things.

fREE SUllVEYS AND EHIMATI:5
OIL BURNERS • OIL fURNACES • OIL BOILERS • WATER HEATERS

OTWELL HEATING
Complete Timken Service and Fuel Oil Contracts
882 N. Holbrook at R.R., 2 blocks east of Depot

Sure to
Score
with
You!

Choose your fall
sporls shirts from
our latest fashions.

Deep tones and patterns 39Sin cotton. rayon. and
cotton llannel.

tOKJllllll_

FREYDL Cleaners and Men's Wear
112 EAST MAIN PHONE 400

$1.69

$2.39MEN'S

Flannelette Shirts
SpOl·t or regular style.
Chec!l:s, Plaids, Patterns

MEN'S

Corduroy Trousers
Heavy Duty Quality.
Brown or Navy Blue.

at $2.39

MEN'S

4-Buckle Arctics
Ball Band Brand.
Medium weight at

$5.95

$4.95

Laundry and Dry Cleaning

PERFEC"'Oll
LAUNDRY &: DRY CLEANING CO.

DON McCALDER - DRIVER
Expert Dry Cleaning and Laundry Service in our

modernly equipped shop.

- 2 DAY SERVICE ~
Expert tailoring and dying Pick.Up and Delivery

875 WING ST., PLYMOUTH - PHONE 403

MEN'S DRESS

Sport Shirts
Long sleeves.
Plain colors,

plaids and patterns.

SWEET
CIDER

CLOVER
HONEY

MEN'S 2·PIECE

Underwear
MEDIUM WEIGHT

SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS

at $1.25
ANKLE LENGTH

DRAWERS
Elastic Waistband

$2.95

QUALITY
'APPLES

,

l
'j
j
I

MEN'S

Pullover Sweaters
1000/0 Orlan.
Long sleeves.

High tone shades at

$5.95

Mcintosh - Jonathan - Snows - Wolf River

SPICER ORCHARDS
40001 Grand River. 2 Miles East of Novi

GReenleaf 4·1379 Open Daily 9 to 7

WANT
ADS

Want to buy sell, rent or b'ade something? Want to

, hire somebody? Looking for a job - a home- a spec-
cia! service? Lost something? . Found something?

You'll find the happy solution to your problem in the

the Want Ads!

.
.'"

$1.59

s. L. BRADER'S
DEPT. STORE

Open Thursday - Friday - Saturday Evenings 'Til 9

When you want to BUY, look where people advertise

what they have to sell. When you want to SELL, ad-

. vertise where people look for what they want to buy.

The classified columns of ~his pa-

per will serve you well BOTH

ways.
Read the Wand Ads for the best
buys at the lowest prices. Use' the

want Ads to get the fastest sales

results at the lowest advertising

cost.

You can get a 17 word ad for

only 50c • • • and the following

weeks are even cheaper.

DON'T DELAY
Call Us

TODAY!
NORTHVILLE

200

144' ''''t-



, ,'.., .....

'~. :~~~~}~t"~ ~{----~~
au: •

82 YEAR OLD PARMENTER CIDER MILL DRAWS VISITORS

A, I

Visitors from far and near flock
to Northville's 82-year-old Par-
menter Clder MIll with their
children at this season to watch
the mIll in operation and enjDY
the tangy flavor of the fresh cider.

One of the oldest busmesses in
Wayne cDunty, the mill has been
operated cDntinuously since 1873
by the Parmenter family. FDur
generations, starting with the
founder, B. A. Parmenter,C have
found cider making a business to
their liking. As with the NOlth-
ville Spring, it gives the city a
flavDr renllnISCent of Dlden times.

B. A. Parmenter, known to
everyone as "Madge", ran the
mill alone until 1895, when his
son, W. A., became a partner.
"Moadge" retired in 1920 and W A
("LDnny") took over full opera-
tiDn. \A son, Harold, known as
"Cider", helped the father, and
later his mother after the father's
death in 1948. The present owner,
Harold's son, Robert, became in

1953 the fourth generatiDn to op- I
erate the mIll.

When the mill started apples
came IDose in the wag-on box and
had to be shoveled into tanks of..
water tD be washed; then crated
and earned il]slde. About 1910
scales were installed to weigh the
apples and eliminate the labor of
crat1l1g but it was not until 1947
that the present electrically driv-
en conveyor belt was installed to
carry the apples direct to the sec-
ond floor without manual labor.

The original CIder press was
operated by horsepower for the
first two years. Then a steam
threshing machme engine took
over to be replaced eventually
by a stationary steam engine. In
1910 the steam engine was re-
'Placed by an electric motor whIch
is still In use.

This year Robert Parmenter has
'finished off a retail stDre in knDt-
ty pine and insfalled tables and
a doughnut machine for the CDn-

liiii •••••••••1 venience of customers who WIshI to SIp theIr Cider Dn the SPDt.

leS have become important mem-
bers of the hospital team, accord-
ing to Mrs. Carolyn Seefeldt,
director of Social Service. They
ass~st in recreational projects, oc-
cupational therapy, at ward part-

I
_

ies and helpmg individual pat-
ients. They work closely with
members of the various hospital
departments and attend some of
the hospital staM meetings.

Although trucks ~ather than farmers' wagons now bring apples to the Parmenter Cider Mill in North.
ville. the methods and product are still pretty much fhe same as when the original mill (above) was
buili by B. A. Parmenter 82 years ago. The mechaniz ed conveyor carries them to a 2nd floor storage area.

Tons of apples come to the Parmenter mill daily during the busy season fo be pressed and have their
juice extracted as delicious flavorful cider. The mountain of apples above will be washed. then moved
by a conveyor belt to the hammermill to be ground inlD pulp ready for pressing to exlract their juice.

:.

mqr Nnrtqnillr m~tnri\
S"ECO~D OLDEST NEWSPAPER IN WAYNE COUNTY-EST. 1868-Thursday, September 29,1955-11

INorthville State Hospital Seeking
I Additional Gray Lady Volunteers

Each e/edric dryer 10ad jf genlly Ivmbled dry. , ,
rarl. fluffy, remarkably wrinkle.free

35,000 Archers Will
Hunt Deer Oct. 1

Michigan's 43.000 safefy patrol
boys guarded their ,posts last year
without a single school child fa-
tality at a school crossing. They
couldn't have oerformed the feat
without the ~ooperaiion of the
pupils. Therefore. Automobile
Club of Michigan asks parents to
urge their youngsters to help
their safety patrols by continu-
ing to cooperate. Auto Club also
reminds drivers to be e'Ctra cau-
tious near schools. at both oatrol-
guarded and unguarded crossings.
To bring this message direci to
the Michigan school children.
Auto Club has distributed almost
1 LOOO fuH-'size copitls of this
poster to educational institutions
throughout the state.

Lansing - Sept. 28 - An esti-
mated 35,000 archers will go!
afIeld during the Oct. I-Nov. 51
bow and arrow deer season this I
year, a record high for one of
i\!Iichlgan's fastest grDwing sports

Last year, 33,000 hunted WIth
,bow and arrow and the year be-
fDre, 31,000 archers went afield.

Admittedly, not many of these
huntElrs wl11 bag theJr deer. Last I
)'eoar, 5% percent tDted home I
whitet:lils and &uccess the year I
before was abDut the same. But
some attractIOn beyond venison
in the pot keeps drawing new
members to the bow and arrDW
clan.

The fIrst archery license was
sDld in Michigan in 1937. Each
year since, with the exception Df
the war years of 194-2and 1943,
has seen a sizeable Increase In
the sport.

the applicant's physician and per-
sonal references. The training
course win be conducted at the
hospital and is followed by a 35-
hDur probationary period. Gray
Ladles are asked to serve a mmI-
mum Df150 hours a year and pur-
chase theIr own uniform and
shoes.

The Gray Lady ServIce at
NorthVIlle State hospital was es-
tablIshed m Seoptember, 1952, and
since that hme, the 1~ Gray Lad-

140,000 of your neighbors use

\

IISUPER CHALLENGER"
OIL HEATER

AVllilabl1l In .hru difFerenl sizu
for plenty of hat In small, medi.
um or larg8 homel.

11 WAYS BETTER
The finest moderately priced oil heater ever built. Ex.
elusive 100% air-tight all·{.yeldedconstruction assures you
of longer hfe. maximum safety, The exclusive patented
"Smokeless" Burner produces more heat on less fuel. The
exclusive built-in "Heat-Saver" saves fuel by reducing
chimney heat loss. Compare and you will buy a Quaker
"Super-Challenger."

STOP Lansing - Twenty-three lhous- J
and pounds of carp were removed
from the RaIsin River at 'recum-j
seh recently.

The rough fish had grubbed out,
vegetation and roiled about 11,~
mIles of the river so game fish
had little chance to grow. A POl-
SDn, applied by tramed CDnserva-
tIDn Dept. personnel, kIlled Dnly
a small number of undersized
bass, pIke and panflsh

FIsheries workers ran similar
experiments recently on waters
near Flint and Saginaw. The hope
IS that the pOIsoning will give
game fIsh a headstart to conhol
the rough f.sh problem in the
future.

The poison loses its effect after
a few days and in thIS case, a dam
kept It from spreading down river

Electric Clothes

at

N OV I
'I N N

COCKTAIL
LOUNGE Anytime a man Dpens the door

and helps hiS wife into the car,
you can bet that has just acquir-
ed on~ or the other .

Why do so many folks choose electric
c10lhes dryers~ Simply because electric
heat is as clean as the sun's.

are convenient, too. Rain or shine, you can
dry clothes any time in an electric dryer.

•••• _e __ ••••• _._ •• __•••• __•__ ••••• _

There's another reoson why electriC dryers
have the edge. They cost less to buy •••
operate for only pennies a load. They

SEE YOUR DE.ALER·"o~·Detroit ·Edison ..
.:- ,

24-Hour Ambulance Service

OXYGEN EQUIPPED

Phone 265 or 197

" -> ... ,



12-Thursday, September 29, 1955-THE NORTHVILLE RECORn

(ihurch$erbices
fering for Overseas Relief will be
received at CommUnIon service.

11 a.m., Sunday School and
Rall~' Day. Mrs. Russell Button,
S.S. Supt.
Wednesday:

7:30 p.m., Methodist Youth Fel·
lowsMp. Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Klrlmvood, youth sponsors.

8: 15 p.m., Choir rehearsal.
WOSCS,third Wednesday of each

month at noon.

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE
CHURCHES

Main and Dodge Sl:reets
Plymouth, Michigan

The perfection and supremacy
of God's infmitely good creation
will be emphasized at Christian
SCIence services this Sunday.

Readings from the King James
Version of the Bible and correla-
tive selections from "Science and
Health WIth Key to the Scrip-
tures" by Mary Baker Eddy will
comprise the, Lesson-Sermon on
the tOPlC of "Unreality".

From Ecclesiastes (3:14) will be
read the following verse: "I know
that whatsoever God doeth, it
shali he for ever: nothing can be
put to it nor any thing taken
from It: :md God doeth it, that
men sJlOuld fear before him."

Among the correlative passages
to be read from Science and
Health is the following (525:20-
22): "Everything good or worthy,
God made. Whatever is valueless
or baneful, He did not make,-
hence its unreality."

,
THE FIRST PRESBYTERIAN
CHURCH OF NORTHVILLE
Rev. John O. Taxis, Pasl:or

Corner of E. Main and Church 51s.
Thursday, Sept. 29:

8 p.m., Church Planning con-
ference.
Friday, Sept. 30:

3:45 p.m., Harmony Choir.
Sund'ay, Oct. 2:

9 a.m., First Worship service,
World-Wide Communion.

10 a.m., Sunday Church School
for everyone. •

1'l a.m., Second Worship ser-
vice. World-Wide Communion.

6 p.m., Bell ChOir.
7 p.m., Youth Fellowships.

Monday, Oct. 3:
9 a.m., Cooperative Nursery

every Monday, Wednesday and
Friday.

3:45 p.m., Girl Scout Troop 13,
Mrs. S. Thomson, leader.
Wednesday, Oct. 5:

3:45 p.m., Children's Choir, Mrs.
Connors, directing.

3:45 p.m., Girl Scout Troo.p 12,
Mrs. Langtry, leader.

'7:30 p.m., Chancel Choir.
8 p.m., Meeting of Board of

Trustees.
Thursday, Oct. 4:

3:45 p.m., Brownie Scouts Troop
3, Mrs. Hall, leader. '

8 p.m., Meeting of Board of
Deacons. '

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
OF NORTHVILLE

Pel:er F. Nieuwkoop, Pasl:or
217 N. Wing St.

Res. and Office Phone 410
Sunday, Oct. 2:

10 am., Bible School. Classes
for all ages. Lesson: Daniel 12.

11 am., Morning Worship.
Junior Church for children ages

4 to 10; Primary, for Tiny Tots;
Nursery room for mothers with
babies. .

6:30 p.m., Senior Baptist Youth
Fellowship. Mrs. Custer, leader;
Junior Baptist Youth Fellowship.
Mrs. Stiles, leader; Primary Bap-
tist Youth Fellowship. Mrs.
Haynes, leader.

7:30 p.m., Evening service.
Wednesday, Oct. 5:

7:30 p.m., The Hour of Prayer.
8:15 pm., Teacher's training. FIRST METHODIST CHURCH

109 West Dunlap St.
Northville. Michigan .

Office: 699-.1 Residence: 699-M
Ivan E. Hodgson, Minister

Sunday, Oct. 2: _
8:45 a.m., Divine Worship.

World-Wide Communion service.
Sermon: "Fellowship of Suffer-
ing."

NOVI METHODIST CHURCH
Rev. J. M. McLucas, Minister

Residence Brighton
Phone AC. 9-3731

Church Phone No:rfhville 2919
Sunday:

10 a.m., Morning Worship and
Holy Communion. A free-will of-

NEW OFFICE HOURS .. _
The NORTHVILLE RECORD

Mon.-Thurs. 8 to 5 Friday 8 to 7

Closed Saturdays

COMPLETELY INSTALLED

$18800
NORMAL

. INSrALLAr'ON

9

9:45 a.m., Church School. A
class for ·everyone.

11 a..m., Divine Worship. World-
Wide Communion service. Ser-
mon: "Fellowship of Suffering."

,Lounge available for mothers
with babies. Nursery for pre-
school children. Junior Church
under direction of Mrs. C. F. Le-
geman. '
Tuesday, Oct. 4:

3:30 p.m., Carol choir rehearsal.
7:15 p.m., Boy Scout Troop 731.
8 p.m., Wesleyan Service guild.

Wednesday, act. 5:
3:30 p.m., Brownie Troop 19.
7:30 p.m., Sanctuary Choir.

Thursday, Oct. 6:
3:30 p.m., Melody Choir.
4:15 pm., Harmony Choir.'
7:30 p.m., Fellowship of the

Concerned.

PENTECOSTAL CHURCH
Church of All Nations

8275 McFadden St., Salem
Pastor Elder Jack Skillman

Sunday:
9:45 a.m., Sunday School.

11:30 a.m., Preachin~.
7:30 p.m., Night service.

Tuesday:
'7:30 p.m., Bible class.

Friday:
7:30 p.m., Saints meeting.

NOVI BAPTIST CHURCH
Rev. J. A. O'Neill. Pastor

Phone 992-Rll
Sunday:

10:30 a.m .• Morning Worship.
11:30 a.m., Sunday School.
6 p.m., B.Y.F.
7 p.m .• Song service.

Evening worship.
Wednesday:

8 p.m., Prayer and Bible study.
Thursday: '

3:15 p.m., Bible Heirs at the
church.

ST. PAUL'S EVANGELICAL
LUTHERAN CHURCH

Cornel' High and Elm Sl:reets
Northville. Michigan

Parsonage Tel. 151 Church 9125
Rev. B. J. Pankow, M.A.. Pastor

Sunday:
Morning Worship, every Sun-

day, 10 a.m.; Holy Communion,
each fIrst Sunday.

Sunday School and Bible class-
es, every Sunday, 11:15 a.m.
Monday:

• Fully automatic 15
to 60 minute timer
lets you dry any-
thing from cottons to
nylons with perfect
safety. '

• Automatic tempera.
ture control.

• Mirror·smooth por.
ceraln drying drum
can't snag clothes.

• World's largest lint
trap.

• Dramatic new ·styf.'
Ing. '

TERMS AS LOW AS $1.50 A WEEK

Northville Refrigeration
126 N. CENTER ~ NORTHVILLE PHONE 776

DRY YOUR CLOTHES THE 4dolrlfl/ic "o-tpo;int WAY I

Church Council, each first Mon-
day, 8 p.m.

Voters' Assembly, each second
Monday, 8 p.m.
Tuesday:

Teachers, each second and
fourth Tues.day. LOwer divisions,
7:30 p.m. Upper divisions, 8:20
p.m.

Junior Walther League, each
third Tuesday, 7:30 p.m.
Thursday: I>

Can of i r mati 0 n class, every
Thursday. First year, 6:30 p.m.
Second year,' 7:40 p.m.

Ladies' Aid, e a c h second
Thursday, 1:30 p.m.

Lutheran Ladies' Al1xiliary,
each third Thursday, 8 p.m.
Friday:

Senior Walther League, each
second Friday, 8 p.m.

Lutheran Lay an en's League,
each third Friday, 8 p.rn.

Announcements for Holy Com-
munion, the Friday before every
Communion service, from 2 to 4
and from 7 to 9 p.m.

SALEM CONGREGATIONAL
CHURCH

Harry C. Richards. Pastor
Sunday:

11):30 a.m., Morning service.
111:45a.m., Sunday School.
7:45 p.m., Evening service.

Thursday:
7:45, Evening prayer meeting.

SALEM FEDERATED
CHURCH

Richard Burgess, Pastor
Sunday: .

·10:30 a.m., Morning W<lrship.
11:45 a.m., Sunday School.
6:30 p.m., Young People's Fel-

lowship.
7:30 p.m., Evening service.

Wednesday:
7:30 p.m., Pr:>.1er meeting.
8:30 p.m., Choir practice.

ST. JOHN'S EPISCOPAL
CHUIlCH

South Harvey and Maple
Plymouth. Michlgan

Rev. David T. Davie.. .Redcn
Office Phone 1730 Rec.tory 2308
Sunday:

8 a.m., Holy Communion.
9;~0 a.m., Family service and

classes for all ages.
11 a.m., Morning prayer and

sermon.

Wayne University Offers Accredited
Government Course By Radio

f

~.I. .,
1

Record Want Ads Bring Results - -Phone
, 200 and See

On Sept. 19, Wayne university
began its first regularly accred-
ited course by radio. Every Mon-
day, Wednesday and Friday eve-
ning at 7 p.m., a course in Amer-
ican government, li~ted in the
catalogue as " "Government 101"
will be heard over Wayne's FM
radio station WDET at 1G1.9meg-
acycles.

The course will 'Cover the struc-
ture, principles, and processes of
American government. Dr. ~arl
O. Smith, professor of govern-
ment, will be the lecturer, and he
wiH answer questions mailed in
·by students. He will also mail out
supplementary printed materials

to listeners who enroll in the! :~~==========~Icourse. I;
Students who take the course

by radio will pay the regular tu-
ition, 'Purchase a text, and come
to the campus four times during
the semester only, to take exam-
inations.

Government 101 can be used by
students to satisfy the "Public
Acts" requirement for degree. The
course will be of oBvious value
to immigrants working toward
citizenship, and it wiH also pro-
vlde a good refresher for all
Americans at a time when the
democratic form of government
is being challenged.

Since the radio course will re-
quire only four on-campus meet-
ings, many persons otherwise un-
able to take advantage of tne
course may now fulfill degree re-

quirements or general- interests I~~~~~~~~~~;;~~~===~=~~~~~~~~~=;:;:=;;;;==;;==_=:;in the field of government. It
Persons in hospitals and simi-

lar institutions will have special
arrangements made for them by
the government department in
order that they also may take
advantage of Wayne's first ex-
periment in a University of the
Air. They may register by mail
and take examinations at their
individual institutions.

'Persons over 20 years of age
need NOT have a high school
diploma to register for the course.

This attempt on the part of
Wayne University Radio to broad-

east for credit is aimed at helping
to meet growing needs for class-
room space. Lee S. Dreyfus,
WDET manager, will direct the
project for Wayne radio, and Dr.
Carl O. Smith will be in charge
of course content for the depart-
ment of government.

Those who wish to enroll or
get further information should ,
call the Department of Govern-
ment at TEmple 1-1450, Exten-
sion 207, or stop by the office at
500 W. Ferry.

,/

.J
r
I
1

PHONE 200
TO RENT-BUY-SELL

It·. Time to Orcle1o Coel azul
Eck.OU

NOW!
PHONE PLYMOUTH 107

/
EMERGENCY &: NITES

CALL 1701·J REVEREND JOHN O. TAXIS. A.B .. B.D., PASTOR

9:00 a.m. First WorshLp Service. Music by our Youth Choirs

10:00 'a.m. Sunday Church School Session. Mr. Philip Fisher,
General Superintendent. _

l.}:OO a.m. Second Worship Service. Music by Chancel Choir.

7:00 'P.m. Junior High and Senior High Westminster Fellow-
ship Youth Program.

ECKLES
COAL &: SUPPLY CO.

882 Holbrook PhoD. 107
Plymouth

BE SURE • • INSURE
.,he

CARRINGTON
AGENCY120 North Center

Northville Phone 284

Complete 'nsvrcrftce Sef!"ice
I'

Anything less is an
old-fashioned truck!

Ch.vro'.t Truck Wo,k 51yl1ng Is .... 11 i1Tu,'rot.d In tn ... four ",od.ls ranging from tno low
Cab forward and CameQ Carrier Qt left to the pickup and Iractor~lrciler unit of rlgnt.

Trucks
ventilation that provides a more constant
supply of outside air in all kinds of weather.

Most modern truck styling
'We call it Work myling-and you get it
. only in new Chevrolet trucks! Two fresh,
functional styling treatments are offered-
one for light- and medium-duty models, an-
other for heavy-duty models. Your Chev-
rolet truck will do your job better-and look
better doing itl
Most modern features throughout
Advanced suspensions, more rigid, ladder-
type frames! Tubeless tires standard on Y2-
ton models! Come in and see all the ways
you're way ahead with new Chevrolet trucksl.

-VB ;'Mlldard ill L.C.f'. moder., 4" ort,,,·eost oPtio," •
III aU others B.l:coptForward Conlrollllodc14.,....

Year after year, America's best selling truckl

electrical system for quicker starting, bette~
ignition and a greater electrical reserve.

The truck driver's "dream cab"
That's the closest we' can come to describ-
ing the new Flite-Ride De Luxe cab. What
truck driver wouldn't go for features like
these: panoramic windshield for wider,
safer vision; concealed Safety Step that stays
clear of snow, mud and ice; High-Level

CHEVIIOI.E" SALES

New Cheyrolet

• They're the most m9.~.~.r.~trucks on ,the road. If you don't get all
the advantages they offer,' you stand to lose money on the iob
today __ • and again at trade·in-time I

Most modern power-Va or 6
In most new Chevrolet truck models, you
have your choice of VS-t or 6. Chevrolet's
new truck VS's have the shortest stroke of
allY V8 in any leading truck! That means
less friction and wear per mile. The valve-
in-head sixes are new editions of the engines
that have long been famous as the "work
horses" of the truck world! And all Chev-
,roIet truck engines have a modern 12-voIt

~

RATHBURN
560 PLYMOUTH A'VE. ' NORTHVILL~ PHONE 290



follows:
'125.15 Fire District No. 1. In Fire District No. 1 &tructural

frames may be erected of wood or other material of similar com-
bustible characteristics covered with metal or other approved non-
combustible material, when no more llhan thirty-five (35) feet in
height and seventy-five (75) feet in length.

(24) Section 125.17 of the Abridged Building Code, a, amended
,by the Wayne County Code by the addition of a new section to
appear and ,become Section 125.17, IS hereby amended to read as
follows

125.17 Maximum Size. In all locations, wJ1en constructed en-
tirely of noncombustLble material, ground signs may be erected to
the height as permitted in the Novi TownsMp Zoning Ordmance.

(25) section 126.12 of the Abridged Building Code, as amended
hy the Wayne Oounty Code by the addition of a new section to ap-
<pearand become section 126.12,is hereby amended to read as foHows:

126.12 Closed Signs. A closed,rod!'sign shall not be erected 1-------------
a1bovethe roof of any buildmg to exceed the height perffiltted for
the Zoning District in which it is located.

(26) Section 126.13 of the Abridged Building Code, as amend-
ed by the Wayne County Code by the addition of a new seotlOn to
appear and 'become Section 126.13, is hereby amended to read as
follows:

126.13 Open Signs. An open roof sign shall not be erected
laibove the roof of any building to exceed the height permitted for
the Zoning District in which it is located.

(27) Section 126.14 of the Abridged Building Code, as amended
by the Wayne County Code by the addition of a new section to ap-
-:pearand become Section 126.14, is hereby amellded to read as foll'Ows: .'lIl

126.14 Combustible Supports. Within Fire District No.1, no ..
roof sign shall be supported on or braced to wooden ,beams or other
combustil>le construction of a buildmg or structure unless otherwISe
approved by the Building Official.

(28) Section 128.11 of the Abridged Building Code, as amended
by the Wayne County Code by the addition elf a new section to ap-
pear and become Section 128.101,is hereby amended to read as follows:

128.11 Maximum Projection. No such sign shall project over
a street or other public space. No such sign shall project more than
ten (IO) feet from the face of the :building or structure.
. (29) section 130.1 of the Aibridged Building Code, as amended

by t'he Wayne County Code Iby the addition of a new secti"on to ap-
,pear and become Section 130;1,is hereby amended to read as follow6:

130.1 Pole Signs. Pole signs shall ,be constructed entirely of
noncombustible materials, except as provided in Section 124.46 and
shall conform to the requirements for ground and roof signs as fue
case may be. No part of such s~gn shall extend beyond the street
or highway lot line.

(30) Section 132.16 of the Abridged Building Code, as a.mended
by the Wayne County Code 'by ilhe addition of a new section to aJP-
pear and become Section U2,16, is hereby amended to read as follows:

·132.16No person, fIrm or cOIlporation, or their lessee or agent,
shan construct or maintain a barbed wire fence, parlicular1y or
wholly around any area in any street, aveDUe, alley, lane or public
highway, or in or along any street or In front of any pul>hc space 01'
!place, or nail or cause same to 'be nailed or fastened in any form,
shape or manner upon partition iences. Provided, however, this shan
'11otprohibit the use of barbed wire fencing on farms or small fanns
for the pwyose of enc1:osing cattle or other animals.

section 4. Unlawful Acts. I1J shall be unlawful for any person·,
firm or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repalI, move,
improve, remove, convert 01' demolish, equip, use, 0c:<;upyor main-
tam any !building or structure 1n the Township of NOVI,or cause the
same to be done contrary to Gr in violation of any of the provisions
of this Ordinance and Code.

Section 5. PenaHies. Any person, .firm or c01\POrationviolating
,any of the provisions of this Ordinance and Code !fuall <bedeemed
'guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such 'Person,. shall be deeIt!-ed
guilty of a separate offense for each d~y. or portlO.n ther.eof durlllg
which any viol8ltion of any of the prOVISIOnsof thIS Ordinanc~ ~nd
Code is committed, continUed or pefffiltted, and .upon the conV:lChon
of any such VIOlation, such person Shall be pumsh~ble .by a fine of
not more than One Hundred Dollars ($100.00) or .mrprlsonment for
not more .than ~inety (90) days or by lboth such fme and unpnson-
ment. rd' .

Section 6. Repeal. AUl Ordinances 'Or parts of. 0 ID3.!1cf111
conflict, herewith. are repealed excePt Wlhet;ethere 1S co.nflict '!:le-
tween this Ordinance and Ordinance No.2, 'The .TownshlP ZonJ!1g
Ordinance" and where said Ordinance No.2 prescl'.bes .a more strm-
gent requirement, the s~d Ordinance No.2. s!Iall preva!l. .

Section 7. Effective Date. The prOVISIOnsof thIS' Ordmance
are here!>y declared to be immediately necessary for the preserva-
tion of the public peace, health and safety and are hereby or~ered
to take effect Thirty (30) 'days after final rpassage and pubhcahon.
State of Michigan )

) SS
County of Oakland) .,

I Earl'Banks, Clerk of the Townshlrp of Novl, ~o hereby
certify 'iliat the foregoing is a correct copy of .an Ordm~ce .as
passed by the Township Board of the TownshIp of Novl at Its
regular meeting held September 19, 1955. .

EARL BANKS, TownshIp Clel'k
Township Clerk

st!l'lled. shall comply with the minimum specifications which are
established Iby the Health Department of the State of Michigan or
the Oakland.' County Health Department.

(14) Section 117.12 of. the Abridged Building Code as amend-
ed by the Wayne County Code is 'hereby amended to read! as foNows:

117.12 All sewage disposal systems, installed in the Township
of Novi, shall conform to the Oakland County Health! Department

An Ordinance enacted pursuant to Act No.,IBS. Public Acts Standards and shall ,be checked and approved by the Building Offi-
of 1943 as amended. to regulate the erection. construction. cial of the Township.
enlargement, equipment. aUeration, repair. moving. removal. (015)Section 1>17.13of the Abridged BuHding Code as amended
demolition. conversion. use. height, area and maintenance of by the WaY'!leCounty Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:
all buildings and structures in the unincorporated portions 117.13 All plumbinJg, hereafter installed, shall conform to the
of the Township of Novi: to provide for the issuance of per- minimum co.de requirements of the State of Michigan .The provi-
mifs and collection of fees thereof: to provide penalties for sions of the City of Detroit Plumbing Code, as adopted by the City
the violation fuereo!: declaring and establishing fire limits; of Detroit, shall apply to all installations made in the Township of
defining the scope and authority of the Building Inspector; -Novi, with the exception of those sections of the Plumbing Code
and repealing aU Ordinances and parts of Ordinances in which are specifically covered by the Wayne County Building Code.
conflict therewith except Ordinance No.2 known as !he (16) Section 117.14,of the Aibridged Building Code as amended
Zoning Ordinance of the Township of Novi. by the Wayne County Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

THE TOWNSHIP OF NOVI ORDAINS: 117.14No plumbing work shall be performed except by a master
Section 1. Adoption of Building Code. Certain documents, copies or journeyman plumber licensed under the laws of the State of

of which are on file in the O!fice of the Clerk of the Township of Michigan and registered with the Township of N"ovi. Registration
Novi. available for inspeotion by the distribution to the public at fee shall be One Dollar ($1.00) for maSter and Fifty Cents ($.50) for
all times, and which are marked and designated as the "Abridged journeyman plumbers. Nothing herein contained shall prohibit any
Building Code" and the "Basic .Building Code", 1950 Editions re- bonafide owner from personally installing plumbing in his own resi-
6pectlvely, and approved by the Building ilificial Co11!ference of dence, provided that said owner shall:
Nnerica, Incorporated, on November 2, 1949, with the additions, (1) Apply for and secure a pel'ffiit covering the work pro-
insertions, deletions and changes as adopted by the Board of Super- posed.
visors of the County of Wayne, October 8, 1951, and known as, the (2) Pay the required fee.
County Building Code; ,the Plumbing Code of the City of Detroit, (3) Do the work himself or herself in accordance with this
Michigan, the'same having been. adopted 'March 16, 1943, and re- Code.
vised March 26, 1946. and being Ordinance tN"'O.305-D of the City of (4) Apply for inspection.
Detroit; and the National Electrical Code, adopted in 1951,are hereby (-5) Receive approval of the Inspector.
adopted, and al;e to be used, considered and enforced jointly, with (17) Section 117.0 d1 the ,A,bridged Building Code, is hereby
the "Basic Building Code" serving as a supplement to the ".A:bridged. amended 'by the addition of a new section to appear and become
Building Code" with the additions, insertions, deletions'and changes Section 117.16, to read as follows:
prescribed in Section 3 of the "County Building Code", the "Plumb- 117.16 Septic Tank and Disposal Fields. When a sewer is not
ing Code af the ,City of Detroit" and the "National Electrical Code", avai~able the Building Official may grant a permit for the use of a
in regulating the erection, constructiDn, enlargement, equipment~ septic tank or other sewage trea.tment tank, with the 'l'equired dis-
alteration, repair, moving, ·removal., demolition, conversion, use, <posal field, provided, such tanks and fields shall be constJructed
height, area. and maintenanc~ of all buildings and strnctures in the in accordance with the recommendations of the State Department
unincoIlporated portions of the Township of Novi, and including of Health. Percolation tests made by the Oakland C'Ounty Health
the penalties 'for violating the provisions of said code and estahlish- Department or other approved agency shall be soonUtted to the
ing of fire limits; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, Building Inspector along with the applicationof a Building Pel'ffilt.
penalties, conditions and terms of said "Abridged iBuilding Code" Two such tests shall be made fot;.each tile field. The tank and field
and "Basic Building Code", 1950 Editions approved 'by the Building shall meet the requirements of the State Department of Health
Official Conference of America, In<:orporated, on 'November 2, 1949, 'based on the number of bedrooms, persons served and 1he per.colation
with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes prescribed in <tests of the absorption area. W.henever a sewer is available use of
Section 3 of the County Building CadI: as adopted by the Board of existing treatment tanks shall be discontinued and connections
Supervisors of the County of Wayne, October 8, H)51. and on file made to such sewers. t

in the ofrl'iceof .the Wa'yne County Clerk; the "Plmnbing Code of (18) Section 119.83 of the Abridged Building Code is hereby
the City of Detroit" and the "National Electrical Code", are hereby amended to change the Section Number 118.9 in the 4th line to
referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in Section 118.7.
this Ordinance, except as herein otherwise stated. (19) Section 1,21.0of the Abridged. Building Code is hereby

Section 2. Purpose. The pUl'pose of. th1s OrdinaI!.ce and Code is amended by the addition of new .sections to appear and, became
to provide minimum standards Iio safeguard life and limb, health, ~:f~ll~~~~1.5, 121.51, 121.52, 121.6, 121.7, 121.8 to read, respectively,
property and public welfare, by lI'egulating and controlling the ~e- 121.5Permits. No electrical equipment shall be installed within
sign- construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, locatIon b 'ld' st ctu . 'cl .
and 'maintenance of all buildings and structures within the Township or on any UI mg, ru re or prenuses, opubh y or privateLy own-
of Novi and certain equipment specifically regulated by this Or- ed, nor shall any alteI1ation or addition be made in any such exis't-ing equipment without first securing a permit therefor from the
dinance. t Building Official, except as provided in Section 121.8 and except

Section 3. Additions: Amendments and Clarification of Referen!;:e that no permit will be required to execute any of the classes of
Ordinance. - electrical work specified in the folll1wlng 'Paragraphs 1 W 4, in-

(1) Wherever, in said Reference Ordinance, a municipality elusive: ,
is mentioned and no name is therein given, said municipality shall be (1) Minpr repair work, the replacemenif: of lamps or the
construed to mean the Township of Novi; and wherever. in said connection of.portable electrical equipment t-o suitla!ble permanently
Reference Ordinance, a state if mentioned without giving the name installed receptacles;
thereof, such state ¢hall be construed to be .the State of MichiUan. (2) The installaiion, alteration or repai.r of electrical

(2) Wherever, in said Ordinance, the term '\Building OOidal" equipment for the operation of signals or the transmission of in-
is useld, same shall be deemed to mean such person. persons or or- telligen<:e;
ganization as may"'be designated by the !'tovi Township Board''aS (3) The installation, alteration or repair of electrical

•"Building Inspector". equipment installed by or for an electricity supply agency for the
; (3) Wherever, in said Ordinance, reference is made to the Basic use of such agency in the generation, transmission, dimribution or

Building Code, said reference shall be deemed to refer to the 'latest meteriIig of electricity;
amended Basic Building Code, adopted by the Building Officiads' (4) Any work involved in the manufacturing, testing,
Conference of America, Incorporated. servicing, altering or repairing of electrical equipment or apparatus,

except that this exemption shall not include any permanent wiring
(4) Wiherever, in said Ordinance, there appears ;to be a re- other than that required for testing P1.U'P0ses.

quirement that certain documents and papers. including the Abridg- AJpplication for such permit, descr~bing the work to be done,
ed Building Code and the Basic Building Code, shall·be kept on file shall ,be made in writing to the Building Qfificial by the person,
in the office of the Building Official or other person, it shall be firm or cOIlpora-tioninstalling the work. The application shall be
deemed suMicient compliance if said documents and papers are on accompanied by such plans, specifications and schedules as may be
file in the office of the Township Clerk. in the Novi Township Hall. necessary to determine whether the installation, 'as described, will

(5) Section 104.13of the Abridged Building Code, as amended be in conformity with the requirements of this Ordinance~ If it shall
by the Wayne County Code by the addition of a new section ,to be found that the installation, as descdbed, will conform with all
appear and become. section 104.13, is hereby am~mded to read as the legal requirements and if the ll!PPlicant has complied with all
follows: rprovisions of this Ordinance, a penrut for such installation shall be

104.13 BOARD OF APPEALS. ,The Board of Appeals, as issued. I

established under the Zoning Ordinance {}f .the Townsh~p of iNovi, No deviation may be made from the installation described in
Ishall be the Board of Appeals on" matters arising out af the enforce- ,the permit without the written approval of the Electrical Inspector.
ment of the provisions of this Ordinance. 121.51 Fees for Permits and Inspections. Fees for electrical

OHAIRMAN OF 'I1HE BOARD. The Board shall seleCt one ;perm1ts shall be as establish('d iby resolution of the Township Board.
of its members to serve as chairman, and the Building Official shall 121.52 Inspection and Certificates. Upon completion of any
serve as secretary to the board and shall keep a detailed record of installatIOn of electrical equiJpment, which has been made under a
all proceedings on file in the Department of Building Inspection. permit, it shall be the duty df the person, firm or corporation, mak-

EXEMPTION OF ,MEMBER. No member of the board mg the inmallation, to notify the Electrical Inspector, who shall
shall pass on any question in which he Is engaged as contractor or inspect the installation with!n .twenty-four. (24) hours, E;xcl~siv!,!of

t . 1 de 1 r 'n the preparation of plans or specifIcatIOns or Saturdays, Sundays 'and holidars, of the time such notice IS glVen!Da er:a a er, 0 I. ' or as soon thereafter as practicable.
111 whIch he has any personal mterest. When a certificate of approval is issued authorizing the con-

COMPENSATION OF BOARD 0F APPEALS ..Compensa- nection and use of a temporary installation, such certificate shall . Ann Arbor - October will be
tion of appomted members of the board shall be determmed by thej be issued to expire at. a time to be stateli therein and shall be re- a month of moons, two of them
TownshIp Board. ' vocable by the ElectrIcal Inspector for cause. full-one Harvest, one Hunter's.

APPLICATION FOR APPEAL .. In case of dissatisfaction When any electrical equipment is to be hidden from view So says Associate Prof. Hazel
with the decision of the Building Official, the question, in dispute,] by permanent placement of parts of the building, the person, firm M. Losh of the University of
may be referred to the Board of Appeals; and such board shall pro- or cOl'lporation installing the equi'Pment shall notify the Electrical Michigan Astronomy Dept. And
ceed to hear and detenmine the appeal. Provided, however, that the Inspector and such equi·pment shall not be concealed until it has the full moon of Oct. 1 will be
Building Official shall have the right to order the inunediate abate- Ibeen inspected and approved by the Electrical Inspector; provided, the year's Harvest Moon, whIch
ment and co~ec~ion of any eminE;ntly 4angerous, co~di~ion to life that on large. installation, where th.e concealment .of e\luipm~nt is defined as the full moon oc-
or property wlthm the scope of thiS Ordmance. Application for ap- proceeds contmuously, the person, firm or corporatIOn, Installmg . are t the time of the
peal may also be made when it ~ claimed that: the true intent of the electrical equipment, shall give the Electrical Inspector due currmg ne ~ . .
rthis Code or rules legally adopted 1hereunder have ,been incorrectly notice and inspections shall be made periodically during the prog- iautumnal equll10x 111 mId Scp-
interpreted' the provisions (jf this Code do not fully apply, or an ress of .the work. tember.
equally goo'd or better iorm ot construction can be used. Lf upon inspection the installation is not found to be fully in The second full moon, season-

NOTICE OF MEETING. The Board $hall meet upon notice Iconformity with th~ provisions of this Ordina!!ce, the Electri.cal ably called a Hunter's Moon,
of the chaIrman withi~ te~ (10) d-ays of the filing of an appeal or' Insp~tor sh~ll at o~ce forwB:rd to thE;perso!!, fmn or corporat!on might this year be called a Hal-
at stated periodic meetmgs If warranted .by the volume of yvork. makmg the Insta)latlOn. a wntten notice statmg the defects which loween Moon-it occurs Oct. 31.

PUBLIC. HEARING. All hearmgs shall be pubhc; and the have been found to eXIst. - D t the Moon's path being
appellant his representative, the official of the municipality and 121.6 Connection to Inmallation. It sh8'l1 be unlawful for any ue 1 0 11 1 t th horizon at
any oihe~ person whose interests may be affected by the matter of person, firm or cOl'poration to make" connection from a supply of nheary para ~h 0 M e '11
appeal shall be given an opportunity to be heard. electricity or to supply electricity to any electrical equipment for t ese tIl11CS, e oon WI ap-

, ADJOURNED MEETING. Two (2)' qualified members the installation for which a pe~it is required or wJ!ich h~s been ~ear soo~er than at any other
shall constitute a quorum; ,but when three, (3) qualified members dlsconnecte~ or ordered t~ be disconnected !?y Iihe Electrical .In- tlm~ durmg the year, thus sup-
are not present to consider a specific appeal, either the appellant, the spector, until such ccnnectlon has been authorlzcd by the Electrical plymg harvest and l:unhng eve-
Building OJificial or their representatives may request a postpone- Inspector. " nings will full moonlight for sev-
ment of the hearing. 121.7 L~cense to do EI~ctncal Work. It shall, ,be unlawful for eral nights in a row.

(6) The 'blank spaces in Section 104.5, of said Ordinance, are any person, fIrm or corporation to e.ngage as an mdepen?ent con-
hereby completed to provide penalties on conviction of One Hund- tractor, or. for an.., person. to engage .m the trade of Electrical ~our-
Ted Dollars ($100.00) fine or imprisonment for not more than ninety neym?-n, 111.t~e msta~latlOn, 'a1oterahon, mal~tenance or .repalr of
(90) days or both. electrical wmng, equipment, apparatus .or fixtures for light, heat

(7) Section 104.6, of said Ordinance, is hereby completed to ~r power purposes, \~hen the electromotive force e.xc~eds 30 volts
provide the following schedule of permit fpes: 111. or about ~he.'bU1ldmg and/o! structure locat~ wlthm the Town-

TABT E 1 SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES ship of Novl w1thout first havmg procured a hcense.
. ~ Electrical contractors and journeyman electricians, licensed by

Valuahon of Work Fee cities, villages or townships in .the metropolitan district of Detroit,
Less than $100.00 '. No charge may ,register to do work in the Township of Novi for a fee of One
$100.00 to $500.00 $2.00 Dollar ($1.00).
$500.00 to $1000.00 $4.00, License iees for electrical contractors shall be Twenty-five
More than $1000.00 . $1.00 per each addI- Dollars ($25.00) and for eleotrical journElYJllan One DollaT ($1.00)

. , bonal $1,000.00or part thereof. <andsuch license shall expire December 31st of each year.
(8) Section 104.61 of the Abridged Code as. amended by the 121.8 The provisions of this code shall not apply to electrical

Wayne Coun~y Code by.the addItion of a new section to appea.r and p.ower supply companies for communication agen<:ies in respect to
become Section 104.61, IS hereby amended to ~e~d as follows. 'generation, transmiSSIOn or distribution of electrical power and
. 104.61MOVING OF BUILDn~:aS. N:o~U1ldmg shall be ~o~ed light, to public communication transmission systems, to operation
!nto, or from one lot !o anqther lot !n ~ distrICt wl).en such bUlld!ng ClE signal systtms used exclusively by public service agencies, to
IS not o.f ~ type permItted.111 that dl~tnct. A perml~ f<;lrthe mOVing installation of equipment used by railway utilities and public car.
of a ,hUlldmg shall not 'be Issued until a cash deposlt, 111 th~ amo~t Tiers or to radio transmission systems other tJllian the equipment
of Five HUl}dred Dollars ($500.00), shall have been depOSIted WIth and wiring for power supply and the' installation of radio towers
~he Township Treasurer .to c0,v!!r any damages s~ered or e~en.ses and antennas whether erected on buildings or on the ground. ~
Incurred >bythe Township arISIng f.rom th!,! movmg of the bUlldmg (20) Section 123.51of the AJbl'idgedBuilding Code, as amended
and ~o guarantee t,he removal of 1,111 debns from the. ,p~opertY.ll;nd by the Wayne County Code by the addition of a new section to
leveling C!f the lot m a manner s!'-tJsfactory to 'the BUlldmg Offlcl~l. appear and become Section 123.&1 is hereby amended to read as
The makmg of .such cash depOSIt shall. not prevent the Township follows: ' .
fr0I!! tht; collection of fw-ther damages m exces~ of the amount de- 123.51 Sale or Rent. Signs arected to announce the sale or
pos!ted m the event fu~ther damages !!ore.sus.tamed. Such cash. d~- rent of the property, so designated, provided such signs' are not
POSIt;;s.hall not be reqUired w.he,n a bulldl!lg.ls t? be moved wlthm more than ten (10) square feet in area. Subdivision ground signs I~===========~=======:;;====:;~Ithe limIts of U}eproperty on.whlch.the bUlldm~ IS located.. . announcing the }lame of the subdivision and lots or homes for sale, L

(9) Section 106:1 of s~ld Ordmance p~vldes for the Insertion provided such signs are not over six (6) feet in height nor more than
of the date of adoptIOn: Sll;ld date 9f ad01JtlOn shall be deemed to sixty (60) square feet in area.
be the date of th~ pUb.hcll;tlonof ~h~s.Ordmance... (21) Section 123.82 of the Abl'idged Building Code, as al,l1end-

(10) The Fire DIstrict SUbdiVISIonset forth m sectIOn 107,1 ed by the WaY'!leCounty Code by the addition of a new SectIOn to
of said Ordinance shall be deemed to be the business, and/or com· appeaT and become Section 123.82 is hereby amended to read as
mercial .and manufactu~ing di~tricts as estlrblished by Ordinance follows: ' -
No, 2, {he ,Novi TownshIp Zonmg Ordinance and the Zoning Map 123.82 Projecting Signs. A projecting display sign erected to
and amendments thereto. rthe walls 'Of a building or structure outside of the building lines is

(11) Scoti.on 11~.23 on Page 51 of ·the Abridged Code to be hereby deemed unlawf,ul. Such signs shan be reconstructed or re-
deleted from thiS Ordmance. moved as herein required.

(12) section 113.67 of tJ:1eAbridged Building Code is hereby (22) Section 124.31 of the Abridged Building Code, as Q1lIend-
amended. to change. the reqUirements of Section Number IHI.9 in ed by the Wayne Count~ Code by the addition of a new section to
the 6th lme to .Sechon 118.17.. . . appeaT and becom~ SectlOn-124.31 is hereby amended to provided

(13) section 117.1 of the. A!brldged BUlldmg Code as amended an approved bond m the sum of Five Thousand ($5,000.00) Dollars.
by the Wayne County Code, IS hereby amended by amending the (23) Section 125.15of the Aibridged Building Code, as amended
4th paragraph to read as follows I by th~ Wayne County Code iby the addition of a new section to

117.1 Private water supplies, hereafter constructed and in- appear and become Section 125.15, is hereby amended to read as

r
i Ordinance· No. 12rownship of Novi

Michigan troops in the key bat-
tles of the war between North
and South.

Seven programs were given as
a pilot series on station WUOM,
Ann Al'bor, during July and Aug-
ust. The success of. these trial
broadcasts, according to Prof.
Waldo Abbot, U-M director of
broadcasting, "encouraged us to
expand the serIes and offer it to
radio stations throughout the
state."

October Will Be
"Month of Moons"

If traffic volume increases by
50 percent during the next ten
years, .as estimated, accidents at
the present rate will take 55,000
lives annually by 1965.

U-M Dramatizes
Michigan's Part
In CitiI War

TABLE INCLUDED
at no extra charge

QYPE'IlRITER
, ~ENTALS

SAlES
RENTALS ,...., ETROPOLITAN
SERVICE TYPEWRITER co.

UNiversity 1-2900
TO RENT-BUY-SELL

PHONE 2QD

Ann Arbor - A special series
of radio broadcasts about the im-
portant part Michigan Regll11ents
played in the Civil War is plan-
ned for presentation to Michigan
audiences this f.all and winter.

"To Make Men ree", created
by The University of Michigan
Broadcasting service, is a series
of quarter-hour radio programs
dramatizing the role played by'

RICH-ART

PICTURE
FRAMING

PHONE
1464

103 S.
CENTER

- ..

C HAROLD BLOOM
• Pt'l~

• AUTO • FIRE • PLATE GLASS • LlABIUTY
• WINDSTORM '

, PHONE 470 OR 3
108 Weat Main Street Northville, Michigan

~'. r:... -_~~=- : ".,,-. '. :.-' • -. ;r-.'- '"_/~ _-.-- _ ~'_-.

THE NORTHVILLE RECORD-Thursday, September 29, 1955-13

Leader Training
Course October 4

TO RENT-BUY-SELL
PHONE 200

four classes will be held Oct. 6,
n, 13 and 18 from 11 a.m. until
3 p.m.

Women who would like to be·
come leaders are urged to come
and sign up Oct. 4.

The training course for women
who are going to be girl scout or
brownie leaders begins Oct. 4 at
the home of Mrs. Russell Atchi-
son on Rogers St.

Registration begins at 9:30 to 10
on the 4th and class will be held
the same day until 3, the next

Northville Lodge,
No. 186, F. & A. M.

REGULAR MEETING
Second Monday of each month

WILLIAM MONROE, W.M.
R. F. COOLMAN. Secretary_

PROFESSIONAL DIRECTORY •CECIL B. JACKSON. D.O.

120 North Cenlel' Phone ISO

DR. ARTHUR J. MALESKE
Res. • Livonia GArfield 2·0520

- Dentiai-
249 E. Main Sf.

Phone 799

- Osteopathic:: -

- Physician • Surgeon -
NorthvllI.

148 North Center Sf.
BollI'll by Appointmen~

Phones: Olfiee - NorfhvW. 1181
DR. HUGHG. GODFRET

- Dent~l-

E. Main Sueel • NorthvllI.

Phone '784

-----------1107

DB. STUART F. CAMPBELL
- Optometrist -

120 N. Center • NorlhviUe DR. J. K. EASTLAND

- Dentist-Closed Thursday

Phone 1102

FACTORY TO YOU
-PAINTS-

BUY DIRECT FROM THE
MANUFACTURER

AND SAVE THE DIFFERENCE
Outside White (5 gal. cans) •• 4.88 gal.
Odorless Flat . . • •• . 3.85 gal.
Odorless Satin . • • . • • 4.85 gal.
Odorless Enamel . • • • . 5.95 gal.

DEEP TONES SLIGHTLY HIGHER
300 CUSTOM COLORS TO CHOOSE FROM

WALLPAPER and BRUSHES
PITTSBURGH'S RUBBERIZED SATIN FINISH

First Quality Guaranteed Free Technical Service

The Harnden Paint & Glass' Co.
115 CHURCH ST.

PHONE 873-MNORTHVILLE MICH.

There's a First Federal

MAI'L
BRANCH

Near You
2,655mailboxes in the Detroit area, and hundreds
of thousands throughout the country, make it
easy to save here-wherever you live. You can
open an account, add to savings and withdraw-
entirely by mail. First Federal provides free,
postage-paidsave-by-mailenvelopes. Your savings
here are insured to $10,000. Any amount opens
your account.

Current 2 Y.2% Rate

FIRST FEDERAL
SAVINGS OF DETROIT

843 PENNIMAN, PLYMOUTH

• DOWNTOWN HEAOQUARTERS

Griswold 01 Lafayell.

Acroll From Cl1y Hall

I,

.. ~ .. I



14-Thursday, September 29, 1955-THE NORTHVILLE RECORD

DON'T SCRATCH THAT ITCH I
IN 15 MINUTES.

You MUST be rid of the ITCH
or your 40c back at any drug
store. ITCH-ME-NOT actually
gives triple·action relief. It dead-
ens the itch. peels off tainted out-
er skin. KILLS GERMS AND
FUNGUS ON CONTACT. Fine for
eczema. foot itch. other surface
rashes. Today at GunseU's Drug
Store. 102 E. Main St .• Northville.

-~-~-,)

publishers, engineern and manu-
facturers.

Enrollments are being taken
now for the competition by Guild
field representatives who are vis-
itmg thousands of public and
parochial schools throughout the
country.

Any boy in the United States Professor George Vetter of
betwen the ages of 12 through 19 New York University speaking
IS eligIble to enter the competi: to 400 civil de-
tion and may obtain an enroll- fense war d ens
ment card by writing to the Fish- 1.--------------1 said, "When the
er Craftsman's Guild, General bombs start fall-
Motors COl'p., Detroit 2. ing sing hymns."

A bO'lklet on model car design The l' e is no
'and constrw;tion, the only text· que s t ion but
book of its kind for youths wish- what the hymns
ing to learn about automobile de- of the c h u r c h
sign, is given to each boy enroll- have been com-
ing in the Guild. It was prepared forting and encouraging to
by professional designers from Christians in the hour of dan-
the General Motors Styling sec- gel' and trial. However, to
tion, FIsher Body division engi- those who have not become ac-
neers and the Technical Staff Of, ;~~~~~~~~~~~~.: IIquainted with the God andthe Craftsmim's Guild. Saviour of whom the hymns

Sopeak may find that it takes
more than even. a Christian
song to still their fears and fit
their souls for heaven, should
a bomb fall tab close. It's not
the song, it's the Christ of the
song that we need every hour.
Why wait until the bombs fall
to become acquainted with
Him? Recently a church dis-
played the following sign,
"When the bombs Sotartfalling,
this church WIll be open for
prayer, but it may be too late
then. Better come next Sun-
day." Surely you will find as
thousands of others that Chris-
tianity is as good to "live
with" as it is to "die with".
II Cor. 6'2 "For he saith, I
have heard thee in a time ac-
cepted, and in the day of sal-
vation have I succoured thee;
behold, now is the accepted
time; behold, now IS the day
of salvation." For your eternal
welfare accept the Saviour to-
day!

Peter F. Nieuwkoop. Pastor

Charlevoix, Mrs. Wanna C. Dur-l.---------- ... --, "
ham of Harrison, Mrs. Dorothy '; I

Rank of Farmington. One sister,'
Mrs. Lillian Atley of Fenton also
survives. There are 28 grandchild-
ren and two great-grandchildren.

FIFTY YEARS AGO -

W. D. Withington's handsome
b;:><;::><:::r;;:::..>;;::y<:::>·<:::>o~...:;::,~...<::"...e;::>",::><::><::><;;:::..>;;::y<:::>o",=>~...:;::,~...<::"...e;::>"'::><::><::><~;;::YO::><:::>O~"':;::'~"'<::>-<::>"':J.1 carriage te am wh ich was ente re d

at the State Fair by his son-in-
law, S, V. Miller, captured first
prize.

The Hall-Carr factory shut
down Wednesday and the Bell
foundry Thursday to allow all

Q:,.<:::>~...:;::,~...<::"...e;:::>-<:::><::><::><:::r;;:::..>~~",=>...:;::,~...<::::.o<::y:;::><::><;:><:::r::::>-~",=>~...:;::,~...<::"...e;:::>-<::><::><::><::><::::>-e;::,I) I hands who wish to do so to at-
tend the state fair.

Events of the Past in Northville

Station I 9:00
WHRV A.M.

1600 K.o.. Sunday
Also on CKLW at 9:45

;----- Adv. _

ADVICE FOR
CIVIL DEFENSE

•

News Items Taken From the Files of the Record Of the 10,050 bridges in the
rural interstate system, 8,187, or
81 percent are below standard
width.

Dewey M. Burrell

I The U of M announces the
names of two Northville people

Northville's first Hometown who had been awarded Master's
Bargain Days were set for the Degrees; Beatrice Esther Hawk-
first of October. ins of 118 Linden St., and Robert

Dr. Howard McClusky of U-M Spencer Menees, 390 First St
wil1.address the "21-ers" banquet Three Northville boys answered
in October. the draft call: James Howarth,

David Lee \lnd Charles Ely re- John Maloney and Donald Kel-
turned from a ten weeks tour of nero
Scandinavian countries. NHS High School band will be

The G. E. Miller Sales & Ser- among 37 other bands which wlll
vice Co. has d:<Jne.a "f.ace.lifting" join with the University of Michi-
and redecoratmg Job m lts place gan band in staging the half-time
of business on Hutton S1. show at the Michigan-Dartmouth

The North.ville Woman'.s c~ub game.
held its openmg luncheon m Aim
Arbor.

FIVE YEARS AGO -
The score'board on the south-

east corner of Ford Field is prov-
ing popular to the crowds turn-
mg out for football games.

ONE YEAR AGO-

CONTRACTOR
• Basements-

TEN YEARS AGO -

• Excavating

Ditching

• Bulldozing'
Free Estimate.

HOW
CHRISTIAN

SCIENCE
HEALSExpert Work

Call

Northville 1119.
51305 7-Mile Rd.

Northville

·~AtiiQ·;ii~.ti·~:.·:f~ti~,·.O~i'~.Se~rv:ic·e...~~
•••• ..: >~~ :,_'"-..: '. ,., ." p.:.• ", -' .~-....._~. "-

ONE' CALl[J~.'"
'and we do ~\ ~~
Itlie1!rest!

\-1)
«> Our Complete Fuef Oil_Ser. local temperature changes •••
vicesavestime.work.ntoney- free heat-saving tips ••• .four-
assures uninterrupted heating teous service by trained driv-
all season long! You get: auto- ern ••• clean-burning Mobil-
'matic deliverybased on your heat with more.h.eat units than
linclividualneeds in r~1ationto ever before!

ORDER YOUR OlL OR COAL TODAY AT DETROIT MARKET
PRICES AND ASK ABOUT OUR EASY BUDGET PAYMENT
PLAN.

c·. ·R.El Y:·&. :SONS.~?·~:;
. ~·COA;L&FlJEL:·cill:. :'(0.---':'

.•i~· ... D!~ih~~~:lor-id,;";i~~",:>;........: ..
316 ~orth. Cente. Street Phone Northville ]90, .

Notice of Public Hearing
ON

Proposed Amendment To The Zoning Ordinance
OF THE

Township of Novi
Novi, Michigan

NOT[CE [S HEREBY G[VEN that a public hearing on a proposed
amendment to the Zoning Ordinance of the Township of Novi on the
following proposed changes to the Zoning Map:

(a) To change that part of the N.W. 1/4 of the S. W. % of Section
25, lying north of. the intersection ,of the P.M.R.R. and Novi
Road, containing 3 acres of land, more or less, from an R-1-F
Classification to a C-2 Classification.

(b) To change that area lying north of Grand River Road, from
the M·l District line east of Meadowbrook Road to the Nand
S !fa line of the N.W. % of Section 23, to a line 160 feet south
of and parallel to the center line of Eleven Mile Road from an
R-l-F and C-2 Classifir..ation to an M-1 ,Classification,

wilt be held at 8:00 o'clock P.M. Eastern Standard Time at the Town·
ship Hall located at 28580 Novi Road, October 24,1955.

NOT[CE IS FURTHER G[VEN that a copy of the Tentative Map
may be examined at the Township Hall during the office hours each day
Monday through Saturday, until the date of the public hearing.

NOVI TOWNSHIP ZON1NG BOARD

George Lien, Secretary
18 and 21

Commandant, Ninth Naval Dis-
trict, Great Lakes, Ill.

Cpt William Schoultz, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Schoulti of
Cady St. was cited by the Prince
of BelgIUm ior meritorius serVIce.

TWENTY YEARS AGO _

Craftsman's Guild
Offers $90,000 In
Car Competition

KARL, the Tailor
TAILOR BY TRADE
LADIES' & MEN'S SUITS

MADE TO ORDER
All Kinds of Alterations
19140 Farmington Road

at Seven Mile Rd.
GReenleaf 4·3352

Students leaving for the Uni-
versity of Michigan are Wilma
Rattenbury, Dorothy Richardson,
Mary Louise Boyden, Warner Eight university scholarships
Neal, Robert Cousins and Robert worth $20,000and another $70,000
Powers. Leaving for MIchigan in cash and U:S. Savings bonds
Siate Normal at Yosilanti are are the stakes In the 1956 FIsher
Bernice Clark, Marion Turnbull, .Body Cra~~ma~'s Guild model
Tom Carrington, Eddie Bender, car competition, It was.announced
Gertrude Deal and Orville Barnes. today by Jame~ P. Wmes, secre-

Mrs. H. R. Richardson is chair- tary of the Gurld.
man of the coming Hal"Vest Fes- In addition to individual awards
tival 'at the Presbyterian church to successful young model car
with Mrs. F. H. Hedge as her buDders, the Guild awards per-
"right-hand man". manent trophies to the schools

Mrs. George Alexander apd attended by fIrst state, regional
Mrs. Wllliam Forney have been and' national winners.
chosen as delegates to the annual Since 1930, the Fisher Body
state convention of the King's competition 'has awarded 140 uni-
Daughters. / versity scholarships' valued at

Betty Barry, 13.year-old North- $44!1,500to national winners. More
ville girl, daughter of Mr. and than $700,000 in cash and other
Mrs. Garrett Barry, won a bi- awards have been made to tho us-
cyde in a Kroger store contest. ands of boys winning state and

regional honors. --
The 19156competition offers the

young car designers the opportu-
nity to build sports cars, hard-
tops, convertibles or station wa-
gons as well as two': or four-door
sedans. I

The Fisher Body model car
competition has become national- 1-------------
ly famous as one of industry's 1.--------------,
most successfU'1 t1l1"E!Utsources. A
survey of former winners reveal-
ed that the same' dreams that
help a boy design and, build an
award-winning model car helped
most of them to become pnze-
winning adults, too.

In addition to the many who
become industrial and automotive
designers, the survey found doc-
tors, lawyers, bankers, architects,

16tf

Walled Lake Man
Succumbs At 72 Phillips-

Bahnmiller

FORTY YEARS AGO -

Leslie J. VanBuren, 1231 E.
Lake Dr., Walled Lake, dIed on
Sept. 18 in Pontiac General hos-
pital after an illness of four days,
He was born Aug. 8, 1883 in High-
land, Mich. and was 72 years of
.age.

Funeral services were held at
the Richardson-'Bird funeral home
in Milford Sept. 21 with the Rev.
Robert Worgess of the Milford
Methodist church officiating. Bur-
ial was in Highland cemetery,
Highland, Mich. I

He is survived by his wife, Ed-[
na E. and five chIldren: Russell
J. of Highland, Roy L. of Ply-
mouth, Mrs. Ada W. Mathews of

(04 Wed MalD SUM!

Funeral Home.

Ambulance Phone 48

New Office Hours
-Northville Record
Mon. - Thurs. 8 to 5

Friday. 8 to 7
Closed Saturdays

FORREST _[I. PHILLIPS
First Baptist Church

NORTHVILLE

Bible School ..•.•... Hi a.m.
Morning Worship ..... 11 a.m.
Evening Worship ...• 1:3D p.m.

CHARLES BAHNlIULLER

I
I.

Regardless of Profit-
We're Ouf to Make September
fhe Sellingest MontI. in History
Come In and Save-Save-~

-because we're celebrating
~~ the biggest sales in

Buick'~ S2 years'

,.

STEPright this way, ladies and gentleplen, to the most
. colossal selling event in motorcar llistory-our one

ana only Buick Sales Circus.

Come in and see the world's most thrilling performers
-the only cars with the switch-pitch magic of Variable
Pitch Dynaflow." Pick the beauty you want-then you
take the wrup, and make us perform-on the trade-in
yo~ w~nt and .the te:ms you want. Your spanking-new
BUIck IS practically In your garage right nowl

'\-Ve'renot fooIin'-!~e meall busi/;ess. But hUll)', hmry,
hurry, because they Ie going. gOing, gOing.
"'Variable PItch DynaJlow ;$ the only D!Jllaflow Buick builds
today. It is standard on Roadmaster, optional at modest e~lra cost
on otller Scoles.

SEe JACKIE GLEASON
ON TV

Every Saturday Evening

COMB AND liT 'Brt-THE WORLD'S
MOST TDRILLING PERFDRMERS Buick's Super-Spacious SUPER

(Where you ,it in the lap or luxury and love ill)
J 955 Buick SUPER,
2.Door,6.Passenger
Convertible, Model56C,
236 hp, 127-in, wheelbase.

~ '* "*, ; '" 'fiJlIiB'lfeaf ~ ''BM:.t...: ' ,~ " ' '

,t~~~~~"''''~i ..li~\
_~" ,"v'" """,~,t~ *~'* Burry • Hurry • Burry

to aur Buick Sales Circus *
~

,......

Buick's Big/Beautiful and Low-Price SPEC/A'
(Look,4 doors ~ no cenler posl,-Ihe pioneer 014 door hardtop,l)

1955 Buick SPECIAL, 4-000r, 6-Passenger Riviera,
Model 43/ 188 hp, 122·;n. wheelbose.

Buick's Peerless Performance Car,
the CENTURY

(Wilh Bulek's highe" powor'lo-we;gnt rotial)

1955 Buick CENTURY,4·0oor, 6.Passenger &-....:' _""'::;

Riviera, Model 63, 236 hp, 122·/n. wheelbase.

JACK SELLES BUICK
200 Ann Arbor Rd. ( PLYMOUTH, MICH.

, 't

)'1 ,-(" r ...."ri-K" ~':'~l' !~L--,l~t.~i.f4\'..~;:-.'''''~...:II • ,..~~t: .1, ~ " I ~ '.,
t \ 1,. , ; " .."" ............


